



Hazen and Sawyer
 999 Ponce De Leon Boulevard, Suite 1150
 Coral Gables, FL • 305.443.4001

December 17, 2015

Jorge E. Acevedo, PE, LEED Green Associate
 Utility Director
 Citi of Coral Gables
 Department of Public Works
 2800 SW 72nd Avenue
 Miami, Florida 33155

Re: City of Coral Gables Citywide Infiltration and Inflow Abatement - Bid Recommendation

Dear Mr. Acevedo:

Bids for the City-wide Inflow and Infiltration Abatement (IFB 2015.10.07) project were received and opened on December 10, 2015 at 2:00 P.M. Nine prospective contractors submitted bids. The bidders and the amounts bid are noted below:

Bidder's Name (*)		Bid Amount Group A (Point Repairs, Lateral Lining, Sectional Lining)	Bid Amount Group B (Manhole Repairs)	Bid Amount Group C (Mainline Lining)
1.	Miller Pipeline, LLC	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,414,230.00
2.	Lanzo Trenchless Technologies	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,842,268.00
3.	Insituform Technologies, LLC	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,206,082.00
4.	V-Engineering and Consulting Corp.	No Bid	\$601,699.00	No Bid
5.	Ric-Man Construction Florida	\$934,946.00	\$331,255.00	\$1,701,330.00
6.	TV Diversified, Inc.	No Bid	\$330,647.00	No Bid
7.	Envirowaste Service Group, Inc.	\$776,462.00	\$238,558.00	\$1,699,223.00
8.	Hinterland Group, Inc.	\$872,860.00	\$361,415.00	\$1,223,450.00
9.	LMK Pipe Renewal	\$857,285.00	No Bid	No Bid

Hazen and Sawyer has reviewed the bids received for the above referenced project. Based on the information provided by the bidders and our findings, the lowest responsive bidder for both Groups A and B is Envirowaste Services Group, Inc. The lowest responsive bidder for Group C is Insituform Technologies, LLC.

Hazen and Sawyer has contacted references provided within the Envirowaste and Insituform documents. Each reference contacted provided a positive statement on work performance. Additionally, valid General Contracting licenses were verified as summarized below.

4105/03/1011

- Envirowaste State of Florida General Contracting License CGC 1507453, expiration date 08/31/16.
- Insituform State of Florida General Contracting License CGC 1510306, expiration date 08/31/16.

Envirowaste and Insituform have been in business for 17 years and 44 years respectively, and have the necessary experience to complete the required infiltration and inflow abatement work specified within the contract documents. At this time, we would suggest that Envirowaste be requested to provide the applicable submittals required "prior to contract award", as noted in Section 02753 1.02 C pertaining to manhole rehabilitation and Section 02770 1.04 A pertaining to lateral lining. No submittals are required from Insituform prior to contract award.

Pending concurrence of the Public Works Department, and City verification that all required insurances and bonds are valid and in place, Hazen and Sawyer recommends that the bid submitted by Insituform Technologies, LLC be accepted and a contract awarded. The same recommendation is made for Envirowaste pending concurrence of the Public Works Department, City verification that all required insurances and bonds are valid and in place, and approval of the referenced submittals. The applicable Groups and amounts are summarized below.

Bidder's Name	Bid Amount Group A	Bid Amount Group B	Bid Amount Group C
Insituform Technologies, LLC	-	-	\$1,206,082.00
Envirowaste Service Group, Inc.	\$776,462.00	\$238,558.00	-

Should you have any questions, please do not hesitate to call.

Very truly yours,



Christopher L. Kish, PE
Senior Associate

- c. J. Page(H&S)
F. Chiriboga (H&S)
E. Heijn (H&S)
File 41057-037