
ITEM 
NO. PAY ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

1 104-10-3 SEDIMENT BARRIER (SILT FENCE) 400.00 LF 6.15 $2,460.00 2.00 $800.00 10.00 $4,000.00 7.00 $2,800.00 5.00 $2,000.00 5.00 $2,000.00 3.00 $1,200.00 2.00 $800.00 3.20 $1,280.00 3.00 $1,200.00 
2 110-1-1 CLEARING AND GRUBBING 40,000.00 SF 1.23 $49,200.00 6.00 $240,000.00 1.00 $40,000.00 1.00 $40,000.00 0.90 $36,000.00 0.90 $36,000.00 0.50 $20,000.00 0.50 $20,000.00 0.17 $6,800.00 0.25 $10,000.00 
3 110-4 REMOVAL OF EXISTING CONCRETE 400.00 SF 6.15 $2,460.00 1.00 $400.00 5.00 $2,000.00 5.00 $2,000.00 20.00 $8,000.00 15.00 $6,000.00 1.00 $400.00 2.50 $1,000.00 1.97 $788.00 5.00 $2,000.00 
4 110-22 TREE ROOT AND BRANCH PRUNING 240.00 LF 123.00 $29,520.00 100.00 $24,000.00 30.00 $7,200.00 30.00 $7,200.00 25.00 $6,000.00 25.00 $6,000.00 10.00 $2,400.00 35.00 $8,400.00 9.40 $2,256.00 8.00 $1,920.00 
5 110-23-2 TREE REMOVAL, >=4.5" to <=12" DIAMETER AT BREAST HEIGHT 40.00 EA 1,168.50 $46,740.00 400.00 $16,000.00 1,250.00 $50,000.00 1,250.00 $50,000.00 500.00 $20,000.00 500.00 $20,000.00 600.00 $24,000.00 300.00 $12,000.00 760.00 $30,400.00 150.00 $6,000.00 
6 120-1 REGULAR EXCAVATION 1,600.00 CY 61.50 $98,400.00 20.00 $32,000.00 12.00 $19,200.00 12.00 $19,200.00 10.00 $16,000.00 10.00 $16,000.00 7.00 $11,200.00 12.00 $19,200.00 11.28 $18,048.00 6.00 $9,600.00 
7 121-70 FLOWABLE FILL 120.00 CY 123.00 $14,760.00 220.00 $26,400.00 142.06 $17,047.20 142.06 $17,047.20 150.00 $18,000.00 150.00 $18,000.00 150.00 $18,000.00 250.00 $30,000.00 66.00 $7,920.00 150.00 $18,000.00 
8 161-1 STANDARD SWALE RESTORATION 125,000.00 CY 2.86 $357,500.00 1.00 $125,000.00 1.30 $162,500.00 1.30 $162,500.00 0.45 $56,250.00 0.45 $56,250.00 1.00 $125,000.00 1.00 $125,000.00 0.88 $110,000.00 1.00 $125,000.00 
9 161-3 ROCK DRAIN SWALE TRENCH, INSTALL 1,200.00 SF 3.69 $4,428.00 40.00 $48,000.00 3.67 $4,404.00 3.67 $4,404.00 10.00 $12,000.00 10.00 $12,000.00 30.00 $36,000.00 5.00 $6,000.00 5.55 $6,660.00 10.00 $12,000.00 

10 161-4 TRASH PIT RESTORATION 100.00 CY 307.50 $30,750.00 10.00 $1,000.00 75.00 $7,500.00 75.00 $7,500.00 45.00 $4,500.00 45.00 $4,500.00 15.00 $1,500.00 35.00 $3,500.00 48.00 $4,800.00 200.00 $20,000.00 
Group Total

11 210-1-9 REWORK LIMEROCK BASE, 3" 400.00 SY 12.30 $4,920.00 7.00 $2,800.00 11.90 $4,760.00 11.90 $4,760.00 6.00 $2,400.00 6.00 $2,400.00 5.00 $2,000.00 5.00 $2,000.00 4.05 $1,620.00 4.00 $1,600.00 
12 210-2-4 LIMEROCK, LBR 40, NEW MATERIAL FOR BASE, 4" 2,400.00 SY 14.76 $35,424.00 12.00 $28,800.00 11.48 $27,552.00 11.48 $27,552.00 10.00 $24,000.00 10.00 $24,000.00 14.00 $33,600.00 8.00 $19,200.00 5.40 $12,960.00 8.00 $19,200.00 
13 210-2-6 LIMEROCK, LBR 40, NEW MATERIAL FOR BASE, 6" 1,600.00 SY 19.68 $31,488.00 13.50 $21,600.00 13.29 $21,264.00 13.29 $21,264.00 11.00 $17,600.00 11.00 $17,600.00 16.00 $25,600.00 9.00 $14,400.00 8.44 $13,504.00 12.00 $19,200.00 
14 210-2-8 LIMEROCK, LBR 40, NEW MATERIAL FOR BASE, 8" 4,000.00 SY 22.14 $88,560.00 16.00 $64,000.00 16.07 $64,280.00 16.07 $64,280.00 23.00 $92,000.00 23.00 $92,000.00 18.00 $72,000.00 10.00 $40,000.00 12.15 $48,600.00 16.00 $64,000.00 
15 210-2-12 LIMEROCK, LBR 40, NEW MATERIAL FOR BASE. 12" 120.00 SY 24.60 $2,952.00 20.00 $2,400.00 23.98 $2,877.60 23.98 $2,877.60 14.00 $1,680.00 14.00 $1,680.00 24.00 $2,880.00 11.00 $1,320.00 12.15 $1,458.00 24.00 $2,880.00 
16 210-3-12 CU STRUCTURAL SOIL, NEW MATERIAL FOR BASE, 12" 800.00 SY 24.60 $19,680.00 53.00 $42,400.00 38.52 $30,816.00 38.52 $30,816.00 47.00 $37,600.00 47.00 $37,600.00 20.00 $16,000.00 9.00 $7,200.00 5.40 $4,320.00 33.00 $26,400.00 
17 210-3-18 CU STRUCTURAL SOIL, NEW MATERIAL FOR BASE, 18" 800.00 SY 31.98 $25,584.00 79.00 $63,200.00 57.35 $45,880.00 57.35 $45,880.00 63.00 $50,400.00 63.00 $50,400.00 25.00 $20,000.00 11.00 $8,800.00 6.08 $4,864.00 50.00 $40,000.00 
18 210-3-24 CU STRUCTURAL SOIL, NEW MATERIAL FOR BASE, 24" 800.00 SY 39.36 $31,488.00 105.50 $84,400.00 76.19 $60,952.00 76.19 $60,952.00 79.00 $63,200.00 79.00 $63,200.00 30.00 $24,000.00 13.00 $10,400.00 6.75 $5,400.00 66.00 $52,800.00 
19 210-3-36 CU STRUCTURAL SOIL, NEW MATERIAL FOR BASE, 36" 160.00 SY 49.20 $7,872.00 160.00 $25,600.00 110.81 $17,729.60 110.81 $17,729.60 110.00 $17,600.00 110.00 $17,600.00 40.00 $6,400.00 15.00 $2,400.00 No Bid 100.00 $16,000.00 
20 210-4-4 #57 ROCK, NEW MATERIAL FOR BASE, 4" 800.00 SY 9.84 $7,872.00 6.00 $4,800.00 8.62 $6,896.00 8.62 $6,896.00 4.50 $3,600.00 4.50 $3,600.00 14.00 $11,200.00 12.00 $9,600.00 9.79 $7,832.00 6.00 $4,800.00 
21 210-4-6 #57 ROCK, NEW MATERIAL FOR BASE, 6" 800.00 SY 12.30 $9,840.00 8.00 $6,400.00 12.91 $10,328.00 12.91 $10,328.00 6.00 $4,800.00 6.00 $4,800.00 16.00 $12,800.00 13.50 $10,800.00 10.53 $8,424.00 9.00 $7,200.00 
22 210-4-8 #57 ROCK, NEW MATERIAL FOR BASE, 8" 800.00 SY 14.76 $11,808.00 10.00 $8,000.00 17.21 $13,768.00 17.21 $13,768.00 9.00 $7,200.00 9.00 $7,200.00 18.00 $14,400.00 15.00 $12,000.00 13.50 $10,800.00 11.00 $8,800.00 
23 327-70-1 MILLING EXIST ASPH PAVT, 1" AVG DEPTH 120,000.00 SY 4.52 $542,400.00 2.50 $300,000.00 3.00 $360,000.00 3.00 $360,000.00 0.15 $18,000.00 0.15 $18,000.00 2.00 $240,000.00 5.00 $600,000.00 24.30 $2,916,000.00 0.25 $30,000.00 
24 327-70-5 MILLING EXIST ASPH PAVT, 2" AVG DEPTH 80,000.00 SY 8.63 $690,400.00 3.00 $240,000.00 4.00 $320,000.00 4.00 $320,000.00 0.20 $16,000.00 0.20 $16,000.00 2.20 $176,000.00 7.00 $560,000.00 29.70 $2,376,000.00 0.50 $40,000.00 
25 327-70-47 MILLING EXIST ASPH PAVT, ADDITIONAL 1" AVG DEPTH 80,000.00 SY 3.69 $295,200.00 1.00 $80,000.00 1.00 $80,000.00 1.00 $80,000.00 0.15 $12,000.00 0.15 $12,000.00 0.20 $16,000.00 2.00 $160,000.00 32.40 $2,592,000.00 0.25 $20,000.00 
26 334-1-10 ASPHALT LEVELING COURSE 800.00 TN 184.50 $147,600.00 110.00 $88,000.00 160.00 $128,000.00 160.00 $128,000.00 200.00 $160,000.00 200.00 $160,000.00 130.00 $104,000.00 180.00 $144,000.00 438.75 $351,000.00 200.00 $160,000.00 
27 334-1-12 SUPERPAVE ASPHALTIC CONC, TRAFFIC B, SP 9.5 1,200.00 TN 196.80 $236,160.00 145.00 $174,000.00 160.00 $192,000.00 160.00 $192,000.00 200.00 $240,000.00 200.00 $240,000.00 120.00 $144,000.00 160.00 $192,000.00 472.50 $567,000.00 200.00 $240,000.00 
28 339-1 MISCELLANEOUS ASPHALT PAVEMENT 80.00 TN 196.80 $15,744.00 250.00 $20,000.00 200.00 $16,000.00 200.00 $16,000.00 200.00 $16,000.00 200.00 $16,000.00 130.00 $10,400.00 180.00 $14,400.00 405.00 $32,400.00 200.00 $16,000.00 
29 339-1-1 POROUS AGGREGATE PAVEMENT, 4"-6" AVG DEPTH 5,600.00 SY 23.37 $130,872.00 25.00 $140,000.00 10.40 $58,240.00 10.40 $58,240.00 6.00 $33,600.00 6.00 $33,600.00 90.00 $504,000.00 90.00 $504,000.00 No Bid 75.00 $420,000.00 

30 400-11-1 STANDARD CONC PAVER BAND, CORAL GABLES BEIGE, 5000 PSI, 12" X 12" 7,000.00 LF 36.90 $258,300.00 30.00 $210,000.00 21.23 $148,610.00 21.23 $148,610.00 49.00 $343,000.00 49.00 $343,000.00 30.00 $210,000.00 15.00 $105,000.00 No Bid 20.00 $140,000.00 
31 400-11-2 STANDARD CONC PAVER BAND, CORAL GABLES BEIGE, 5000 PSI, 24" X 10" 7,000.00 LF 39.36 $275,520.00 35.00 $245,000.00 27.61 $193,270.00 27.61 $193,270.00 56.00 $392,000.00 56.00 $392,000.00 34.00 $238,000.00 30.00 $210,000.00 No Bid 30.00 $210,000.00 
32 400-11-3 STANDARD 10" CONC PAVER BAND, CORAL GABLES BEIGE, 5000 PSI, VARIABLE WIDTH 3,000.00 LF 61.50 $184,500.00 25.00 $75,000.00 150.00 $450,000.00 150.00 $450,000.00 80.00 $240,000.00 80.00 $240,000.00 180.00 $540,000.00 40.00 $120,000.00 No Bid 350.00 $1,050,000.00 
33 400-11-4 MODIFIED CONC PAVER BAND, CORAL GABLES BEIGE, 5000 PSI, 12" X 12" 7,000.00 LF 30.75 $215,250.00 25.00 $175,000.00 21.20 $148,400.00 21.20 $148,400.00 50.00 $350,000.00 50.00 $350,000.00 30.00 $210,000.00 18.00 $126,000.00 No Bid 20.00 $140,000.00 
34 400-11-5 MODIFIED CONC PAVER BAND #2, CORAL GABLES BEIGE, 5000 PSI, 24" X 12" 7,000.00 LF 39.36 $275,520.00 30.00 $210,000.00 27.77 $194,390.00 27.77 $194,390.00 57.00 $399,000.00 57.00 $399,000.00 35.00 $245,000.00 36.00 $252,000.00 No Bid 20.00 $140,000.00 
35 400-12-1 REINFORCED CONC SLAB, CORAL GABLES BEIGE, 5000 PSI, 6" THICK 8,000.00 LF 19.68 $157,440.00 12.50 $100,000.00 7.67 $61,360.00 7.67 $61,360.00 10.00 $80,000.00 10.00 $80,000.00 9.00 $72,000.00 8.00 $64,000.00 13.16 $105,280.00 10.00 $80,000.00 
36 400-12-2 REINFORCED CONC SLAB, CORAL GABLES BEIGE, 5000 PSI, 12" THICK 8,000.00 LF 39.36 $314,880.00 24.50 $196,000.00 10.86 $86,880.00 10.86 $86,880.00 20.00 $160,000.00 20.00 $160,000.00 12.00 $96,000.00 15.00 $120,000.00 16.20 $129,600.00 20.00 $160,000.00 
37 425-1-1 DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, D-1 5.00 LF 6,150.00 $30,750.00 4,000.00 $20,000.00 3,000.00 $15,000.00 3,000.00 $15,000.00 1,800.00 $9,000.00 1,800.00 $9,000.00 3,000.00 $15,000.00 5,000.00 $25,000.00 4,320.00 $21,600.00 3,100.00 $15,500.00 
38 425-1-2 DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, D-3 5.00 LF 6,150.00 $30,750.00 4,000.00 $20,000.00 3,200.00 $16,000.00 3,200.00 $16,000.00 2,100.00 $10,500.00 2,100.00 $10,500.00 3,000.00 $15,000.00 5,000.00 $25,000.00 4,320.00 $21,600.00 3,500.00 $17,500.00 
39 425-1-3 DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, D-4 10.00 LF 6,150.00 $61,500.00 5,000.00 $50,000.00 3,729.71 $37,297.10 3,729.71 $37,297.10 3,300.00 $33,000.00 3,300.00 $33,000.00 5,000.00 $50,000.00 5,000.00 $50,000.00 4,725.00 $47,250.00 4,200.00 $42,000.00 
40 425-1-4 DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, D-5 5.00 LF 6,150.00 $30,750.00 5,000.00 $25,000.00 5,165.99 $25,829.95 5,165.99 $25,829.95 4,250.00 $21,250.00 4,250.00 $21,250.00 5,500.00 $27,500.00 5,000.00 $25,000.00 4,725.00 $23,625.00 5,000.00 $25,000.00 
41 425-1-5 DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, D-6 5.00 LF 6,150.00 $30,750.00 5,750.00 $28,750.00 6,340.38 $31,701.90 6,340.38 $31,701.90 6,800.00 $34,000.00 6,800.00 $34,000.00 6,000.00 $30,000.00 5,000.00 $25,000.00 4,725.00 $23,625.00 6,000.00 $30,000.00 
42 425-1-6 DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, D-42 5.00 LF 6,150.00 $30,750.00 4,500.00 $22,500.00 3,492.23 $17,461.15 3,492.23 $17,461.15 2,500.00 $12,500.00 2,500.00 $12,500.00 4,000.00 $20,000.00 5,000.00 $25,000.00 5,400.00 $27,000.00 3,700.00 $18,500.00 
43 425-1-7 DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, F-3 5.00 LF 6,150.00 $30,750.00 4,700.00 $23,500.00 4,526.36 $22,631.80 4,526.36 $22,631.80 2,300.00 $11,500.00 2,300.00 $11,500.00 4,000.00 $20,000.00 6,000.00 $30,000.00 15,390.00 $76,950.00 4,000.00 $20,000.00 
44 425-1-8 DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, OFFSET STRUCTURE 5.00 LF 6,150.00 $30,750.00 5,000.00 $25,000.00 7,009.47 $35,047.35 7,009.47 $35,047.35 7,600.00 $38,000.00 7,600.00 $38,000.00 4,000.00 $20,000.00 5,000.00 $25,000.00 15,390.00 $76,950.00 6,500.00 $32,500.00 
45 425-4-1 CONSTRUCT ASPHALT APRON 5.00 LF 615.00 $3,075.00 20.00 $100.00 50.00 $250.00 50.00 $250.00 500.00 $2,500.00 150.00 $750.00 10.00 $50.00 2,500.00 $12,500.00 No Bid 25.00 $125.00 
46 425-5 ADJUST MANHOLES, RISER RINGS 10.00 LF 3,075.00 $30,750.00 1,500.00 $15,000.00 506.90 $5,069.00 400.00 $4,000.00 185.00 $1,850.00 185.00 $1,850.00 150.00 $1,500.00 1,000.00 $10,000.00 1,350.00 $13,500.00 300.00 $3,000.00 
47 425-5-2 ADJUST INLET/ MANHOLES,BRICKS & MORTAR 10.00 LF 3,075.00 $30,750.00 750.00 $7,500.00 736.60 $7,366.00 600.00 $6,000.00 185.00 $1,850.00 185.00 $1,850.00 500.00 $5,000.00 2,500.00 $25,000.00 742.50 $7,425.00 400.00 $4,000.00 
48 425-6 ADJUST VALVE BOX 10.00 LF 984.00 $9,840.00 400.00 $4,000.00 338.43 $3,384.30 300.00 $3,000.00 150.00 $1,500.00 150.00 $1,500.00 150.00 $1,500.00 700.00 $7,000.00 540.00 $5,400.00 400.00 $4,000.00 
49 425-7-1 REMOVE INLETS AND MANHOLES RING & COVER / FRAME & GRATE 5.00 LF 1,845.00 $9,225.00 350.00 $1,750.00 994.25 $4,971.25 994.25 $4,971.25 200.00 $1,000.00 200.00 $1,000.00 500.00 $2,500.00 3,500.00 $17,500.00 607.50 $3,037.50 650.00 $3,250.00 
50 425-8 ADJUST MISCELLANEOUS STRUCTURES 5.00 LF 3,075.00 $15,375.00 750.00 $3,750.00 1,519.37 $7,596.85 1,500.00 $7,500.00 500.00 $2,500.00 500.00 $2,500.00 500.00 $2,500.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 607.50 $3,037.50 850.00 $4,250.00 
51 425-8-36 FURNISH & INSTALL 42" CONCRETE RISER IN 1' INCREMENTS 5.00 LF 738.00 $3,690.00 1,500.00 $7,500.00 1,719.94 $8,599.70 1,446.74 $7,233.70 400.00 $2,000.00 400.00 $2,000.00 500.00 $2,500.00 1,500.00 $7,500.00 1,620.00 $8,100.00 650.00 $3,250.00 
52 425-11-1 SAWCUT, CORE DRILL, AND MODIFY EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE 10.00 LF 2,460.00 $24,600.00 1,000.00 $10,000.00 528.50 $5,285.00 528.50 $5,285.00 1,000.00 $10,000.00 1,000.00 $10,000.00 600.00 $6,000.00 3,000.00 $30,000.00 2,025.00 $20,250.00 1,500.00 $15,000.00 
53 425-11-2 NEW CONNECTION TO SLAB COVERED DITCH 5.00 LF 3,075.00 $15,375.00 750.00 $3,750.00 1,667.34 $8,336.70 1,667.34 $8,336.70 1,500.00 $7,500.00 1,500.00 $7,500.00 2,000.00 $10,000.00 3,500.00 $17,500.00 4,725.00 $23,625.00 4,500.00 $22,500.00 
54 425-11-3 AUGER HOLE ABANDONMENT 5.00 LF 615.00 $3,075.00 2,250.00 $11,250.00 636.39 $3,181.95 636.39 $3,181.95 3,000.00 $15,000.00 2,850.00 $14,250.00 500.00 $2,500.00 2,000.00 $10,000.00 No Bid 850.00 $4,250.00 
55 425-14-101 GRATE FOR EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, F&I, USF 285-5640 (OR APPROVED EQUAL) 5.00 LF 738.00 $3,690.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 975.09 $4,875.45 710.93 $3,554.65 900.00 $4,500.00 900.00 $4,500.00 600.00 $3,000.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 371.25 $1,856.25 1,000.00 $5,000.00 
56 425-14-102 GRATE FOR EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, F&I, USF 285-EX (OR APPROVED EQUAL) 5.00 LF 861.00 $4,305.00 750.00 $3,750.00 1,163.07 $5,815.35 734.16 $3,670.80 925.00 $4,625.00 925.00 $4,625.00 600.00 $3,000.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 371.25 $1,856.25 1,000.00 $5,000.00 
57 425-14-103 GRATE FOR EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, F&I, USF 420-EX (OR APPROVED EQUAL) 5.00 LF 861.00 $4,305.00 700.00 $3,500.00 762.46 $3,812.30 762.46 $3,812.30 705.00 $3,525.00 705.00 $3,525.00 600.00 $3,000.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 371.25 $1,856.25 750.00 $3,750.00 
58 425-14-104 GRATE FOR EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, F&I, USF 4160-6213 (OR APPROVED EQUAL) 5.00 LF 615.00 $3,075.00 750.00 $3,750.00 847.89 $4,239.45 781.78 $3,908.90 685.00 $3,425.00 685.00 $3,425.00 600.00 $3,000.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 371.25 $1,856.25 750.00 $3,750.00 
59 425-14-105 GRATE FOR EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, F&I, USF 4105-6224 (OR APPROVED EQUAL) 5.00 LF 615.00 $3,075.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 798.42 $3,992.10 798.42 $3,992.10 650.00 $3,250.00 650.00 $3,250.00 600.00 $3,000.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 371.25 $1,856.25 750.00 $3,750.00 
60 425-14-106 GRATE FOR EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, F&I, USF 4700-6223 (OR APPROVED EQUAL) 5.00 LF 615.00 $3,075.00 750.00 $3,750.00 842.23 $4,211.15 801.54 $4,007.70 690.00 $3,450.00 690.00 $3,450.00 600.00 $3,000.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 371.25 $1,856.25 750.00 $3,750.00 
61 425-14-107 GRATE FOR EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, F&I, USF 5115-6220 (OR APPROVED EQUAL) 5.00 LF 615.00 $3,075.00 1,200.00 $6,000.00 1,297.34 $6,486.70 1,289.66 $6,448.30 1,025.00 $5,125.00 1,025.00 $5,125.00 600.00 $3,000.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 371.25 $1,856.25 1,000.00 $5,000.00 
62 425-14-108 GRATE FOR EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, F&I, USF 5129-6176 (OR APPROVED EQUAL) 5.00 LF 615.00 $3,075.00 1,050.00 $5,250.00 1,228.09 $6,140.45 1,218.24 $6,091.20 970.00 $4,850.00 970.00 $4,850.00 600.00 $3,000.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 371.25 $1,856.25 1,000.00 $5,000.00 
63 425-14-110 GRATE FOR EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, F&I, USF 5105-6148 (OR APPROVED EQUAL) 5.00 LF 615.00 $3,075.00 700.00 $3,500.00 761.67 $3,808.35 737.26 $3,686.30 650.00 $3,250.00 650.00 $3,250.00 600.00 $3,000.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 371.25 $1,856.25 750.00 $3,750.00 
64 425-14-112 GRATE FOR EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, F&I, USF 5298-6298 (OR APPROVED EQUAL) 5.00 LF 615.00 $3,075.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 1,096.64 $5,483.20 1,082.69 $5,413.45 875.00 $4,375.00 875.00 $4,375.00 600.00 $3,000.00 1,000.00 $5,000.00 371.25 $1,856.25 850.00 $4,250.00 
65 425-14-114 VERTICAL GRATE HOOD RETROFIT 25.00 LF 922.50 $23,062.50 1,000.00 $25,000.00 951.81 $23,795.25 560.96 $14,024.00 900.00 $22,500.00 850.00 $21,250.00 500.00 $12,500.00 1,500.00 $37,500.00 No Bid 850.00 $21,250.00 
66 425-17-24 POLLUTION BAFFLE/SKIMMER, FOR PIPES  <= 24" 6.00 LF 615.00 $3,690.00 350.00 $2,100.00 458.01 $2,748.06 458.01 $2,748.06 500.00 $3,000.00 500.00 $3,000.00 600.00 $3,600.00 1,800.00 $10,800.00 742.50 $4,455.00 600.00 $3,600.00 
67 425-17-30 POLLUTION BAFFLE/SKIMMER, FOR PIPES >24"- 36" 5.00 LF 922.50 $4,612.50 850.00 $4,250.00 977.54 $4,887.70 977.54 $4,887.70 690.00 $3,450.00 690.00 $3,450.00 800.00 $4,000.00 2,500.00 $12,500.00 1,012.50 $5,062.50 800.00 $4,000.00 
68 425-74-1 EXISTING MANHOLES & INLETS CLEANING 25.00 LF 615.00 $15,375.00 180.00 $4,500.00 482.94 $12,073.50 482.94 $12,073.50 150.00 $3,750.00 150.00 $3,750.00 500.00 $12,500.00 800.00 $20,000.00 1,350.00 $33,750.00 300.00 $7,500.00 
69 430-17-112 NON-PERFORATED HDPE PIPE, ROUND, 12" 20.00 LF 110.70 $2,214.00 80.00 $1,600.00 45.71 $914.20 45.71 $914.20 65.00 $1,300.00 65.00 $1,300.00 90.00 $1,800.00 65.00 $1,300.00 54.00 $1,080.00 72.00 $1,440.00 
70 430-17-115 NON-PERFORATED HDPE PIPE, ROUND, 15" 160.00 LF 135.30 $21,648.00 80.00 $12,800.00 51.40 $8,224.00 51.40 $8,224.00 70.00 $11,200.00 70.00 $11,200.00 90.00 $14,400.00 70.00 $11,200.00 54.00 $8,640.00 74.00 $11,840.00 
71 430-17-118 NON-PERFORATED HDPE PIPE, ROUND, 18" 40.00 LF 159.90 $6,396.00 95.00 $3,800.00 65.05 $2,602.00 65.05 $2,602.00 74.00 $2,960.00 74.00 $2,960.00 100.00 $4,000.00 75.00 $3,000.00 67.50 $2,700.00 77.00 $3,080.00 
72 430-17-124 NON-PERFORATED HDPE PIPE, ROUND, 24" 40.00 LF 184.50 $7,380.00 105.00 $4,200.00 85.97 $3,438.80 85.97 $3,438.80 85.00 $3,400.00 85.00 $3,400.00 120.00 $4,800.00 85.00 $3,400.00 94.50 $3,780.00 87.00 $3,480.00 
73 430-830 PIPE GROUT FILLING AND PLUGGING- PLACE OUT OF SERVICE 25.00 LF 184.50 $4,612.50 250.00 $6,250.00 232.16 $5,804.00 232.16 $5,804.00 250.00 $6,250.00 250.00 $6,250.00 250.00 $6,250.00 250.00 $6,250.00 No Bid 200.00 $5,000.00 
74 430-835-1 PLUG EXISTING PIPE, <=24" 12.00 LF 615.00 $7,380.00 350.00 $4,200.00 404.01 $4,848.12 404.01 $4,848.12 250.00 $3,000.00 250.00 $3,000.00 500.00 $6,000.00 1,500.00 $18,000.00 1,080.00 $12,960.00 450.00 $5,400.00 
75 430-835-2 PLUG EXISTING PIPE, >24" 5.00 LF 615.00 $3,075.00 500.00 $2,500.00 731.66 $3,658.30 731.66 $3,658.30 300.00 $1,500.00 300.00 $1,500.00 800.00 $4,000.00 1,800.00 $9,000.00 1,080.00 $5,400.00 650.00 $3,250.00 
76 430-836-1 EXISTING DRAINAGE PIPE, REMOVE, <=18" 40.00 LF 24.60 $984.00 12.00 $480.00 10.00 $400.00 10.00 $400.00 25.00 $1,000.00 25.00 $1,000.00 10.00 $400.00 20.00 $800.00 20.25 $810.00 40.00 $1,600.00 
77 430-836-2 EXISTING DRAINAGE PIPE, REMOVE, 24"-36" 5.00 LF 49.20 $246.00 20.00 $100.00 20.00 $100.00 20.00 $100.00 30.00 $150.00 30.00 $150.00 20.00 $100.00 25.00 $125.00 20.25 $101.25 45.00 $225.00 
78 430-837-1 EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, REMOVE, <= 10' DEPTH 5.00 LF 1,845.00 $9,225.00 500.00 $2,500.00 547.17 $2,735.85 547.17 $2,735.85 500.00 $2,500.00 500.00 $2,500.00 500.00 $2,500.00 2,500.00 $12,500.00 540.00 $2,700.00 750.00 $3,750.00 
79 430-837-2 EXISTING DRAINAGE STRUCTURE, REMOVE, >10' DEPTH 5.00 EA 1,845.00 $9,225.00 700.00 $3,500.00 1,028.29 $5,141.45 1,028.29 $5,141.45 650.00 $3,250.00 650.00 $3,250.00 800.00 $4,000.00 3,000.00 $15,000.00 540.00 $2,700.00 1,250.00 $6,250.00 
80 443-70-2 FRENCH DRAIN WITH PERFORATED 15" HDPE PIPE 60.00 LF 209.10 $12,546.00 170.00 $10,200.00 162.45 $9,747.00 162.45 $9,747.00 130.00 $7,800.00 130.00 $7,800.00 120.00 $7,200.00 150.00 $9,000.00 No Bid 160.00 $9,600.00 
81 443-70-3 FRENCH DRAIN WITH PERFORATED 18" HDPE PIPE 240.00 LF 233.70 $56,088.00 185.00 $44,400.00 176.81 $42,434.40 176.81 $42,434.40 135.00 $32,400.00 135.00 $32,400.00 130.00 $31,200.00 180.00 $43,200.00 No Bid 170.00 $40,800.00 
82 443-70-4 FRENCH DRAIN WITH PERFORATED 24" HDPE PIPE 160.00 LF 258.30 $41,328.00 200.00 $32,000.00 200.38 $32,060.80 200.38 $32,060.80 145.00 $23,200.00 145.00 $23,200.00 160.00 $25,600.00 200.00 $32,000.00 No Bid 180.00 $28,800.00 

83 520-1-7 CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE E 80.00 LF 31.98 $2,558.40 20.00 $1,600.00 29.93 $2,394.40 29.93 $2,394.40 20.00 $1,600.00 20.00 $1,600.00 25.00 $2,000.00 25.00 $2,000.00 No Bid 21.00 $1,680.00 
84 520-1-7-1 CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE E, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 80.00 LF 34.44 $2,755.20 25.00 $2,000.00 37.87 $3,029.60 37.87 $3,029.60 25.00 $2,000.00 25.00 $2,000.00 27.00 $2,160.00 30.00 $2,400.00 No Bid 21.00 $1,680.00 
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85 520-1-7-2 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE E 80.00 LF 36.90 $2,952.00 24.00 $1,920.00 33.90 $2,712.00 33.90 $2,712.00 22.00 $1,760.00 22.00 $1,760.00 25.00 $2,000.00 30.00 $2,400.00 No Bid 27.00 $2,160.00 
86 520-1-7-3 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE E, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 80.00 LF 39.36 $3,148.80 28.00 $2,240.00 43.14 $3,451.20 43.14 $3,451.20 27.00 $2,160.00 27.00 $2,160.00 27.00 $2,160.00 35.00 $2,800.00 No Bid 34.00 $2,720.00 
87 520-1-10 CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE F 12,000.00 LF 42.77 $513,240.00 22.00 $264,000.00 26.00 $312,000.00 $25.00 $300,000.00 10.00 $120,000.00 10.00 $120,000.00 20.00 $240,000.00 25.00 $300,000.00 No Bid 21.00 $252,000.00 
88 520-1-10-1 CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE F, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 800.00 LF 36.90 $29,520.00 25.00 $20,000.00 28.74 $22,992.00 28.74 $22,992.00 25.00 $20,000.00 25.00 $20,000.00 25.00 $20,000.00 30.00 $24,000.00 No Bid 28.00 $22,400.00 
89 520-1-10-2 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE F 400.00 LF 36.90 $14,760.00 23.00 $9,200.00 28.74 $11,496.00 28.74 $11,496.00 10.00 $4,000.00 10.00 $4,000.00 27.00 $10,800.00 35.00 $14,000.00 No Bid 28.00 $11,200.00 
90 520-1-10-3 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE F, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 400.00 LF 39.36 $15,744.00 30.00 $12,000.00 29.05 $11,620.00 29.05 $11,620.00 25.00 $10,000.00 25.00 $10,000.00 30.00 $12,000.00 40.00 $16,000.00 No Bid 34.00 $13,600.00 
91 520-1-12 CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE F WITH SPECIAL GUTTER PROFILE 80.00 LF 41.82 $3,345.60 25.00 $2,000.00 29.05 $2,324.00 29.05 $2,324.00 27.00 $2,160.00 27.00 $2,160.00 25.00 $2,000.00 35.00 $2,800.00 No Bid 26.00 $2,080.00 
92 520-1-12-1 CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE F WITH SPECIAL GUTTER PROFILE, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 80.00 LF 44.28 $3,542.40 30.00 $2,400.00 33.02 $2,641.60 33.02 $2,641.60 30.00 $2,400.00 30.00 $2,400.00 27.00 $2,160.00 40.00 $3,200.00 No Bid 34.00 $2,720.00 
93 520-1-12-2 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE F WITH SPECIAL GUTTER PROFILE 80.00 LF 46.74 $3,739.20 28.00 $2,240.00 33.90 $2,712.00 33.90 $2,712.00 29.00 $2,320.00 29.00 $2,320.00 30.00 $2,400.00 40.00 $3,200.00 No Bid 32.00 $2,560.00 
94 520-1-12-3 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB & GUTTER, TYPE F WITH SPECIAL GUTTER PROFILE, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 80.00 LF 49.20 $3,936.00 33.00 $2,640.00 35.66 $2,852.80 35.66 $2,852.80 32.00 $2,560.00 32.00 $2,560.00 32.00 $2,560.00 45.00 $3,600.00 No Bid 35.00 $2,800.00 
95 520-2-1 CONCRETE CURB, TYPE A 80.00 LF 31.98 $2,558.40 22.00 $1,760.00 20.69 $1,655.20 20.69 $1,655.20 20.00 $1,600.00 20.00 $1,600.00 25.00 $2,000.00 25.00 $2,000.00 No Bid 14.00 $1,120.00 
96 520-2-11 CONCRETE CURB, TYPE A, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 80.00 LF 34.44 $2,755.20 27.00 $2,160.00 24.65 $1,972.00 24.65 $1,972.00 25.00 $2,000.00 25.00 $2,000.00 27.00 $2,160.00 30.00 $2,400.00 No Bid 19.00 $1,520.00 
97 520-2-12 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB, TYPE A 400.00 LF 36.90 $14,760.00 25.00 $10,000.00 23.33 $9,332.00 23.33 $9,332.00 10.00 $4,000.00 10.00 $4,000.00 27.00 $10,800.00 30.00 $12,000.00 No Bid 20.00 $8,000.00 
98 520-2-13 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB, TYPE A, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 400.00 LF 39.36 $15,744.00 33.00 $13,200.00 29.93 $11,972.00 29.93 $11,972.00 28.00 $11,200.00 28.00 $11,200.00 30.00 $12,000.00 35.00 $14,000.00 No Bid 24.00 $9,600.00 
99 520-2-2 CONCRETE CURB, TYPE B 800.00 LF 25.83 $20,664.00 20.00 $16,000.00 15.84 $12,672.00 15.84 $12,672.00 10.00 $8,000.00 10.00 $8,000.00 25.00 $20,000.00 25.00 $20,000.00 29.70 $23,760.00 15.00 $12,000.00 

100 520-2-21 CONCRETE CURB, TYPE B, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 800.00 LF 28.29 $22,632.00 25.00 $20,000.00 19.81 $15,848.00 19.81 $15,848.00 20.00 $16,000.00 20.00 $16,000.00 27.00 $21,600.00 30.00 $24,000.00 40.50 $32,400.00 20.00 $16,000.00 
101 520-2-22 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB, TYPE B 800.00 LF 30.75 $24,600.00 23.00 $18,400.00 17.16 $13,728.00 17.16 $13,728.00 10.00 $8,000.00 10.00 $8,000.00 27.00 $21,600.00 30.00 $24,000.00 33.75 $27,000.00 26.00 $20,800.00 
102 520-2-23 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB, TYPE B, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 800.00 LF 33.21 $26,568.00 28.00 $22,400.00 23.77 $19,016.00 23.77 $19,016.00 22.00 $17,600.00 22.00 $17,600.00 30.00 $24,000.00 35.00 $28,000.00 40.50 $32,400.00 27.00 $21,600.00 
103 520-2-4-1 CONCRETE CURB, TYPE D, 6" X 18" 400.00 LF 25.83 $10,332.00 20.00 $8,000.00 17.00 $6,800.00 17.00 $6,800.00 15.00 $6,000.00 15.00 $6,000.00 25.00 $10,000.00 20.00 $8,000.00 27.00 $10,800.00 14.00 $5,600.00 
104 520-2-4-11 CONCRETE CURB, TYPE D, 6" X 18", CORAL GABLES BEIGE 1,600.00 LF 28.29 $45,264.00 23.00 $36,800.00 19.00 $30,400.00 19.00 $30,400.00 20.00 $32,000.00 20.00 $32,000.00 25.00 $40,000.00 25.00 $40,000.00 40.50 $64,800.00 19.00 $30,400.00 
105 520-2-4-12 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB, TYPE D, 6" X 18" 400.00 LF 30.75 $12,300.00 19.00 $7,600.00 21.00 $8,400.00 21.00 $8,400.00 15.00 $6,000.00 15.00 $6,000.00 27.00 $10,800.00 25.00 $10,000.00 33.75 $13,500.00 20.00 $8,000.00 
106 520-2-4-14 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB, TYPE D, 6" X 18", CORAL GABLES BEIGE 400.00 LF 33.21 $13,284.00 26.00 $10,400.00 24.00 $9,600.00 24.00 $9,600.00 22.00 $8,800.00 22.00 $8,800.00 30.00 $12,000.00 30.00 $12,000.00 40.50 $16,200.00 25.00 $10,000.00 
107 520-2-4-15 CONCRETE CURB, TYPE D, 6" X 12" 400.00 LF 22.14 $8,856.00 16.00 $6,400.00 16.00 $6,400.00 16.00 $6,400.00 15.00 $6,000.00 15.00 $6,000.00 25.00 $10,000.00 20.00 $8,000.00 33.75 $13,500.00 10.00 $4,000.00 
108 520-2-4-16 CONCRETE CURB, TYPE D, 6" X 12", CORAL GABLES BEIGE 400.00 LF 24.60 $9,840.00 20.00 $8,000.00 18.00 $7,200.00 18.00 $7,200.00 20.00 $8,000.00 20.00 $8,000.00 27.00 $10,800.00 25.00 $10,000.00 37.80 $15,120.00 13.00 $5,200.00 
109 520-2-4-17 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB, TYPE D, 6" X 12" 400.00 LF 27.06 $10,824.00 20.00 $8,000.00 20.00 $8,000.00 20.00 $8,000.00 15.00 $6,000.00 15.00 $6,000.00 27.00 $10,800.00 25.00 $10,000.00 33.75 $13,500.00 15.00 $6,000.00 
110 520-2-4-18 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB, TYPE D, 6" X 12", CORAL GABLES BEIGE 400.00 LF 29.52 $11,808.00 22.00 $8,800.00 22.00 $8,800.00 22.00 $8,800.00 22.00 $8,800.00 22.00 $8,800.00 30.00 $12,000.00 30.00 $12,000.00 27.00 $10,800.00 21.00 $8,400.00 
111 520-3 VALLEY GUTTER- CONCRETE 400.00 LF 34.44 $13,776.00 20.00 $8,000.00 25.00 $10,000.00 25.00 $10,000.00 10.00 $4,000.00 10.00 $4,000.00 22.00 $8,800.00 25.00 $10,000.00 32.40 $12,960.00 17.00 $6,800.00 
112 520-3-1 VALLEY GUTTER- CONCRETE, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 800.00 LF 36.90 $29,520.00 25.00 $20,000.00 29.05 $23,240.00 29.05 $23,240.00 25.00 $20,000.00 25.00 $20,000.00 25.00 $20,000.00 30.00 $24,000.00 40.50 $32,400.00 23.00 $18,400.00 
113 520-5 TRAFFIC SEPARATOR CONCRETE 500.00 LF 25.83 $12,915.00 60.00 $30,000.00 43.00 $21,500.00 43.00 $21,500.00 40.00 $20,000.00 40.00 $20,000.00 45.00 $22,500.00 50.00 $25,000.00 No Bid 60.00 $30,000.00 
114 522-1 CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK 1,600.00 SF 8.61 $13,776.00 5.00 $8,000.00 4.75 $7,600.00 4.75 $7,600.00 4.00 $6,400.00 4.00 $6,400.00 5.00 $8,000.00 5.00 $8,000.00 7.09 $11,344.00 5.00 $8,000.00 
115 522-1-1 CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK WITH FIBER MESH 400.00 SF 12.30 $4,920.00 5.50 $2,200.00 5.00 $2,000.00 5.00 $2,000.00 4.25 $1,700.00 4.25 $1,700.00 6.00 $2,400.00 5.00 $2,000.00 7.43 $2,972.00 6.00 $2,400.00 
116 522-1-2 CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK WITH WELDED WIRE MESH 400.00 SF 14.76 $5,904.00 6.00 $2,400.00 5.40 $2,160.00 5.40 $2,160.00 4.50 $1,800.00 4.50 $1,800.00 6.00 $2,400.00 6.00 $2,400.00 7.43 $2,972.00 6.00 $2,400.00 
117 522-1-3 CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK, ROCK SALT FINISH 5,000.00 SF 11.07 $55,350.00 8.00 $40,000.00 5.75 $28,750.00 5.75 $28,750.00 4.00 $20,000.00 4.00 $20,000.00 6.00 $30,000.00 6.00 $30,000.00 No Bid 6.00 $30,000.00 
118 522-1-4 CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK WITH FIBER MESH, ROCK SALT FINISH 1,000.00 SF 14.76 $14,760.00 8.50 $8,500.00 6.00 $6,000.00 6.00 $6,000.00 4.00 $4,000.00 4.00 $4,000.00 7.00 $7,000.00 6.00 $6,000.00 No Bid 7.00 $7,000.00 
119 522-1-5 CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK WITH WELDED WIRE MESH, ROCK SALT FINISH 1,000.00 SF 17.22 $17,220.00 9.00 $9,000.00 6.25 $6,250.00 6.25 $6,250.00 4.00 $4,000.00 4.00 $4,000.00 7.00 $7,000.00 7.00 $7,000.00 No Bid 8.00 $8,000.00 
120 522-1-6 CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 80,000.00 SF 12.32 $985,600.00 6.00 $480,000.00 4.75 $380,000.00 4.75 $380,000.00 4.50 $360,000.00 4.50 $360,000.00 6.00 $480,000.00 6.00 $480,000.00 9.45 $756,000.00 6.00 $480,000.00 
121 522-1-7 CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK WITH FIBER MESH, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 40,000.00 SF 17.26 $690,400.00 8.00 $320,000.00 4.75 $190,000.00 4.75 $190,000.00 4.75 $190,000.00 4.75 $190,000.00 6.00 $240,000.00 6.00 $240,000.00 9.72 $388,800.00 7.00 $280,000.00 
122 522-1-8 CONCRETE SIDEWALK, 4" THICK WITH WELDED WIRE MESH, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 40,000.00 SF 19.72 $788,800.00 8.00 $320,000.00 5.06 $202,400.00 5.06 $202,400.00 4.75 $190,000.00 4.75 $190,000.00 6.00 $240,000.00 7.00 $280,000.00 10.13 $405,200.00 8.00 $320,000.00 
123 522-2 CONCRETE SIDEWALK AND DRIVEWAYS, 6" THICK 6,400.00 SF 12.30 $78,720.00 5.00 $32,000.00 5.53 $35,392.00 5.53 $35,392.00 4.25 $27,200.00 4.25 $27,200.00 6.00 $38,400.00 7.00 $44,800.00 7.09 $45,376.00 6.00 $38,400.00 
124 522-2-1 CONCRETE SIDEWALK AND DRIVEWAYS, 6" THICK WITH FIBER MESH 2,400.00 SF 14.76 $35,424.00 7.00 $16,800.00 5.72 $13,728.00 5.72 $13,728.00 4.50 $10,800.00 4.50 $10,800.00 7.00 $16,800.00 7.00 $16,800.00 7.43 $17,832.00 7.00 $16,800.00 
125 522-2-2 CONCRETE SIDEWALK AND DRIVEWAYS, 6" THICK WITH WELDED WIRE MESH 2,400.00 SF 18.45 $44,280.00 7.00 $16,800.00 5.98 $14,352.00 5.98 $14,352.00 4.50 $10,800.00 4.50 $10,800.00 7.00 $16,800.00 8.00 $19,200.00 7.76 $18,624.00 7.00 $16,800.00 
126 522-2-3 CONCRETE SIDEWALK AND DRIVEWAYS, 6" THICK, ROCK SALT FINISH 3,000.00 SF 14.76 $44,280.00 8.00 $24,000.00 5.66 $16,980.00 5.66 $16,980.00 4.50 $13,500.00 4.50 $13,500.00 8.00 $24,000.00 8.00 $24,000.00 No Bid 6.00 $18,000.00 
127 522-2-4 CONCRETE SIDEWALK AND DRIVEWAYS, 6" THICK WITH FIBER MESH, ROCK SALT FINISH 9,000.00 SF 17.22 $154,980.00 8.00 $72,000.00 6.00 $54,000.00 6.00 $54,000.00 4.50 $40,500.00 4.50 $40,500.00 9.00 $81,000.00 8.00 $72,000.00 No Bid 7.00 $63,000.00 
128 522-2-5 CONCRETE SIDEWALK AND DRIVEWAYS, 6" THICK WITH WELDED WIRE MESH, ROCK SALT FINISH 9,000.00 SF 19.68 $177,120.00 9.00 $81,000.00 6.25 $56,250.00 6.25 $56,250.00 4.50 $40,500.00 4.50 $40,500.00 9.00 $81,000.00 9.00 $81,000.00 No Bid 8.00 $72,000.00 
129 522-2-6 CONCRETE SIDEWALK AND DRIVEWAYS, 6" THICK, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 3,200.00 SF 14.76 $47,232.00 9.00 $28,800.00 7.00 $22,400.00 7.00 $22,400.00 5.40 $17,280.00 5.40 $17,280.00 8.00 $25,600.00 8.00 $25,600.00 No Bid 9.50 $30,400.00 
130 522-2-7 CONCRETE SIDEWALK AND DRIVEWAYS, 6" THICK WITH FIBER MESH, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 6,400.00 SF 17.22 $110,208.00 9.00 $57,600.00 7.63 $48,832.00 7.63 $48,832.00 5.60 $35,840.00 5.60 $35,840.00 9.00 $57,600.00 8.00 $51,200.00 No Bid 10.50 $67,200.00 
131 522-2-8 CONCRETE SIDEWALK AND DRIVEWAYS, 6" THICK WITH WELDED WIRE MESH, CORAL GABLES BEIGE 6,400.00 SF 19.68 $125,952.00 10.00 $64,000.00 7.95 $50,880.00 7.95 $50,880.00 6.00 $38,400.00 6.00 $38,400.00 9.00 $57,600.00 9.00 $57,600.00 No Bid 11.50 $73,600.00 
132 526-1-1 PAVERS, CONCRETE, ROADWAY 30,000.00 SF 14.76 $442,800.00 4.00 $120,000.00 7.45 $223,500.00 7.45 $223,500.00 6.00 $180,000.00 6.00 $180,000.00 25.00 $750,000.00 12.00 $360,000.00 No Bid 11.00 $330,000.00 
133 526-1-2 RESET OR REPLACE EXISTING MUD SET ROADWAY PAVERS (PAVERS NOT INCLUDED) 1,320.00 SF 9.84 $12,988.80 3.00 $3,960.00 6.00 $7,920.00 6.00 $7,920.00 6.50 $8,580.00 6.50 $8,580.00 10.00 $13,200.00 5.00 $6,600.00 5.40 $7,128.00 8.00 $10,560.00 
134 526-1-3 RESTORE EXISTING DECORATIVE DRIVEWAY APPROACH 4,000.00 SF 14.76 $59,040.00 40.00 $160,000.00 8.00 $32,000.00 8.00 $32,000.00 8.00 $32,000.00 8.00 $32,000.00 12.00 $48,000.00 7.00 $28,000.00 5.40 $21,600.00 10.00 $40,000.00 
135 526-2-1 PAVERS, CONCRETE, SIDEWALK 4,000.00 SF 14.76 $59,040.00 4.00 $16,000.00 7.45 $29,800.00 7.45 $29,800.00 6.00 $24,000.00 6.00 $24,000.00 25.00 $100,000.00 12.00 $48,000.00 8.10 $32,400.00 15.00 $60,000.00 
136 526-2-2 RESET OR REPLACE EXISTING SIDEWALK PAVERS ON SAND (PAVERS NOT INCLUDED) 1,200.00 SF 14.76 $17,712.00 5.00 $6,000.00 5.00 $6,000.00 5.00 $6,000.00 6.00 $7,200.00 6.00 $7,200.00 10.00 $12,000.00 5.00 $6,000.00 5.40 $6,480.00 6.00 $7,200.00 
137 527-2 DETECTABLE WARNINGS 4,000.00 SF 30.75 $123,000.00 30.00 $120,000.00 18.40 $73,600.00 18.40 $73,600.00 20.00 $80,000.00 20.00 $80,000.00 30.00 $120,000.00 25.00 $100,000.00 16.20 $64,800.00 25.00 $100,000.00 
138 536-1-1 GUARDRAIL -ROADWAY 100.00 LF 36.90 $3,690.00 50.00 $5,000.00 45.00 $4,500.00 45.00 $4,500.00 40.00 $4,000.00 40.00 $4,000.00 20.00 $2,000.00 70.00 $7,000.00 175.50 $17,550.00 30.00 $3,000.00 
139 536-7 SPECIAL GUARDRAIL POST 50.00 EA 36.90 $1,845.00 350.00 $17,500.00 297.22 $14,861.00 297.22 $14,861.00 175.00 $8,750.00 175.00 $8,750.00 100.00 $5,000.00 200.00 $10,000.00 607.50 $30,375.00 150.00 $7,500.00 
140 536-73 GUARDRAIL REMOVAL 100.00 LF 24.60 $2,460.00 5.00 $500.00 6.60 $660.00 6.60 $660.00 5.00 $500.00 5.00 $500.00 10.00 $1,000.00 35.00 $3,500.00 13.50 $1,350.00 15.00 $1,500.00 
141 536-85-20 GUARDRAIL END TREATMENT- TRAILING ANCHORAGE 5.00 EA 177.12 $885.60 1,500.00 $7,500.00 1,651.19 $8,255.95 1,651.19 $8,255.95 3,500.00 $17,500.00 3,500.00 $17,500.00 1,500.00 $7,500.00 1,500.00 $7,500.00 16.20 $81.00 1,500.00 $7,500.00 
142 536-85-24 GUARDRAIL END TREATMENT- PARALLEL APPROACH TERMINAL 5.00 EA 177.12 $885.60 3,500.00 $17,500.00 3,718.48 $18,592.40 3,718.48 $18,592.40 3,500.00 $17,500.00 3,500.00 $17,500.00 2,500.00 $12,500.00 3,500.00 $17,500.00 810.00 $4,050.00 3,000.00 $15,000.00 
143 536-85-26 GUARDRAIL END TREATMENT- TYPE CRT 5.00 EA 177.12 $885.60 2,500.00 $12,500.00 4,266.66 $21,333.30 4,266.66 $21,333.30 3,000.00 $15,000.00 3,000.00 $15,000.00 1,800.00 $9,000.00 3,500.00 $17,500.00 No Bid 3,000.00 $15,000.00 
144 536-85-27 GUARDRAIL END TREATMENT- DOUBLE FACE APPROACH TERMINAL 5.00 EA 177.12 $885.60 12,500.00 $62,500.00 11,162.02 $55,810.10 11,162.02 $55,810.10 3,500.00 $17,500.00 3,500.00 $17,500.00 2,500.00 $12,500.00 12,500.00 $62,500.00 No Bid 10,000.00 $50,000.00 
145 536-85-29 GUARDRAIL END TREATMENT- DOUBLE FACE TRAILING ANCHORAGE 5.00 EA 177.12 $885.60 2,000.00 $10,000.00 3,405.09 $17,025.45 3,405.09 $17,025.45 2,660.00 $13,300.00 2,660.00 $13,300.00 1,500.00 $7,500.00 200.00 $1,000.00 No Bid 2,000.00 $10,000.00 
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ITEM 
NO. PAY ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

The Stout Group, LLC
FEIN # 45-5312119

10850 NW 138th St, Bay #3

Superior Landscaping & Lawn 
Service, Inc.

FEIN # 65-0838100
200 NW 23rd Ave

Solution Construction,Inc.
FEIN # 02-0698712

8160 NW 93rd Street

Metro Express, Inc.
Fein # 65-0711071

9390 NW 109th Street

JVA Engineering Contractor, Inc.
FEIN # 48-127-7685

6600 NW 32nd Avenue

JVA Engineering Contractor, Inc.
FEIN # 48-127-7685

6601 NW 32nd Avenue

BID TABULATION - GROUP A

GPE Engineering & General 
Contractor CorpFlorida Engineering & Development

Florida Construction & 
Engineering Inc.

IFB 2021-004 CITYWIDE RIGHT OF WAY IMPROVMENTS

3001 Almeria Ave, Suite 360

VOLUNTARY PRICE REDUCTIONPRIMARY SECONDARY 
Solicitation Closing Date:  APRIL 7, 2021

12076 NW 98th Ave P.O. Box 4582
FEIN # 59-2768130 FEIN # 8-0345690 FEIN # 59-1963236

VOLTUNTARY PRICE REDUCTION
GPE Engineering & General Contractor 

Corp
FEIN # 59-1963237

P.O. Box 4582

Landscaping
146 570-2-1 PERFORMANCE TURF, SOD - ST AUGUSTINE FLORATAM 72,000.00 SF 0.59 $42,480.00 0.70 $50,400.00 0.95 $68,400.00 0.95 $68,400.00 0.90 $64,800.00 0.90 $64,800.00 1.00 $72,000.00 0.60 $43,200.00 0.60 $43,200.00 1.00 $72,000.00 
147 570-2-2 PERFORMANCE TURF, SOD - ST AUGUSTINE PALMETTO 72,000.00 SF 0.62 $44,640.00 0.70 $50,400.00 0.95 $68,400.00 0.95 $68,400.00 0.90 $64,800.00 0.90 $64,800.00 1.00 $72,000.00 0.60 $43,200.00 0.65 $46,800.00 1.00 $72,000.00 
148 570-2-3 PERFORMANCE TURF, SOD - OTHER VARIETY 36,000.00 SF 0.42 $15,120.00 0.50 $18,000.00 1.86 $66,960.00 1.86 $66,960.00 1.22 $43,920.00 1.22 $43,920.00 1.00 $36,000.00 1.00 $36,000.00 0.89 $32,040.00 1.00 $36,000.00 
149 581-1-5 RELOCATE TREES AND PALMS,TREES, TREES, >=4.5" to <=12" DIAMETER AT BREAST HEIGHT 40.00 EA 1,045.50 $41,820.00 750.00 $30,000.00 2,500.00 $100,000.00 2,500.00 $100,000.00 1,400.00 $56,000.00 1,400.00 $56,000.00 600.00 $24,000.00 800.00 $32,000.00 890.00 $35,600.00 850.00 $34,000.00 
150 582-2-1 SEED & MULCH, CYPRESS 1,600.00 SF 1.13 $1,808.00 1.00 $1,600.00 3.00 $4,800.00 3.00 $4,800.00 5.75 $9,200.00 5.75 $9,200.00 1.00 $1,600.00 1.00 $1,600.00 2.20 $3,520.00 3.00 $4,800.00 
151 582-2-2 SEED & MULCH, EUCALYPTUS 1,600.00 SF 1.23 $1,968.00 1.00 $1,600.00 3.00 $4,800.00 3.00 $4,800.00 5.75 $9,200.00 5.75 $9,200.00 1.00 $1,600.00 1.00 $1,600.00 3.87 $6,192.00 3.00 $4,800.00 

$0.00
152 635-2-11 PULL & SPLICE BOX, F&I, 13" x 24" COVER SIZE 100.00 EA 1,107.00 $110,700.00 700.00 $70,000.00 754.83 $75,483.00 754.83 $75,483.00 850.00 $85,000.00 850.00 $85,000.00 800.00 $80,000.00 500.00 $50,000.00 1,660.00 $166,000.00 650.00 $65,000.00 
153 660-2-101 LOOP ASSEMBLY- F&I, TYPE A 25.00 AS 1,476.00 $36,900.00 2,200.00 $55,000.00 1,450.88 $36,272.00 1,450.88 $36,272.00 1,100.00 $27,500.00 1,100.00 $27,500.00 1,500.00 $37,500.00 1,200.00 $30,000.00 2,400.00 $60,000.00 1,500.00 $37,500.00 
154 660-2-102 LOOP ASSEMBLY, F&I, TYPE B 25.00 AS 1,476.00 $36,900.00 2,500.00 $62,500.00 1,658.67 $41,466.75 1,658.67 $41,466.75 1,150.00 $28,750.00 1,150.00 $28,750.00 1,500.00 $37,500.00 1,000.00 $25,000.00 2,200.00 $55,000.00 1,500.00 $37,500.00 

155 700-1-11 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF 80.00 AS 319.80 $25,584.00 330.00 $26,400.00 445.24 $35,619.20 $445.24 $35,619.20 300.00 $24,000.00 300.00 $24,000.00 350.00 $28,000.00 400.00 $32,000.00 No Bid 300.00 $24,000.00 
156 700-1-12 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, 12-20 SF 30.00 AS 344.40 $10,332.00 1,130.00 $33,900.00 1,238.35 $37,150.50 1,180.66 $35,419.80 1,025.00 $30,750.00 1,025.00 $30,750.00 600.00 $18,000.00 1,250.00 $37,500.00 No Bid 960.00 $28,800.00 
157 700-1-13 SINGLE POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, 21-30 SF 30.00 AS 430.50 $12,915.00 1,650.00 $49,500.00 1,905.16 $57,154.80 1,816.40 $54,492.00 1,500.00 $45,000.00 1,500.00 $45,000.00 800.00 $24,000.00 1,874.00 $56,220.00 No Bid 1,200.00 $36,000.00 
158 700-1-40 SINGLE POST SIGN, INSTALL 24.00 AS 319.80 $7,675.20 655.00 $15,720.00 253.02 $6,072.48 253.02 $6,072.48 595.00 $14,280.00 585.00 $14,040.00 200.00 $4,800.00 400.00 $9,600.00 No Bid 120.00 $2,880.00 
159 700-1-50 SINGLE POST SIGN, RELOCATE 400.00 AS 86.10 $34,440.00 435.00 $174,000.00 317.12 $126,848.00 317.12 $126,848.00 395.00 $158,000.00 350.00 $140,000.00 150.00 $60,000.00 475.00 $190,000.00 No Bid 240.00 $96,000.00 
160 700-1-60 SINGLE POST SIGN, REMOVE 40.00 AS 36.90 $1,476.00 50.00 $2,000.00 63.30 $2,532.00 63.30 $2,532.00 5.00 $200.00 5.00 $200.00 100.00 $4,000.00 100.00 $4,000.00 No Bid 6.00 $240.00 
161 700-1-80 SINGLE POST SIGN, REPAIR 10.00 AS 319.80 $3,198.00 330.00 $3,300.00 317.53 $3,175.30 302.73 $3,027.30 300.00 $3,000.00 300.00 $3,000.00 200.00 $2,000.00 1,200.00 $12,000.00 No Bid 240.00 $2,400.00 
162 700-2-11 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF 30.00 AS 344.40 $10,332.00 2,475.00 $74,250.00 2,540.21 $76,206.30 2,540.21 $76,206.30 2,250.00 $67,500.00 2,250.00 $67,500.00 400.00 $12,000.00 2,771.00 $83,130.00 No Bid 2,400.00 $72,000.00 
163 700-2-12 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, 12-20 SF 30.00 AS 430.50 $12,915.00 3,800.00 $114,000.00 3,353.08 $100,592.40 3,353.08 $100,592.40 3,450.00 $103,500.00 3,450.00 $103,500.00 650.00 $19,500.00 3,324.00 $99,720.00 No Bid 3,000.00 $90,000.00 
164 700-2-13 MULTI- POST SIGN, F&I GROUND MOUNT, 21-30 SF 30.00 AS 430.50 $12,915.00 4,200.00 $126,000.00 3,911.93 $117,357.90 3,911.93 $117,357.90 3,800.00 $114,000.00 3,800.00 $114,000.00 850.00 $25,500.00 3,934.00 $118,020.00 No Bid 3,600.00 $108,000.00 
165 700-2-40 MULTI- POST SIGN, INSTALL 30.00 AS 615.00 $18,450.00 1,050.00 $31,500.00 355.63 $10,668.90 355.63 $10,668.90 950.00 $28,500.00 950.00 $28,500.00 250.00 $7,500.00 4,500.00 $135,000.00 No Bid 1,140.00 $34,200.00 
166 700-2-50 MULTI- POST SIGN, GROUND MOUNT, RELOCATE 30.00 AS 172.20 $5,166.00 3,520.00 $105,600.00 2,997.45 $89,923.50 2,997.45 $89,923.50 3,200.00 $96,000.00 3,200.00 $96,000.00 150.00 $4,500.00 3,011.00 $90,330.00 No Bid 3,000.00 $90,000.00 
167 700-2-60 MULTI- POST SIGN, REMOVE 30.00 AS 73.80 $2,214.00 550.00 $16,500.00 457.24 $13,717.20 457.24 $13,717.20 500.00 $15,000.00 500.00 $15,000.00 100.00 $3,000.00 762.00 $22,860.00 No Bid 600.00 $18,000.00 
168 700-2-80 MULTI- POST SIGN, GROUND MOUNT, REPAIR 10.00 AS 430.50 $4,305.00 1,375.00 $13,750.00 1,600.33 $16,003.30 1,600.33 $16,003.30 1,250.00 $12,500.00 1,250.00 $12,500.00 250.00 $2,500.00 7,500.00 $75,000.00 No Bid 1,500.00 $15,000.00 
169 700-3-101 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, UP TO 12 SF 30.00 EA 319.80 $9,594.00 500.00 $15,000.00 316.12 $9,483.60 316.12 $9,483.60 450.00 $13,500.00 450.00 $13,500.00 350.00 $10,500.00 316.19 $9,485.70 No Bid 240.00 $7,200.00 
170 700-3-102 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 12-20 SF 30.00 EA 344.40 $10,332.00 660.00 $19,800.00 584.25 $17,527.50 584.25 $17,527.50 600.00 $18,000.00 600.00 $18,000.00 600.00 $18,000.00 767.00 $23,010.00 No Bid 300.00 $9,000.00 
171 700-3-103 SIGN PANEL, FURNISH & INSTALL GROUND MOUNT, 21-30 SF 30.00 EA 430.50 $12,915.00 1,000.00 $30,000.00 1,016.09 $30,482.70 1,016.09 $30,482.70 900.00 $27,000.00 900.00 $27,000.00 800.00 $24,000.00 1,278.00 $38,340.00 No Bid 360.00 $10,800.00 
172 700-3-401 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, UP TO 12 SF 30.00 EA 615.00 $18,450.00 385.00 $11,550.00 191.52 $5,745.60 191.52 $5,745.60 350.00 $10,500.00 350.00 $10,500.00 200.00 $6,000.00 316.19 $9,485.70 No Bid 36.00 $1,080.00 
173 700-3-402 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 12-20 SF 30.00 EA 676.50 $20,295.00 1,270.00 $38,100.00 257.04 $7,711.20 257.04 $7,711.20 1,150.00 $34,500.00 1,150.00 $34,500.00 600.00 $18,000.00 767.00 $23,010.00 No Bid 36.00 $1,080.00 
174 700-3-403 SIGN PANEL, INSTALL, 21-30 SF 30.00 EA 738.00 $22,140.00 1,760.00 $52,800.00 378.92 $11,367.60 378.92 $11,367.60 1,600.00 $48,000.00 1,600.00 $48,000.00 800.00 $24,000.00 1,278.00 $38,340.00 No Bid 60.00 $1,800.00 
175 700-3-501 SIGN PANEL, RELOCATE, UP TO 12 SF 30.00 EA 319.80 $9,594.00 325.00 $9,750.00 252.81 $7,584.30 252.81 $7,584.30 295.00 $8,850.00 295.00 $8,850.00 150.00 $4,500.00 475.00 $14,250.00 No Bid 36.00 $1,080.00 
176 700-3-502 SIGN PANEL, RELOCATE, 12-20 SF 30.00 EA 344.40 $10,332.00 640.00 $19,200.00 315.52 $9,465.60 315.52 $9,465.60 580.00 $17,400.00 580.00 $17,400.00 150.00 $4,500.00 475.00 $14,250.00 No Bid 36.00 $1,080.00 
177 700-3-503 SIGN PANEL, RELOCATE, 21-30 SF 30.00 EA 430.50 $12,915.00 845.00 $25,350.00 380.03 $11,400.90 380.03 $11,400.90 765.00 $22,950.00 765.00 $22,950.00 150.00 $4,500.00 475.00 $14,250.00 No Bid 60.00 $1,800.00 
178 700-3-601 SIGN PANEL, REMOVE, UP TO 12 SF 30.00 EA 319.80 $9,594.00 50.00 $1,500.00 63.14 $1,894.20 63.14 $1,894.20 20.00 $600.00 20.00 $600.00 100.00 $3,000.00 100.00 $3,000.00 No Bid 12.00 $360.00 
179 700-3-602 SIGN PANEL, REMOVE, 12-20 SF 30.00 EA 344.40 $10,332.00 50.00 $1,500.00 126.81 $3,804.30 126.81 $3,804.30 30.00 $900.00 30.00 $900.00 100.00 $3,000.00 348.00 $10,440.00 No Bid 12.00 $360.00 
180 700-3-603 SIGN PANEL, REMOVE, 21-30 SF 30.00 EA 430.50 $12,915.00 50.00 $1,500.00 197.75 $5,932.50 197.75 $5,932.50 40.00 $1,200.00 40.00 $1,200.00 100.00 $3,000.00 464.55 $13,936.50 No Bid 13.20 $396.00 
181 705-11-3 DELINEATOR, FLEXIBLE HIGH VISABILITY, IN-STREET CROSSWALK SIGN, R1-6C 50.00 EA 86.10 $4,305.00 100.00 $5,000.00 488.99 $24,449.50 488.99 $24,449.50 90.00 $4,500.00 90.00 $4,500.00 500.00 $25,000.00 75.00 $3,750.00 No Bid 108.00 $5,400.00 
182 706-1-1 RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER, TYPE B (YELLOW, RED, BLUE) 8,800.00 EA 4.92 $43,296.00 4.00 $35,200.00 6.73 $59,224.00 6.73 $59,224.00 3.50 $30,800.00 3.50 $30,800.00 5.00 $44,000.00 6.00 $52,800.00 No Bid 3.00 $26,400.00 
183 710-11-121 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, WHITE, SOLID, 6" 24,000.00 LF 0.37 $8,880.00 0.40 $9,600.00 0.73 $17,520.00 0.73 $17,520.00 0.35 $8,400.00 0.35 $8,400.00 0.50 $12,000.00 0.45 $10,800.00 No Bid 0.12 $2,880.00 
184 710-11-122 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, WHITE, SOLID, 8" 1,200.00 LF 0.86 $1,032.00 0.50 $600.00 0.87 $1,044.00 0.87 $1,044.00 0.45 $540.00 0.45 $540.00 0.60 $720.00 0.49 $588.00 1.35 $1,620.00 0.12 $144.00 
185 710-11-123 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, WHITE, SOLID, 12" 4,800.00 LF 0.15 $720.00 1.00 $4,800.00 1.16 $5,568.00 1.16 $5,568.00 0.75 $3,600.00 0.75 $3,600.00 0.90 $4,320.00 0.98 $4,704.00 2.70 $12,960.00 0.43 $2,064.00 
186 710-11-124 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, WHITE, SOLID, 18" 1,200.00 LF 1.72 $2,064.00 1.60 $1,920.00 1.32 $1,584.00 1.32 $1,584.00 1.40 $1,680.00 1.40 $1,680.00 1.20 $1,440.00 1.64 $1,968.00 3.38 $4,056.00 0.65 $780.00 
187 710-11-125 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, WHITE, SOLID, 24" 24,000.00 LF 2.46 $59,040.00 1.80 $43,200.00 1.33 $31,920.00 1.33 $31,920.00 1.60 $38,400.00 1.60 $38,400.00 1.60 $38,400.00 3.75 $90,000.00 3.71 $89,040.00 0.85 $20,400.00 
188 710-11-126 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, WHITE, SOLID, 4" 3,600.00 LF 0.37 $1,332.00 0.40 $1,440.00 0.66 $2,376.00 0.66 $2,376.00 0.30 $1,080.00 0.30 $1,080.00 0.50 $1,800.00 0.35 $1,260.00 1.35 $4,860.00 0.20 $720.00 
189 710-11-131 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, WHITE, SKIP, 10-30 OR 3-9 SKIP, 6" WIDE 24,000.00 LF 0.37 $8,880.00 0.40 $9,600.00 0.67 $16,080.00 0.67 $16,080.00 0.35 $8,400.00 0.35 $8,400.00 0.50 $12,000.00 0.87 $20,880.00 1.35 $32,400.00 0.12 $2,880.00 

190 710-11-141 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, WHITE, 2-4 DOTTED  GUIDELINE/ 6-10 DOTTED EXTENSION, 6" 1,500.00 LF 0.37 $555.00 0.40 $600.00 0.79 $1,185.00 0.79 $1,185.00 0.35 $525.00 0.35 $525.00 0.50 $750.00 0.87 $1,305.00 No Bid 0.12 $180.00 

191 710-11-144 PAINTED PAVEMENT MARKINGS, STANDARD, WHITE, 2-2 DOTTED EXTENSION LINE FOR ROUNDABOUT, 12" 1,500.00 LF 0.37 $555.00 0.80 $1,200.00 1.25 $1,875.00 1.25 $1,875.00 0.70 $1,050.00 0.70 $1,050.00 0.90 $1,350.00 0.87 $1,305.00 No Bid 0.42 $630.00 
192 710-11-160 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, WHITE, MESSAGE OR SYMBOL 40.00 EA 49.20 $1,968.00 50.00 $2,000.00 92.46 $3,698.40 92.46 $3,698.40 40.00 $1,600.00 40.00 $1,600.00 75.00 $3,000.00 95.00 $3,800.00 108.00 $4,320.00 36.00 $1,440.00 
193 710-11-170 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, WHITE, ARROWS 320.00 EA 30.75 $9,840.00 35.00 $11,200.00 39.63 $12,681.60 39.63 $12,681.60 30.00 $9,600.00 30.00 $9,600.00 50.00 $16,000.00 25.00 $8,000.00 81.00 $25,920.00 24.00 $7,680.00 
194 710-11-190 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, WHITE, ISLAND NOSE 120.00 SF 2.46 $295.20 2.50 $300.00 2.31 $277.20 2.31 $277.20 2.00 $240.00 2.00 $240.00 3.00 $360.00 3.00 $360.00 54.00 $6,480.00 2.40 $288.00 
195 710-11-201 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, YELLOW, SOLID, 6" 24,000.00 LF 0.37 $8,880.00 0.40 $9,600.00 0.61 $14,640.00 0.61 $14,640.00 0.35 $8,400.00 0.35 $8,400.00 0.50 $12,000.00 0.45 $10,800.00 1.35 $32,400.00 0.12 $2,880.00 
196 710-11-202 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, YELLOW, SOLID, 8" 1,200.00 LF 0.86 $1,032.00 0.50 $600.00 0.90 $1,080.00 0.90 $1,080.00 0.45 $540.00 0.45 $540.00 0.60 $720.00 0.50 $600.00 2.70 $3,240.00 0.12 $144.00 
197 710-11-203 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, YELLOW, SOLID, 12" 4,800.00 LF 1.23 $5,904.00 0.80 $3,840.00 1.16 $5,568.00 1.16 $5,568.00 0.70 $3,360.00 0.70 $3,360.00 0.90 $4,320.00 8.82 $42,336.00 3.38 $16,224.00 0.42 $2,016.00 
198 710-11-224 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, YELLOW, SOLID, 18" 1,200.00 LF 1.72 $2,064.00 1.60 $1,920.00 1.32 $1,584.00 1.32 $1,584.00 1.40 $1,680.00 1.40 $1,680.00 1.20 $1,440.00 1.64 $1,968.00 3.71 $4,452.00 0.65 $780.00 
199 710-11-225 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, YELLOW, SOLID, 24" 12,000.00 LF 2.46 $29,520.00 1.80 $21,600.00 1.33 $15,960.00 1.33 $15,960.00 1.60 $19,200.00 1.60 $19,200.00 1.60 $19,200.00 1.00 $12,000.00 1.35 $16,200.00 0.85 $10,200.00 
200 710-11-226 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, YELLOW, SOLID, 4" 3,600.00 LF 0.37 $1,332.00 0.30 $1,080.00 0.66 $2,376.00 0.66 $2,376.00 0.25 $900.00 0.25 $900.00 0.50 $1,800.00 0.45 $1,620.00 1.35 $4,860.00 0.12 $432.00 
201 710-11-231 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, YELLOW, SKIP, 10-30 OR 3-9 SKIP, 6" WIDE 24,000.00 LF 0.37 $8,880.00 0.90 $21,600.00 0.67 $16,080.00 0.67 $16,080.00 0.75 $18,000.00 0.75 $18,000.00 0.50 $12,000.00 0.85 $20,400.00 1.35 $32,400.00 0.12 $2,880.00 

202 710-11-241 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, YELLOW, 2-4 DOTTED  GUIDELINE/ 6-10 DOTTED EXTENSION, 6" 1,500.00 LF 0.37 $555.00 0.90 $1,350.00 0.79 $1,185.00 0.79 $1,185.00 0.75 $1,125.00 0.75 $1,125.00 0.50 $750.00 0.87 $1,305.00 No Bid 0.12 $180.00 
203 710-11-290 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, YELLOW, ISLAND  NOSE 1,200.00 SF 2.46 $2,952.00 2.50 $3,000.00 1.92 $2,304.00 1.92 $2,304.00 2.00 $2,400.00 2.00 $2,400.00 3.00 $3,600.00 3.00 $3,600.00 No Bid 2.40 $2,880.00 

204 710-11-426 PAINTED PAVEMENT  MARKINGS, STANDARD, BLUE, SOLID  FOR PARKING LOT- ACCESSIBLE MARKINGS, 4" 1,200.00 LF 0.74 $888.00 1.00 $1,200.00 0.73 $876.00 0.73 $876.00 0.90 $1,080.00 0.90 $1,080.00 0.50 $600.00 8.00 $9,600.00 No Bid 0.12 $144.00 
205 711-11-101 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, WHITE, SOLID, 6" 24,000.00 LF 0.98 $23,520.00 0.90 $21,600.00 0.91 $21,840.00 0.91 $21,840.00 0.75 $18,000.00 0.75 $18,000.00 1.00 $24,000.00 0.75 $18,000.00 2.70 $64,800.00 0.84 $20,160.00 
206 711-11-102 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, WHITE, SOLID, 8" 1,200.00 LF 1.23 $1,476.00 1.00 $1,200.00 1.59 $1,908.00 1.59 $1,908.00 0.85 $1,020.00 0.85 $1,020.00 1.20 $1,440.00 1.30 $1,560.00 4.73 $5,676.00 0.90 $1,080.00 
207 711-11-123 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, WHITE, SOLID, 12" 10,400.00 LF 0.98 $10,192.00 1.80 $18,720.00 2.77 $28,808.00 2.77 $28,808.00 1.60 $16,640.00 1.60 $16,640.00 2.50 $26,000.00 2.50 $26,000.00 4.05 $42,120.00 1.76 $18,304.00 
208 711-11-124 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, WHITE, SOLID, 18" 1,200.00 LF 1.23 $1,476.00 2.50 $3,000.00 5.09 $6,108.00 5.09 $6,108.00 2.25 $2,700.00 2.25 $2,700.00 3.00 $3,600.00 3.50 $4,200.00 4.73 $5,676.00 2.40 $2,880.00 
209 711-11-125 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, WHITE, SOLID, 24" 24,000.00 LF 0.98 $23,520.00 3.60 $86,400.00 5.82 $139,680.00 5.82 $139,680.00 3.20 $76,800.00 3.20 $76,800.00 4.50 $108,000.00 5.00 $120,000.00 4.93 $118,320.00 3.30 $79,200.00 
210 711-11-131 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, WHITE, SKIP, 10-30 OR 3-9 SKIP, 6" WIDE 24,000.00 LF 1.23 $29,520.00 0.85 $20,400.00 1.00 $24,000.00 1.00 $24,000.00 0.75 $18,000.00 0.75 $18,000.00 1.00 $24,000.00 0.87 $20,880.00 1.35 $32,400.00 0.84 $20,160.00 
211 711-11-141 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, WHITE, 2-4 DOTTED  GUIDELINE/ 6-10 DOTTED EXTENSION, 6" 1,500.00 LF 0.98 $1,470.00 0.85 $1,275.00 1.19 $1,785.00 1.19 $1,785.00 0.75 $1,125.00 0.75 $1,125.00 1.00 $1,500.00 0.87 $1,305.00 No Bid 0.84 $1,260.00 
212 711-11-144 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, WHITE, 2-2 DOTTED EXTENSION LINE FOR ROUNDABOUT, 12" 3,000.00 LF 1.50 $4,500.00 1.80 $5,400.00 3.50 $10,500.00 3.50 $10,500.00 1.60 $4,800.00 1.60 $4,800.00 2.50 $7,500.00 0.87 $2,610.00 No Bid 0.84 $2,520.00 
213 711-11-160 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, WHITE, MESSAGE  OR SYMBOL 40.00 EA 104.55 $4,182.00 135.00 $5,400.00 254.29 $10,171.60 254.29 $10,171.60 120.00 $4,800.00 120.00 $4,800.00 200.00 $8,000.00 220.00 $8,800.00 135.00 $5,400.00 60.00 $2,400.00 
214 711-11-170 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, WHITE, ARROWS 320.00 EA 79.95 $25,584.00 80.00 $25,600.00 91.49 $29,276.80 91.49 $29,276.80 70.00 $22,400.00 70.00 $22,400.00 120.00 $38,400.00 75.00 $24,000.00 135.00 $43,200.00 48.00 $15,360.00 
215 711-11-201 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, YELLOW, SOLID, 6" 28,000.00 LF 0.98 $27,440.00 0.90 $25,200.00 0.91 $25,480.00 0.91 $25,480.00 0.75 $21,000.00 0.75 $21,000.00 1.00 $28,000.00 0.75 $21,000.00 No Bid 0.84 $23,520.00 
216 711-11-202 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, YELLOW, SOLID, 8" 1,200.00 LF 1.23 $1,476.00 1.00 $1,200.00 1.59 $1,908.00 1.59 $1,908.00 0.85 $1,020.00 0.85 $1,020.00 1.20 $1,440.00 1.30 $1,560.00 No Bid 0.90 $1,080.00 
217 711-11-203 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, YELLOW, SOLID, 12" 4,800.00 LF 1.85 $8,880.00 1.70 $8,160.00 2.77 $13,296.00 2.77 $13,296.00 1.50 $7,200.00 1.50 $7,200.00 2.50 $12,000.00 2.50 $12,000.00 No Bid 1.76 $8,448.00 
218 711-11-224 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, YELLOW, SOLID, 18" 1,200.00 LF 2.46 $2,952.00 2.50 $3,000.00 4.27 $5,124.00 4.27 $5,124.00 2.25 $2,700.00 2.25 $2,700.00 3.00 $3,600.00 3.50 $4,200.00 No Bid 2.40 $2,880.00 
219 711-11-225 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, YELLOW, SOLID, 24" 12,000.00 LF 3.69 $44,280.00 3.60 $43,200.00 5.82 $69,840.00 5.82 $69,840.00 3.20 $38,400.00 3.20 $38,400.00 4.50 $54,000.00 5.00 $60,000.00 No Bid 3.30 $39,600.00 
220 711-11-231 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, YELLOW, SKIP,   10-30 OR 3-9 SKIP, 6" WIDE 24,000.00 LF 0.98 $23,520.00 0.90 $21,600.00 1.00 $24,000.00 1.00 $24,000.00 0.75 $18,000.00 0.75 $18,000.00 1.00 $24,000.00 0.85 $20,400.00 No Bid 0.84 $20,160.00 
221 711-11-241 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, YELLOW, 2-4 DOTTED  GUIDELINE/ 6-10 DOTTED EXTENSION, 6" 1,500.00 LF 0.98 $1,470.00 0.90 $1,350.00 1.19 $1,785.00 1.19 $1,785.00 0.75 $1,125.00 0.75 $1,125.00 1.00 $1,500.00 0.87 $1,305.00 No Bid 0.84 $1,260.00 
222 711-11-421 THERMOPLASTIC, STANDARD, BLUE, SOLID, 6" 1,200.00 LF 1.85 $2,220.00 0.60 $720.00 8.59 $10,308.00 8.59 $10,308.00 0.50 $600.00 0.50 $600.00 1.50 $1,800.00 9.00 $10,800.00 No Bid 0.60 $720.00 
223 711-14-160 THERMOPLASTIC, PREFORMED, WHITE, MESSAGE 40.00 EA 492.00 $19,680.00 300.00 $12,000.00 526.74 $21,069.60 599.14 $23,965.60 260.00 $10,400.00 260.00 $10,400.00 600.00 $24,000.00 500.00 $20,000.00 No Bid 210.00 $8,400.00 
224 711-14-170 THERMOPLASTIC, PREFORMED, WHITE, ARROW 40.00 EA 246.00 $9,840.00 170.00 $6,800.00 371.49 $14,859.60 371.49 $14,859.60 150.00 $6,000.00 150.00 $6,000.00 300.00 $12,000.00 275.00 $11,000.00 135.00 $5,400.00 114.00 $4,560.00 
225 711-17-1 THERMOPLASTIC, REMOVE EXISTING THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT MARKINGS- SURFACE TO REMAIN 20,000.00 SF 1.48 $29,600.00 4.50 $90,000.00 2.64 $52,800.00 2.64 $52,800.00 4.00 $80,000.00 4.00 $80,000.00 1.00 $20,000.00 3.75 $75,000.00 135.00 $2,700,000.00 1.80 $36,000.00 

Total - Group A Right of Way Improvments $11,524,309.90 $8,276,095.00 $7,823,872.16 $7,790,694.46 $6,977,005.00 $6,953,015.00 $8,133,130.00 $9,207,641.90 $15,800,540.25 $7,936,920.00 
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