
COMPANY NAME OPEN 
SEQ.

 TOTAL BID 
AMOUNT 

 ALTERNATE 
ADDITIVE 1 

 ALTERNATE 
ADDITIVE 2 

 ALTERNATE 
ADDITIVE 3 

 ALTERNATE 
ADDITIVE 4 GRAND TOTAL ADDENDA 

RECEIVED BONDS

FLORIDA CONSTRUCTION 1 460,081.40$          61,162.00$    50,648.00$    -$               -$               571,891.40$        YES YES
ABC CONSTRUCTION 2 486,348.00$          87,550.00$    30,000.00$    -$               -$               603,898.00$        YES YES
LEADEX CORP. 3 341,600.00$         92,000.00$   35,000.00$   6,500.00$      -$              475,100.00$       YES YES
BUILDING & DEVELOPMENT SOLUTION 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WRANGLER CONSTRUCTION 5 457,440.00$          44,200.00$    25,500.00$    -$               -$               527,140.00$        YES YES
CARIVON COSNTRUCTION 6 378,854.00$          148,454.00$  21,833.00$    9,500.00$      (3,000.00)$     555,641.00$        YES YES
SFM 7 456,902.00$          98,464.00$    19,559.00$    -$               -$               574,925.00$        YES YES
ACTION CONSTRUCTION 8 461,611.00$          96,900.00$    28,350.00$    -$               -$               586,861.00$        YES YES
HOMESTEAD CONCRETE 9 405,362.09$          92,238.00$    24,898.86$    -$               -$               522,498.95$        YES YES
MAGGOLC 10 464,995.85$          57,490.00$    28,500.00$    -$               -$               550,985.85$        YES YES
SOLUTION CONSTRUCTION 11 398,353.76$          32,000.00$    73,000.00$    -$               -$               503,353.76$        YES YES
GAVARETTE, INC. 12 399,600.00$         57,120.00$   21,000.00$   -$              -$              477,720.00$       YES YES
T & G CONSTRUCTION 13 434,950.00$          104,000.00$  19,864.00$    -$               -$               558,814.00$        YES YES
LINK 14 415,000.00$          100,600.00$  69,600.00$    -$               -$               585,200.00$        YES YES
BMA CONSTRUCTION, INC. 15 370,484.00$         53,683.00$   20,353.00$   -$              -$              444,520.00$       YES YES
GECKO 16 388,344.00$          105,500.00$  19,500.00$    -$               -$               513,344.00$        YES YES
ANDALE 17 445,671.00$          64,188.00$    22,495.00$    -$               -$               532,354.00$        YES YES
DEVELOPMENT & COMMUNICATION 18 466,600.00$          130,000.00$  6,500.00$      -$               -$               603,100.00$        YES YES
CISCA 19 393,702.00$          46,385.00$    45,519.00$    -$               -$               485,606.00$        YES YES
WILLIAMS PAVING 20 609,100.00$          115,000.00$  28,000.00$    -$               -$               752,100.00$        YES (1) YES
JRT 21 571,270.00$          107,693.00$  28,002.00$    -$               -$               706,965.00$        YES (1) YES
TRANSAMERICA 22 408,220.00$          78,000.00$    15,360.00$    -$               -$               501,580.00$        YES YES
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