The City of Coral Gables

Procurement Division

2800 S.W. 72ND AVENUE
Miamy, FLORIDA 33155

July 28, 2025

All Responding Bidders (See Distribution List)

SUBJECT: IFB 2025-011 Rental of Heavy Equipment
Dear Bidders,

The evaluation of the bids submitted in response to the above cited solicitation is complete. The
City Manager has recommended an award as shown in the attached document.

This notice is provided in accordance with Section 2-910 (c} of the Code of the City of Coral
Gables. Our provision of this notice also serves to confirm the lifting of the Cone of Silence from
this procurement action as dictated by Section 2-1027 (4)(b) of the same City Code.

Thank you for your participation in this competition. If you have any questions please contact
Neivy Garcia, Procurement Specialist at 305-460-5121 or ngarcia2 @coralgables.com .

Attachment: Award Recommendation

Distribution List: Equipmentshare.com, Inc.
United Rentals (North America), Inc.

PHONE (305) 460-5102 Fax (305) 261-1601 procurement@coralgables com



CITY OF CORAL GABLES
-MEMORANDUM-

TO: Honorable Mayor, Vice-Mayor, DATE: July 24, 2025
and members of the City Commission

FROM: PeterJ. Iglesias, P.E.Peter J. P werees” SUBJECT: Award Recommendation
City Manager Iglesias Dat; 202507.28 IFB 2025-011 Rent?;(;)lji;?]ae\x

At the next available City Commission Meeting, an award recommendation for IFB 2025-011
Rental of Heavy Equipment will be included on the agenda. This memorandum serves to
notify you that in accordance with Section 2-763 of the City Code entitled "Contract Award",
my recommendation for award of the subject IFB is as follows:

1) Accept the Chief Procurement Officer's recommendation to award Equipmentshare.com,
Inc., the most responsive and responsible bidder.

2) Execute a contract with Equipmentshare.com, Inc. in an amount not to exceed the
available budget based on need.

3) Reaffirm the city's right to pursue alternative courses of action.

On May 8, 2025, the Procurement Division of Finance formally advertised, issued and
distributed IFB 2025-011 Rental of Heavy Equipment. Twenty-nine (29) prospective bidders
were notified through INFOR, the City’s web-based e-Procurement system.

Two (2) bids were received on June 13, 2025, in response to the IFB: Equipmentshare.com,
Inc. and United Rentals (North America), Inc.

The responses were reviewed by the Procurement Division to determine responsiveness to
the requirements of the IFB. During the responsiveness review, it was determined by
Procurement, after consulting with the City Attorney’s Office, that United Rentals (North
America), Inc. was non-responsive based on failure to provide sufficient detail and
documentation in their submittal as required per Sections 3(A)(1) and 3(A)(2) of the IFB, as
well as failure to provide the required Bidder's Acknowledgement form. The Procurement
Division finalized its’ due diligence process and confirmed that Equipmentshare.com, Inc. is
responsive to the requirements of the IFB and a responsible bidder. See attached Tabulation
of Bids received.

A more detailed description of the IFB, response, and evaluation results will be provided to
you as part of the agenda package.

Please contact me should you have any questions.

Copy:

Cristina M. Suarez, City Attorney

Billy Y. Urquia, City Clerk

Jose Gomez, Deputy City Manager

Hermes Diaz, Public Works Director

Diana M. Gomez, Finance Director

Celeste S. Walker-Harmon, Assistant Finance Director for Procurement



City of Coral Gables, Florida

Bid Tabulation
[IT8 No.: IFB 2025-011
|Bid Titte: Rental of Heavy Equip
|Bid Opening Date: June 13, 2025 @ 2:00 pm
|Prepared by: Andrea Fortella
Lowest Respansive and Responsible Bidder Dagmed Non Responsive
VENDOR NAME Equipmentshare.com, Inc, United Rentals {(North America), Inc. Equipmentshare.com, Inc. United Rentals {North America), Inc.
[Vendor FEIN 47-2405753 86-G933835 47-2405753 86-0933835
. . 5710 Butl Run Pr 5710 Bul Run Dr. )
Corporation Add Locations [County & State): i i First Stamiord Place, suite 700 Stamford, CT 06902
poration Address/ Locations {County & State): Columbia, MO 65201 100 First Stamford Place, suite 700 Stamford, CT 06902 Coismbia, MO 65201 100 First Stamford Place, suite amfor
Local Preference Affirmed? No No No No
Local 5% Preference Applicable? N No
Corat Gables/ Miami-Dade County b L °
Vendor Centact {for this bid) Edgar Chardon Did not provide a contact for bid response. Contact in Infor is Daniel Cunningham Edgar Chardon provide a contact for bid response. Contact in Infor is Danjel Cunny
Vendor Contact Phone Number 786:575-1575 B877-874-4468 786-575-1575 B77-874-4468
EEndonconiaciiEmail sdgas. chiatdon @ aguimentslia Som imnts §1gLom togar chardon @ SquipTinishgrn com grants i com
Monthly | Mobilization Mobilization | Hourly Weeldy | Monthly | Mobilization | Hourly Weekly | Monthly | Mobilization
NO. DESCRIPTION Daily Rate
Hourly Rate | Daily Rate | Weekly Rate — Fee Hourly Rate Daily Rate Weekly Rate | Monthly Rate o o Daily Rate! Rate Rate Fee Rate ly Ral oo Rate o
Equipment Description [ WITHOUT OPERATOR 'WITH OPERATOR
AERIAL - BOOM LIFTS AERIAL - BOOM LIFTS
1 BOOM STRAIGHT 45FT 1B 4WD DSL 5$350.00 $350.00 $750.00 $1,200.00 $75.00 No Bid $374.00 $985.00 5$1,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 BOOM STRAIGHT 40FT 4WD DSL $350.00 $350.00 $750.00 $1,200.00 $75.00 No Bid $345.00 $845.00 $1,945.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No éid No Bid N Bid No Bid No Bid Ko Bid
3 BO0M ARTICULATED 45FT 4WE DSL $350.00 $350.00 $750.00 $1,200.00 47500 No Bid $374.00 $895 00 $1,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid
q BOOM ARTICULATED A5FT JIB 4WD DSL $350.00 $3%0.00 $750.00 $1,200.00 $75.00 No 8id $374,00 5895.00 41,995.00 No id No Bid No Bid Ko Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No id Na Bid
5 laoom STRAIGHT B5FT JIB 4WD DSL $486.00 5486.00 5L,01S.00 | $2,125.00 $75.00 No Bid $495.00 $1,095.00 $2,195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No @id o Bid Nao Bid Ho Bid No Bid
[ ISOM ARTICULATED 60FT 118 4WD DSL $486.00 $486.00 $1,015.00 42,125.00 575.00 No Bid 5495.00 $1,085.00 $2,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 !gom STRANGHT GOFT 4WD DSL $486.00 $486.00 $1,015.00 | 52,125.00 $75.00 No Bid $450.00 $1,050.00 $2,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 BOOM ARTICULATED G0FT 2WD OF $486.00 $486.00 5,015.00 | $2,125.00 $75.00 No Bid 549500 $1,095.00 $2,295.00 No Bid No Bid o Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No 8id
9 BGOM STRAIGHT BOFT WD DF $640.00 $640.00 $1,640.00 | 53,150.00 $75.00 Ho Bid $745.00 $1,725.00 $3,295.00 No Bid No Bid Ne: Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid Ko Bid No Bid No Bid Ko Bid Na bid
10 BOOM STRAIGHT BOFT 4WD DS $640.00 $640.00 $1,640.00 | $3,150.00 $75.00 No Bid $745.00 5§1,725.00 53,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid
3 BOOM ARTICULATED BOFT MB 4WD DF $640.00 $640.00 5164000 | 53,150.00 $75.00 o Bid $795.00 $1,795.00 $3,450.00 No Bid Wo Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 BOOM STRAIGHT 85FT JIB 4WD D5SL $640.00 $640.00 $1,640.00 $3,150.00 $125.00 No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No 8id No Bid Na Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid o Bd
1 BOOM STRAIGHT 125FT 1B 4WO DSL 51,105.00 51,105.00 52,855.00 | $6,200.00 $125.00 No Bid 51,295.00 $2,995.00 $7,295.00 No gid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 BOOM ARTICULATED 125FT JIB 4WD DSL 51,105.00 $1,105.00 52,855.00 | $6,200.00 $125.00 No Bid $1,295.00 52,995.00 $7,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No aid
15 BOOM STRAIGHT 135FT JIB 4WD DSL $1,205.00 $1,205.00 $2,75000 | $6,400.00 $125.00 No 8id $1,495.00 $3,295.00 $7,995.00 No Bid Ne Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No id
16 BOOM ARTICULATED 135FT 1B WD DSL $1,205.00 $1,205.00 $2,75000 | 56,400.00 $125.00 No Bid §1,495.00 43,295.00 $7,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 SCISSOR LIFT 19FT NARROW ELEC $100.00 $100.00 $125.00 54,325.00 $75.00 No Bid $115.00 $225.00 5450.00 No Bid No Bid No @id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid




NOD. DESCRIPTION Hourly Rate | Dally Rate | Weekly Rate M::::" Mob:l:l:tion Hourly Rate | Dally Rate | Weekly Rate | Monthiy Rate Mobl:;x:llon H:::v Dally Rate ‘1::':” M::::Iv MONFT:““" “:: ::V Daily Rate “::::V M::::lv Mob:l:l:tion
18 MAST LIFT 20FT DRIVABLE BATT $118.00 $118.00 $235.00 5460.00 $75.00 Mo Bid $199.00 5398.00 $622.00 No &id Ne Bid NoBid | No®id Ne Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid Mo Bid Mo 8id
19 MAST LIET 30FT PUSH AROUND OQUTR BATT $172.00 $172.00 $342.00 $687,00 $75.00 No Bid 5$202.00 5465.00 $837.00 No Bid Ko Bid No Bid NoBid | WNoBid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 SCISSOR LIFT 26 FT 32* WIDE ELECTRIC $135.00 $135.00 $215.00 $525.00 $75.00 No Bid $145.00 $325.00 $695.00 No Bid No #id NoBid | Noeid Mo Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | wNowid No Bid
21 SCISSOR LIFT 26 FT 46° WIDE ELECTRIC $135.00 $135.00 $215.00 $525.00 575.00 No Bid $145.00 $325.00 $695.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | WNoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid
n MAST LIFT 40 FT PUSH AROUND CUTR BATT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $345.00 $630.00 $1,186.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid | No®id o Bid Neo Bid No Bid NoBid | WNoeid No Bid No Bid
23 SCISSOR LIFT 33 FT RT 69 IN DECK DSL $250.00 $250.00 $575.00 $900.00 $15.00 No 8id $325.00 $695.00 $1,395.00 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid NoBid | Nogid No Bid No Bid No Bid MoBid | NoBid No Bid

AERIAL - TOWABLE MANLIFTS AERIAL - BOOM UFTS

24 Isoom TOWABLE 35FT BATTERY $245.00 $245.00 $670.00 $1,500.00 NfC No 8id $357.00 $899.00 $1,937.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

25 IBOOM TOWABLE SOFT BATTERY $375.00 $375.00 $1,00000 | $2,100.00 N/C Mo Bid $395.00 $1,060.00 $2,316.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | Noid No 8id o Bid No Bid
AIR & ELECTRIC COMPRESSORS AIR & ELECTRIC COMPRESSORS

26 COMPRESSOR 175-195 CFM DSL TOW $105.00 $105.00 $263.00 $500.00 NfC No Bid $195.00 $395.00 $795.00 Mo Bid No Bid NoBid | WNowid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 [COMPRESSOR 375-425 CFM DSL TOW 125 PSI $210.00 $210.00 5651.00 $1,395.00 N/C No Bid $295.00 $595.00 $1,595.00 No Bid No &id No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
28 COMPRESSOR TOWABLE 750CFM DSL 5361.00 $361.00 SL18300 | $3,185.00 $125.00 No Bid $589.00 $1,597.00 $4,176.00 Mo Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Rid
] COMPRESSOR TOWABLE 900CFM DSL 5430.00 $430.00 $1,350.00 | $3,995.00 $125.00 No Bid $745.00 $1,917.00 54,792.00 No Bid No Bid HNo Bid No id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid

CARTS CARTS
30 CART UTV 2 PASSENGER DSL $140.00 $140.00 $315.00 $630.00 $75.00 No Bed $181.00 $384.00 $770.00 Mo Bid o Bid Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
31 CART LTV 4 PASSENGER DSL $145.00 $145.00 $325.00 5650.00 $75.00 No Bid $180.00 $410.00 $814 00 Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | Nowid No 8id No Bid Ko Bid
COMPACTION EQUIPMENT COMPACTION EQUIPMENT

3z PLATE COMPACTOR 100LB TO 199LE GAS $70.00 $70.00 $200.00 5475.00 N/C No Bid $8%.00 $225.00 $495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | Nogid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

33 PLATE COMPACTOR 200LB TO 299LB GAS $70.00 $70.00 $20 20 $475.00 ;c Nu aw $115.00 $295.00 $725.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid

34 PLATE COMPACTOR 200L8 TO 29918 REVERSBLE $130.00 $130.00 $375.00 5800.00 N/A No bid $115.00 $29500 $725.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid o Bid

15 PLATE COMPACTOR 300LB TO 39918 REVERSBLE $130.00 $130.00 $375.00 $800.00 N/C No Bid $125.00 $325.00 $795.00 No Bid Mo Bid Nao Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36 {RAMMER JUMPING JACK 100LB - 19918 GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $95.00 $275.00 5650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo eid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Nogid | Nosid No Bid

37 PLATE COMPACTOR 40018 TO 49918 REVERSBLE $130.00 5130.00 $375.00 $800.00 N/C No Bid $165.00 $425.00 $995.00 Ma Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No #id No Bid Mo Bid NoBid | Mo oid No Bid

38 PLATE COMPACTOR G00LE TO 699LB REVERSBLE $130.00 $130.00 $375.00 $800.00 NiC No Bid $165.00 $425.00 5995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No #id No Bid No Bid NoBid | WMo did No Bid o Bid

39 PLATE COMPACTOR 700LB TO 79918 REVERSBLE $130.00 5130.00 $375.00 $800.00 N/C No Bid $195.00 549500 $1,095,00 No Bid No 8id No Bid No 8id Ko Bid No Bid No Bid Ko Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid

40 PLATE COMPACTOR 1000 TO 1100LB REVERSBLE $175.00 $175.00 $485.00 $1,000.00 N/C No Bid $195.00 $495.00 $1,095.00 No Bid Ko Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

41 ROLLER RIDE-ON SMOOTH DRUM 1 TON GAS $225.00 $225.00 $530.00 41,150.00 $75.00 Mo Bid $245.00 $695.00 $1,695 00 No Bid No Bid No pid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

a2 ROLLER RIDE-ON SMOOTH DRUM 3 TON DSL $300.00 $300.00 $675.00 $1,475.00 $75.00 No Bid $325.00 $745.00 $1,895.00 o Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid o bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No 8id NoBid No Bid

43 ROLLER RIDE-ON SMOOTH SNG DRUM 5 TON DSL $375.00 $375.00 $1,140.00 | $2,850.00 $75.00 No Bid $425.00 5825.00 $2,450.00 Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

L] ROLLER RIDE-ON SMOOTH SHG DRUM & TON DSL 5430.00 $480.00 $1,300.00 | $3,32000 $75.00 No Bd $495.00 $995 00 $3,75000 No Bid No Bid MNo Bid No Bid | Mo Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
45 jRQlLER RIDE-ON SMOOTH SNG DRUM 11TON DSL $575.00 $575.00 $1,550.00 | $3,950.00 $75.00 No Brd $595.00 $1,195.00 53,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid
EARTH MOVING EARTH MOVING
46 MINI TRACK LOADER W/8 > G00LB CAP DSL No Bid No Bid Nao Bid No Bid No gid Mo Bid $237.00 $716.00 $1,611,00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
47 MINI-EXCAVATOR 2000-2999 L85 DSL ROPS $245.00 $245.00 $650.00 $1,400.00 $75.00 No Bid $251.00 $575.00 $1,450.00 Na Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid
43 IMINI-EXCAVATOR 3000-3995 LBS DSL ROPS £245.00 5245.00 $650.00 $1,400.0¢ $75.00 No Bid $289.00 $675.00 $1.550,00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No 8id
4 MENIEXCAVATOR 4000-4999 (BS DSL ROPS $315.00 $315.00 $7215.00 $1,550.00 $75.00 No 8id 5316.00 $750.00 $1,750.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid He Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
50 MINI-EXCAVATOR 5000-6999 LB5 DSL ROPS $275.00 $275.00 $575.00 $1,375.0¢ $75.00 No Bidl $305.00 $775.00 41,650,800 No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
51 MINI-EXCAVATOR 7000-8999 LBS DSL ROPS $280.00 $280.00 $675.00 $1,550.00 $75.00 No Bid 5395.00 $875.00 $1,795.00 Ho Bid Na Bid No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid Ho Bid No Bid Mo Bid
52 MINI-EXCAVATOR 9000-11999 L85 DSL ROPS $325.00 $325.00 $900.00 $1,775.00 $75.00 Ne Bid $399.00 $1.138.00 $2.613.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No id No Bid No Bid No Bid




NO. DESCRIPTION Hourly Rate | Dally Rate | Weekly Rate M::::" M“"i"::""" Hourly Rate | DallyRate | Weekiy Rate | Monthly Rate M°"L'::"°“ ":::;' Daily Rate| "':;';" M::::"' M°h:i::“°“ ":::' Daily Rate ‘”::;:"’ M::::'V M“"'F'L‘:"""
53 MINI-EXCAVATOR 12000-13999 LBS DSL ROPS $325.00 $325.00 $900.00 $1,775.00 $75.00 Mo Bid $450.00 $1,250.00 $2,850.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid
54 MINI-EXCAVATOR 14000-19000 LBS BSL ROPS $500.00 5500.00 $1,20000 | $2,200.00 $75.00 Na Bid 5545.00 $1,395.00 $3,150.00 No Bid o Bid Neo Bid No id No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
55 MINI-EXCAVATOR 14000-19000 LBS DSL CAB $500.00 $500.00 $1,20000 | $2,400.00 $75.00 No Bid $545.00 $1,395.00 $3,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bd
56 EXCAVATOR 28000-38000 LBS STD REACH $600.00 $600.00 $1,675.00 $3,875.00 $125.00 No Bid $695.00 $1,795.00 $4,695.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid Na Bid
57 EXCAVATOR 28000-38000 L85 REDUCED TAIL $600.00 $500.00 §1.675.00 | $3.875.00 $125.00 Mo Bid $825.00 $1,995.00 54,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
58 EXCAVATOR 3900042000 LBS 5TD REACH $675.00 $675.00 $1,750.00 | $3,950.00 5125.00 No Bid $995.00 62,395.00 $5,900.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No 8id No 8id
59 EXCAVATOR 43000-49999 LBS STE REACH $200.00 $700.00 $1,800.00 | 54,100.00 $125.00 No Bid $495.00 $2,395.00 $5,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
50 EXCAVATOR 43000-49999 L8S REDLCED TAIL $700.00 $700.00 $1,B00.00 | $4,100.00 $125.00 No Bid $995.00 $2,395.00 5$5,900.00 No Bid No Bid o 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
61 EXCAVATOR S0000-59999 LBS STD REACH 5800.00 $800.00 $2,100.00 | $4,650.00 $125.00 No Bid $1,195.00 $2,795.00 65,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

&2 COMPACT LOADER 1.0-1.4 YD STD BKT DSL 5425.00 $425.00 51,200.00 | $2,500.00 $75.00 No Bid $462.00 $1,241.00 52,919.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

&3 WHEEL LOADER 2.5.3.4 YO MP BKT bsL $550.00 5$550.00 $1,600.00 | $4,000.00 $75.00 No @id $725.00 $1,795.00 $4,895.00 No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

64 WHEEL LOADER 3.0-3 4 YO STD 8KT OSL $600.00 $600.00 $1,875.00 $4,350.00 475.00 No Bid $895.00 $1,995.00 $5,295.00¢ No Bid No Bid Wo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

[ WHEEL LOADER 3.5-3.9 YD ST BXT DSL $716.00 $715.00 52,322.00 | $4,350.00 $75.00 No Bid $995.00 $2,195.00 $5,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Neo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

66 WHEEL LOADER 4.0-4.5 YD $T0 BKT DSL $1,016.00 $1,016.00 $3,005.00 | 56,800.00 $125.00 No Bid $1,095.00 $2,395.00 $5,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid

57 WHEEL LOADER 4.0-4.5 YD MP BKT DSL $1,016.00 $1,016.00 $3,00500 | $6,995.00 $125.00 No Bid $1,075.00 $2,395.00 $5,995.00 No Bid No Bid No bid No 8id No Bid No 8id No 8id No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid

68 WHEEL LOADER 4.6-5.5 YD MP BKT DSL No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

69 WHEEL LOADER 4.6-5.5 YD STD BKT DSL No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid

E] SKIDSTEER LOADER 250-7S0LB ROPS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $237.00 $716.00 $1,611.00 Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

71 SKIDSTEER LOADER 1751-2099L8 ROPS $315.00 $315.00 $845.00 5157500 $75.00 No Bid $350.00 $895.0: $1,895.00 No Bid No 8id Ko Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72 SKIDSTEER LOADER 2400-29931B ROPS $350.00 $350.00 5900.00 5$1,895.00 $75.00 No Bid $371.00 51,112.00 $2,421.00 No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid

” SKIDSTEER LOADER 2100-2399L8 ROPS $350.00 $350.00 $900.00 $1,895.00 575,00 No Bid $395.00 $995 1) $2,195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid

74 COMPACT TRACK LOADER 2000-2399L8 ROPS $350.00 $350.00 $900.00 51,895.00 $75.00 No Bid $395.00 $995.00 $2,195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

75 COMPACT TRACK LOADER 2000-239918 ROPS. $350.00 $350.00 $3900.00 $1,895.00 £75.00 No Bid $395.00 $995.00 $2,195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

76 COMPACY TRACK LOADER 2400-2999LB ROPS $350.00 $350.00 $900.00 $1,895.00 $75.00 No Bid $425.00 51,095.00 §2,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid HNo Bid Mo Bid No 8id Mo Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid

” COMPACT TRACK LOADER 2400-2999LB ROPS $350.00 $350.00 $900.00 $1,895.00 $75.00 No 8id £425.00 $1,095.00 62,295 00 No Bid Ne Big No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

FORKLIFTS & ACCESSORIES & OTHER MATERIAL HANDLING EQUIPMENT FORKUFTS & ACCESSORIES & OTHER MATERIAL HANDLUNG EQUIPMENT

78 PALLET LIFT B000LE W/8 MANLAL No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19%.00 $347.00 3E28.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid Ko Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid
79 PALLET LIFT 450018 W/B ELEC $135.00 $135.00 $200.00 $585.00 NfC No Bid $392.00 $981.00 $2,952.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
80 STRAIGHTMAST RT FORKLIFT 60001LB AWD $336.00 $336.00 $840.00 $1,680.00 575.00 No Bid $405.00 $1,011.00 $2526.00 No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
81 STRAIGHTMAST AT FORKLIET BOOOLB ZWD $439.00 5439.00 $988.00 $1,975.00 575.00 No Bid 5405.00 $1,011.00 $2,526.00 No Bid No Bid Ho 8id No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid
82 [STRAIGHTMAST RT FORKLIFT B000LB 4WD $439.00 $439.00 $988.00 $1,795.00 $75.00 No Bid $433.00 $1,044.00 $2,575.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ko Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Rid No Bid
83 TELEHANDLER S5008 16-20FT LIFT ROPS $375.00 $375.00 $785.00 $1,550.00 $75.00 No Bid $350.00 5950.00 $1,850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
BA TELEHANDLER 55004 16-20FT LIFT ROPS £375.00 $375.00 $785.00 $1,550.00 $75.00 No Bid $350.00 $950.00 $1,850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
85 TELEHANDLER 50004 42-44FT LIFT ROPS $390.00 $390.00 $985.00 $1,875.00 $75.00 No Bid 5425.00 $1,050.00 $2,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
86 TELEHANDLER 60008 34-36FT LIFT ROPS $390.00 $390.00 $985.00 $1,875.00 $75.00 o Bid $495.00 $1,195.00 $2,195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
87 TELEHANDLER BOOOS 42-44FT LIFT ROPS $450.00 $459.00 5113500 | $2,100.00 $75.00 No Bid $252.00 $1,395 00 $2,595.00 No Bid No 8id o Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid
B8 TELEHANDLER 10000# 50-56FT LIFT ROPS $650.00 $650.00 $1,625.00 | $3,075.00 $75.00 No Bid $695.00 5$1,695.00 $3,995.00 No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
89 TELEMANDLER 12000¥ 55-SEFT LIFT ROPS 5750.00 $750.00 51,875.00 | $3,650.00 $75.00 o Bid $795.00 $1,995.00 $4,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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90 TELEHANDLER 120008 55-56FT LIFT CAB $750.00 $750.00 $1,875.00 | $3,650.00 $75.00 No Bid 579500 $1,995.00 $4,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 WAREHOWSE FORKLIFT SO00LB PNEU DF $230.00 $230.00 $575.00 $1,100.00 $75.00 No 8id $235.00 $667.00 41,416.00 No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Wo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

GENERATORS GEBERATORS
92 2KW PORTABLE GENERATOR $40.00 $40.00 $160.00 $395.00 N/C No Bid $62.00 $198.00 $487.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
93 SKW PORTABLE GENERATOR $60.00 $40.00 $195.00 $495.00 N/C No Bid $105.00 $345.00 $718.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
94 6KW PORTABLE GENERATOR 560.00 $60.00 $195.00 $495.00 N/C No 8id $108.00 $349,00 $730.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

95 20KW GENERATOR DSL $142.00 $142.00 $382.00 $850.00 NfC No Bid 5275.00 5549.00 51,636.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96 SSKW GENERATOR DSL $170.00 $170.00 5556.00 $1,725.00 NfC Ne Bid $374.00 $1,062.00 $2,457.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid
97 70KW GENERATCR DSL No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid 5418.00 $1,152.00 $2,658.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Neo Bid
9% :;if:,:?:‘r:::: e L i e L R AR B $415.00 $415.00 $1,154.00 | $3,550.00 5125.00 No Bid $800.00 $1,600.00 $9,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id
99 250KW GENERATOR DSL $492.00 5492.00 $1,595.00 | $4,286.00 $125.00 No Bid $1,082,00 52,185.00 $6,543.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

100 320KW GENERATOR DSL 5616.00 $616.00 $1,714.00 $51.00 $125.00 No Bid $1,163.00 $2,337.00 $7,011.00 Nao Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

101 1000KW GENERATOR D'SL $1,45.00 $1,445.00 $4,333.00 |$13.00000 | $400.00 No Bid $4,093.00 56,847.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

LIGHTING EQUIPMENT LIGHTING EQUIPMENT

102 LIGHT TOWER HORIZ MAST MAN NARROW BODY $83.00 583.00 $195.00 $389.00 N/C No Bid $125.00 $305.00 $668.00 Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

103 LIGHT TOWER VERT MAST MAN NARROW BODY $83.00 $83.00 $195,00 $389.00 NfC No Bid $325.00 $305.00 566500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

104 :sir ‘ . . u H":‘_N w; AHI H ": 5’ FyE NOUNT o $83.00 $83.00 $195.00 $389.00 N/C No Bid $125.00 $305.00 $668.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Nao Bid

PUMPS & ACCESSORIES PUMPS & ACCESSORIES
105 PUMP TRASH 2IN GaS $35.00 $35.00 $162.00 $367.00 N/C No Bid $51.00 $123.00 4371.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Nao Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
106 PUMP SUBMERSIBLE 2HP IBH 450V 2IN €LEC $37.00 $372.00 $118.00 $345.00 N/C No Bid $63.00 5155.00 $390.00 No Bid No bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid o Bid
107 PUMP TRASH 31N GAS $40.00 $40.00 $165.00 $370.00 NfC No Bid $60.00 $181.00 $541.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Nao Bid No Bid No Bid
ROAD GRADERS ROAD GRADERS
108 ROAD GRADER 130-139HP DSt I $1,010.00 $1,010.00 | 52,535.00 st,ass.oo l N/C l No Bid i No Bid No Bid T No Bid No Bid No Bid I No Bid No Bid LNa 8id r No Bid ' No Bid l No Bid No Bid No 8id JJ&) Bid
3 SAWS & ACCESSORIES SAWS & ACCESSORIES
109 CONCHETE CUTOFF SAW 12IN HAND HELD GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No 8id No Rid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1o CONCRETE PUSH W/B SAW 0-9 HP GAS Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ko Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
m CONCRETE CUTOFF SAW 14IN HAND HELD ELEC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid
112 CONCRETE PUSH W/B SAW 10-19 HP GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $132.00 $355.00 $847.00 Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid
1n3 CONCRETE BRICK SAW 14IN GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Brd No Bid No Bid No Bid
114 CONCRETE CUTOFF SAW 141N HAND HELD GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $103.00 $260.00 5$640.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
115 CONCRETE CUTOFF SAW 16IN HAND HELD GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $103.00 $260.00 5640.00 No Bid No Bid o 8id No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid
116 ICONCRETE SELFPROP W/B SAW 10-19 HP GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid $97.00 $284.00 $780.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1urz CONCRETE SELFPROP W/B SAW 20-29 HP GAS. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $170.00 $467.00 $1,067.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid
118 CONCRETE SELFPROP W/B SAW 30-39 HP GAS o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $184.00 £547.00 $1,295.00 No &id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
119 CONCRETE SELFPROP W/B SAW 40 + 49 HP DSL No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $281.00 $809.00 52,002.00 No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
120 CONCRETE SELFPROP W/B SAW 40 - 49 HP DSL No Bid o 8id No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid $322.00 $972.00 $2,071.00 No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid
SMALL TOOLS - AIR MOVING EQUIPMENT SMALL TOSLS - AIR MOVING EQUIPMENT
1 ROUND FLOOR FAN 42 $35.00 $35.00 $97.00 $226.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Big No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na fid Ne Bid
122 AIR HOSE W/FTNGS 400 PSI 2X50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid Na Bid No Bid
123 AIRMOVER 6 DIAMETER AIR $45.00 $45.00 $115.00 5295.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid RoBid Na Bd Nao Bid




Na. DESCRIPTION Hourly Rate | Dally Rate | Weekly Rate M::::Iy Moh::llz:tion Hourly Rate | Daily Rate | Weekly Rate | Monthly Rate Muh::liz:tinn H::'I:V Daly Rate wk: et:'v M::::lv Muh:f:ﬁo" "::;v Daily Rate w::‘:lv M::::lv Mobr::““
124 AIRMOVER 8 DIAMETER AIR S45.00 $45.00 $115.00 $296.00 $80.00 No Bid Na Bid No 8id No Bid No 8id Ko Bid Ne Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id
125 AIRMOVER 10 DIAMETER AIR $50.00 550,00 5145.00 $362.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
126 AIR SCRUBBER HEPA 500 CFM $55.00 $55.00 $175.040 $455.00 NfC No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id to Bid Mo Bid o Bid No Bid Na Bid o Bid No Bid
127 AIR SCRUBBER HEPA 2000 CFM $75.04) $715.00 $226.00 $795.00 N/C No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
128 BOARD ARROW FOLDING TRAILER 25-LIGHT $121.00 $121.00 $270.00 $598 00 5200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
129 FLOOR STRIPPER W/B 12018 ELEC No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Big No Bid No Bid Ko Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
130 BOARD MESSAGE VERTICAL FULL-SI2E 3-LINE 5200.00 $200.00 5515.00 $995.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid No gid No Bid Nao Bid No Bid No 8id Ne Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id
131 FLOOR STRIPPER W/B 42518 ELEC No 8id No Bid N Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid Ko 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No 8id No Bid o Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
132 FLOOR STRIPPER RIDE-ON BATTERY 230018 No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid
133 SWEEPER CONTRUCTION RIDE ON 3 WHEEL $255.00 5255.00 $720,00 $1,395.00 $75.00 No Bid Neo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo gid No 8id No Bid Ne Bid Ho 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid o 8id No Bid
134 [SWEEPER CONTRUCTION RIDE ON 4 WHEEL CAB $275.00 $215.00 $775.00 $1,745.00 $75.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid Mo Bid No Bid
135 FUEL TANK 800 GALLON 512500 5125.00 $355. 00 $1.150.00 $300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid
136 FUEL TANK 300 GALLON No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
137 FUEL TANK 500 GALLON 555.00 555.00 $195.00 $590.00 $300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
138 FUEL FANK 2450 GALLON No Bid No Bid No 8id Na Bid No Bid No 8id Ho 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ¥o Bid Ne Bid Wo Bid No Bid
128 WASHER 2000-1999 PSI GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid Ko Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
140 |WASHER 3000-3999 PSI HOT WATER GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No 8id N Bid Nao Bid Ne Bid Ho 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid
141 WASHER 2000-2999 PSI HOT WATER GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HNo Bid No Bid
142 WASHER TRAILER MNT 3000-4000P51 HOT GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No gid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid

TRENCHING EQUIPMENT TRENCHING EQUIPMENT
143 TRENCHER W/B TRACK 24IN GAS No Bid No Bid Ko Bid No Bud No 8id No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No gid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
144 TRENCHER W/B TRACK 36IN GAS No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id
145 TRENCHER W/B WHEEL 30IN GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
TRAILERS & ACCESSORIES TRAILERS & ACCESSORIES
146 TRAILER UTILITY 3000 L& No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
147 TRAILER STUMP GRINDER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Big No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No &d No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
148 TRAILER TILT 7000 LB No Bid No Bid No Bid o 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No @id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id
149 TRAILER UTILITY 7,000 LB No Bid Mo Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
150 TRAILER TILT 10,000 LB No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151 TRAILER FLATBED 10,000 L8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No gid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
152 TRAILER DROP DECK 10000 L8 No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No 8id Mo Bid No 8id Ko Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No iid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid
153 TRAILER FLATBED 14-15,000 L8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
154 TRAILER TILT 6000 LB No Bid No Bid N Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No bid Wo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Nao Bid No Bid No 8id No 8id No Bid Mo Bid
WELDING EQUIPMENT WELDING EQUIPMENY

155 WELDER STATIONARY 250 - 299 AMPS ELEC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
156 WELDER STATIONARY 400 - 449 AMPS ELEC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
157 WELDER STATIGNARY 300 - 349 AMPS ELEC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No 8id No Bid Ho Bid o 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
158 WELDER TOWABLE 400 - 449 AMPS DSL $125.00 $125.00 $255.00 §515.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid
159 WELDER TOWABLE 30 - 349 AMPS DSL $95.00 595.00 $225.00 $495.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No 8id Neo Bid Ro 8id Mo Bid Ro Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid
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CRANES LRANES
160 ]Earrv Deck Crane - Dual Fuel - 30,000 LBS 50 FT L No Biﬂ No Bid T No Bid & Bid LNO Birl No Bid L No Bid l o Bid I No Bid I No Bid No Bid ‘ No Bid [ No 8id | Ne Bid I Ko Bid l No BidLNo Bid I No Bid l HNo Bid I No Bid
DUMF TRUCKS DUMP TRUCKS
161 ll2'14 yd Dump Teuck I No Big No Bid I No Bid l No Bid l HNo Bﬂ No Bid L No BldT No Bid J No Bid I No Bid Mo Bid l No Bid W Bidﬁu EIdT No éd No Bid ] No Bid l No Bid | No Bid l No Bid
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