City of Coral Gables, Florida
Bid Tabulation {Corrected)

|78 No.: IFB 2025-011

|sid Titte: Rental of Heavy Equip
|Bid Opening Date: tune 13, 2025 @ 2:00 pm
{rrepared by: Andrea Fortella

Lowist Responsive and Responsible Bidder Deemad Non Responsive

VENDOR NAME Equipmentshare.cem, Inc. United Rentals {North America), Inc. Equipmentshare.com, Inc. United Rentals {North America), inc.
Vendor FEIN 472405753 86-0933835 47.2405753 BE- 0533835
Corporation Address/ Locations {Cowsty & S1abe]: c;:rl:bis:l:\:;:?zrm 0O First Stamdord Place, suite 700 Starford, CT 06902 c;:::bia::l::;lls);m 100 First Stamford Place, suite 700 Stamford, CT 06902
Lacal Preference Affirmed? No No No No
ST e No o o no
Vendor Contact [for this bid) Edgar Chardon Did not provide a contact for bid response. Contact in Infor is Daniel Cunningham Edgar Chardan pravide a contact for bid response. Contact in Infor is Daniel Cunni
Vendor Cantact Phone Number 786-575-1575 877-874-4468 786-575-1575 B77-874-4468
EendouConactiEmas Bygar s d eguigmentsharm com Qs @ com figanr.chasgion @ eQuigmantshira.com gavrants @ur com
wO.  |oEscRiPTION Hourly Rate | Daity Rate | Weekly Rate M::::"’ M"";'::'""“ Hourly Rate | OsilyRate | Weekly Rate | Monthly Aate M“;':':""“ ":a"":’ Daily Rate “':;:"’ "":::"" M"":::’:““" "::t'e"' Daily Rate “;::" M::::"' M“"'::““"
Equipment Description WITHOUT OPERATCR WITH OPERATOR
AERIAL - BOOM LIFTS AERIAL - BOOM LIFTS
1 BOOM STRANGHT ASFT JIE 4WD DsL 5350.00 $350.00 $750.00 $1,200.00 $75.00 No Bid $374.00 5985.00 5$1,995.00 No Bid Mogid | NoBid | NoBid | Noeid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NeBid No Bid
2 ,aooM STRAIGHT 40FT 4WD D5L $350.00 $350.00 $750.00 $1,200.00 $75.00 No Bid 534500 $845.00 $1,945.00 NoBid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | WNo®id | NoBid | NoBid No Bid
3 laooM ARTICULATED 45FT 4WD DSL $350.00 $350.00 $750.00 $1,200.00 $75.00 No Bid $374.00 $895.00 $1,995.00 No Bid NoBid | Nogid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid
4 IBOOM ARTICULATED ASFT )18 4WD DSL $350.00 5350.00 $750.00 $1,200.00 $75.00 No Bid $374.00 5895.00 $1,995.00 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No &id NoBid | NoBid | Nosid No Bid
5 IBOOM STRAIGHT 65FT JIB 4WD DSL $486.00 $486.00 5101500 | 5212500 575.00 No Bid $495.00 $1,095.00 $2,295.00 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | Nobid No Bid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | WNaBid No Bid
6 IBDOM ARTICULATED 60FT JIE 4WD BSL $486.00 $486.00 $1,015.00 | $2,125.00 $75.00 No Bid 495,00 $1,095.00 $2,295.00 No Bid NoBid { MNobid | moBid | Namid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | WNoBid No Bid No Bid
? IBOOM STRAIGHT 60FT WD DSL $486,00 $486.00 5L,01500 | $2,12500 $75.00 No Bid $450.00 $1,050.00 $2,150.00 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | WNoBid No Bid No Bid
] |BOOM ARTICULATED 60FT 2WD DF $486.00 $486.00 5101500 | $2,12500 $75.00 No Bid $495.00 $1,095.00 $2,295.00 No Bid NoBid | Noeid | Nogid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | MoBid NoBid | NoBid No Bid
4 IBOOM STRAIGHT 80FT 4WOD DF $640.00 $640.00 $1,640.00 | $3,150.00 $75.00 No Bid $745.00 $1,725.00 $3,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 BOOM STRAIGHT 80FT 4WD DSL $640.00 $640.00 $1,64000 | $3,150.00 $75.00 No Bid $145.00 $1,725.00 $3,295.00 No Bid No 8id No@id | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid No Bid Mo Bid
11 BOOM ARTICULATED 80FT §1B AWD DF $640.00 $640.00 $1,64000 | $3,150.00 $75.00 No Bid $795.00 $1,795.00 $3,450.00 No 8id NoBid | NoBid | MoBid | Nosid No Bid HoBid | NoBid | NoBid | Nogid No Bid
12 BOOM STRAIGHT B5FT JIB 4WD DSL $640.00 $640.00 $1,6a000 | $3.15000 $125.00 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | MNoBid No Bid
13 BOOM STRAIGHT 125FT JIB 4WD DSL $1,105.00 51,105.00 $2.855.00 | $6,200.00 $125.00 No Bid $1,295.00 $2,995.00 §7,295.00 No Bid NoBid | MoBid | NoBid | Mosid No Bid No Bid NoBid | MoBid No Bid No Bid
14 BOOM ARTICULATED 125FT 1B 4WD DS $1,105.00 $1,105.00 52,85500 | %6,200.00 $125.00 No Bid $1,295.00 52,995.00 §7,295.00 No Bid MoBid | MoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | Mogid No Bid No Bid
15 BOOM STRAIGHT 135FT JIB 4WD DSL $1,205.00 $1,205.00 $2,750.00 | $6,400.00 5125.00 No Bid $1,495.00 5$3,295.00 §7,995.00 No Bid MoBid | NoBid | MNoBid | Nobi No Bid NoBid | Mosid NoBid | NoBid No Bid
16 BOOM ARTICULATED 13SFT JIB 4WD DSt $1,205.00 $1,205.00 $2,750.00 | $6,400.00 $125.00 No Bid 51,495.00 $3,295.00 $7,995.00 NaBid NoBid | NoBid | Noeid | Nosid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid
17 |5CISSOR LIFT 19FT NARROW ELEC $100.00 $100.00 5125.00 54,325.00 $75.00 No Bid $115.00 $225.00 $450.00 No Bid NoBid | NoSid | NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid




No.  |DESCRIPTION Hourly Rate | Daily Rate | Weekly Rate "::::"' MOBBEERLION | Hourty Rate | Dally Rate | Weeky Rate | Monthiy Rate “"":'::'”" Pl [oaily Rate Foht M::::"' ”“rl':“"" Hourl Dy Rate “:f;:" Mt ”""'F"::“""
12 MAST LIFT 20FT DRIVABLE BATT $118.00 $118.00 $235.00 $460.00 $75.00 No Bid $199.00 $398.00 $622.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid
19 [MAST LIFT 30FT PUSH AROUND OUTR BATT $172.00 $172.00 $344.00 5687.00 575.00 No Bid 5202.00 $465.00 $837.00 No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid
20 SCISSOR LIFT 26 FT 32" WIDE ELECTRIC $135.00 $135.00 $215.00 $525.00 $75.00 No 8id 514500 $325.00 $695.00 No Bid NoBid | MoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No@id | NoBid | MoBid | NoBid No Bid
21 SCISSOR LIFT 26 FT 46" WIDE ELECTRIC $135.00 $135.00 $215.00 5525.00 $75.00 No Bid $145.00 $325.00 $695.00 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
22 MAST LIFT 40 FT PUSH AROUND QUTR BATT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $345.00 $630.00 $1,126.00 No Bid NoBid | MoBid | MoBid | MoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | MNoBid No Bid
23 SCISSOR LIFY 33 FT RT 69 IN DECK DSt 5250.00 $250.00 $575.00 $900.00 $75.00 No Bid $325.00 5695.00 51,395.00 Ho Bid Ne Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid Mo Bid
AERIAL - TOWABLE MANLIFTS AERIAL - BOOM LIFTS
24 IBOOM TOWABLE I5FT BATTERY 5245.00 $245.00 $670.00 $1,500.00 N/C No Bid $357.00 $899.00 $1,937.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
b3 IBOOM TOWABLE SOFT BATTERY $375.00 $375.00 $1,000.00 | $2,100.00 NfC No Bid $395.00 $1,060.00 $2,316.00 No Bid MNotid | NoBid | Nogid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NWoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid
AIR & ELECTRIC COMPRESSORS . AIR & ELECTRIC COMPRESSORS
26 COMPRESSOR 175-195 CFM DSL TOW $105.00 $105.00 $263.00 $500.00 NiC No Bid $195.00 $395.00 5795.00 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoRid | Nosid o Bid MoBid | MoBid | NoBid | NeBid No Bid
27 [COMPRESSOR 375-425 CFM 05L TOW 125 PSt $210.00 $210.00 $651.00 $1,395,00 N/C No Bid $295.00 §595.00 $1,595.00 Mo Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid [ MoBid No Bid NoBid { NoBid NoBid | NoBid No Bid
28 COMPRESSOR TOWABLE 750CFM DSL $361.00 $361.00 $1,183.00 | 3313500 5125.00 No Bid $589.00 $1,597.00 $4,176.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
n COMPRESSOR TOWABLE 900CFM DSL $430.00 $430.00 5135000 | $3,99500 $125.00 No Bid $745.00 $1,917.00 $4,792.00 No Bid NoBid | Mogid | MoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | MNobid | Nosid No Bid
CARTS CARTS
0 CART UTV 2 PASSENGER D5L $140.00 $140.00 $315.00 $630.00 $75.00 No Bid $161.00 $384.00 $770.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid | Nogid | MNoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid
£ CART UTV 4 PASSENGER DSL 5145.00 5145.00 $325.00 $650.00 575.00 No Bid $180.00 5410.00 5814.00 Ho Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HNo Bid NoBid | HNoBid Mo Bid
COMPACTION EQUIPMENT COMPACTION EQUIPMENT
32 PLATE COMPACTOR 100LB TO 1998 GAS 570.00 $70.00 $200.00 $475.00 N/C Ho Bid $85.00 5225.00 549500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
33 PLATE COMPACTOR 200LB TO 29918 GAS $70.00 $70.00 $200.00 $475.00 N/C No Bid $115.00 $295.00 $725.00 Mo Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | MoBid | MoBid No Bid
ET] IPLATE COMPACTOR 200L8 TO 29916 REVERSBLE $13¢.00 $130.00 $375.00 $800.00 N/A No 8id $115.00 $295.00 $725.00 No Bid NoBid | WNoBid | MoBid | NoBid No Bid Mo 8id NoBid | NoBid | Nogid No Bid
i5 PLATE COMPACTOR 300LE TO 399LB REVERSBLE $130.00 $130.00 $375.00 5800.00 NfC No Bid $125.00 $325.00 5795.00 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36 RAMMER JUMPING JACK 10016 - 19918 GAS No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $95.00 $275.00 $650.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | Nogid No Bid NoBid | MoBid MoBid | NoBid No Bid
37 PLATE COMPACTOR 400LB TO 45918 REVERSBLE 5130.00 5130.00 $375.00 $800.00 N/C No Bid 5165.00 $425.00 $995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Wo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
38 PLATE COMPACTOR 600LB TO 63918 REVERSBLE $130.00 $130.00 $375.00 $800.00 N/C No Bid 5165.00 $425.00 $995.00 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | MoBid | NoBid Mo Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid { MNoBid No Bid
39 PLATE COMPACTOR 700LB TO 799LB REVERSBLE $130.00 5130.00 $375.00 $800.00 NfC No Bid $195.00 $495.00 $1,095.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ap PLATE COMPACTOR 1000 TO 11008 REVERSBLE $175.00 $175.00 548500 $1,000.00 NfC No Bid $195.00 $495.00 $1,095.00 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | Nosid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | No@id | NoBid No Bid
41 ROLLER RIDE-ON SMOOTH DRUM 1 TON GAS 5225.00 §225.00 $530.00 $1,150.00 $75.00 No Bid $245.00 5695.00 $1,695.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42 ROLLER RIDE-ON SMOOTH DRUM 3 TON DsL $300.00 $300.00 $675.00 $1,475.00 $75.00 No Bid 5325.00 $745.00 $1,895.00 No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid
43 ROLLER RIDE-ON SMOOTH SNG DRUM S TON D51 5375.00 $375.00 51,14000 | $2,850.00 $75.00 No Bid $425.00 5825.00 $2,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
44 ROLEER RIDE-ON SMOOTH SNG DRUM 8 TON DSL $480.00 $480.00 $1,300.00 | $3,32000 $75.00 No Bid 549500 $995.00 $3,750.00 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBi No Bid Mo 8id NoBid | NoBid | WNoBid No Bid
as ROLLER RIDE-ON SMOOTH SNG DRUM 11TON D5L $575.00 $575.00 $1,550.00 | $3,950.00 $75.00 No Bid $595.00 $1,195.00 $3,150.00 No Big NoBid | NoBid | MNoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid
EARTH MOVING EARTH MOVING
46 MINI TRACK LOADER W/B > G00LS CAP DSL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid $237.00 5716.00 51,611.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid | MoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid No Bid
a7 MINI-EXCAVATOR 2000-2399 LBS DSL ROPS $245.00 $245.00 $650.00 $1,400.00 $75.00 No Bid $251.00 $575.00 $1,450.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
a8 MINI-EXCAVATOR 3000-3399 LBS DSL ROPS $245.00 $245.00 $650.00 $1,400.00 $75.00 No Bid $289.00 $675.00 $1,550.00 Ho Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid
49 MINI-EXCAVATOR 4000-4955 LBS DSL ROPS $315.00 $315.00 5725.00 $1,550.00 $75.00 No Bid $316.00 $750.00 51,750.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid NoBid | MaBid | NoBid No 8id
50 MINI-EXCAVATOR 5000-6999 LBS DSL ROPS $275.00 $275.00 $575.00 $1,375.00 575.00 No Bid $305.00 $775.00 $1,650.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
51 MINI-EXCAVATOR 7000-8999 LBS DSL ROPS $280.00 $280.00 $675.00 $1,550.00 $75.00 No Bid $395.00 $875.00 $1,795.00 No Bid NoBid | NoBid NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | WMoBid NoBid | Nogid No Bid
52 MINI-EXCAVATOR 5000-11999 LBS DSL ROPS $325.00 $325.00 $900.00 $1,775.00 $75.00 No Bid $399.00 51,138.00 $2,613.00 No Bid No Bid NoBid | MoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | wowid NobBid | NoBid No Bid




wo.  [oescarion Hourly Rate | Daily Rate | Weekly Rate M::::" M""'F'L’:"“" Hourly Rate | Dally Rate | Weekly Rate | Monthiy Rate M”:::‘:“"" "::t'e"' Daily Rate “::‘:" M::::'" M°"'F"::"°" ":a"t'e" Dally Rate “;::" M::::" "°"'F'::“°"
53 MINI-EXCAVATOR 12000-13932 LBS DSL ROPS $325.00 $325.00 $900,00 $1,775.00 $75.00 Ne Bid $450.00 $1,250.00 $2,850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid
54 MINI-EXCAVATOR 14000-19000 LBS DSL ROPS $500.00 $500.00 $1,200.00 $2,200.00 $75.00 No Bid $545.00 $1,395.00 $3,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
55 IMINI-EXCAVATOR 14000-19000 LBS DSL CAB $500.00 5500.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $75.00 No Bid $545.00 $1,395.00 $3,150.00 No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid
56 EXCAVATOR 28000-38000 LBS STO REACH $600.00 $600.00 $1,675.00 $3,875.00 12500 Mo Bid $695.00 $1,795.00 $4,695.00 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
57 EXCAVATOR 2800033000 LBS REDUCED TAIL $600.00 560000 $1,675.00 53,875.00 $125.00 No Bid 582500 $1,995.00 $4,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No 8id Mo Bid Ne Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
58 EXCAVATOR 39000-42000 L8S STD REACH $675.00 $675.00 51,750.00 $3,950.00 §125.00 No Bid $995.00 $2.395.00 $5,900.00 No Bid No Bid Ne Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
59 EXCAVATOR 43000-49999 LBS 5TD REACH $700.00 5700.00 $1,800.00 54,100.00 $125.00 No Bid $995.00 $2.395.00 $5,900.00 No Bid HNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
343 EXCAVATOR 43000-49993 LBS REDUCED TAIL $700.00 $700.00 $1,800.00 $4,100.00 512500 Mo Bid $995.00 $2,395.00 $5,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
61 EXCAVATOR 50000-59999 LBS ST REACH $800.00 SE£00.00 $2,100.00 $4,650.00 $125.00 Mo Bid $1,195.00 $2,795.00 $5,995.00 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id N Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
62 (COMPACT LOADER 1.0-1.4 YD $TD BKT DSt 5425.00 $425.00 $1,200.00 $2,500.00 $75.00 No Bid $462.00 $1,241.00 $2,319.00 No Bid Ne 8id No Bid No Bid Noa Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
63 WHEEL LOADER 2.5-3.4 YD MP BXT DSL 5$550.00 $550.00 $1,600.00 $4,000.00 $75.00 No Bid $725.00 $1,795.00 $4,895.00 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
&4 'WHEEL LOADER 3.0-3.4 YD $TD BKT DSL $600.00 $600.00 $1,875.00 $4,350.00 S$75.00 No Bid 5895 00 $1,995.00 §5,295.00 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid Mo Bid Ne Bid
65 WHEEL LOADER 3.5-3.9 YD STD BKT DSL $716.00 $716.00 $2,327.00 $4,350.00 $75.00 o Bid $995.00 $2,195.00 $5,495.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid
66 WHEEL LOADER 4.0-4.5 YD ST BKT DSt $1,016.00 $1,016.00 $3,005.00 56,800.00 $125.00 No Bid $1,095.00 $2,395.00 $5,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
67 WHEEL LOADER 4.0-4.5 YD MP BKT DSL $1,016.00 $1,016.00 $3,005.00 $6,995.00 5125.00 No Bid $1,075.00 $2,395.00 $5,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bidt
68 WHEEL LOADER 4.6-5.5 YD MP BKT DSL Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Nao Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
69 WHEEL LOADER 4.6-5.5 YD ST BKT DSL No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HNo 8id No Bid Mo 8id
70 SKIDSTEER LOADER 250-750LB RGPS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid 5237.00 $716.00 $1,611.00 HNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
71 SKIDSTEER LOADER 1751-2099L8 ROPS $315.00 5315.00 $845.00 $1,575.00 575.00 No Bid $350.00 $895.00 $1,895 .00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HNo Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72 SKIDSTEER LOADER 2400-2999LB ROPS $350.00 $350.00 $900.00 $1,805.00 575.00 No Bid $371.00 S$1,112.00 $2,411.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
73 SKIDSTEER LOADER 2100-23991LB ROPS $350.00 $350.00 $900.00 $1,895.00 $75.00 Mo Bid $395.00 $995.00 $2,195.00 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
74 COMPACT TRACK LOADER 2000-239818 ROPS $350.00 $350.00 $900.00 $1,895.00 $75.00 No Bid $395.00 599500 $2,195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
75 COMPACT TRACK LOADER 2000-2399LB ROPS $350.00 $350.00 $900.00 51,895.00 $75.00 No Bid 395 00 $995.00 52,195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7% COMPACT TRACK LOADER 2400-2999LB ROPS $350.00 $350.00 $900.00 $1,895.00 575.00 No Bid $425.00 $1.095.00 $2,295.00 No Bid Ne Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid
77 [COMPACT TRACK LOADER 2400-2999L8 ROPS. $350.00 $350.00 $900.00 §1,895.00 $75.00 No Bid §425.00 $1,095.00 $2,295.00 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid
FORKLIFTS & ACCESSORIES & OTHER MATERIAL HANDUNG EQUIPMENT FORKLIFTS & ACCESSORIES & OTHER MATERIAL HANDLING ECUIPMIENT
78 PALLET LIFT 8000L6 W/B MANUAL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $193.00 $347.00 SB28.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HoBid No Bid
79 PALLET LIFT 4500LB W/B ELEC $135.00 $135.00 $300.00 $585.00 NSC No Bid $392.00 $981.00 $2,952.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HNo Bid
80 STRAIGHTMAST RT FORKLIFT 600CLB WD 533600 $336.00 $840.00 $1,680.00 $75.00 Ho Bid $405.00 $1,011.00 $2,526.00 Mo Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
81 STRAIGHTMAST RT FORKLIFT 8000LB 2WD $439.00 5439.00 $988.00 $1,975.00 575.00 No Bid $405.00 $1,011.00 $2,526.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
82 STRAIGHTMAST RT FORKLIFT 800OLB 4WD 5439.00 $439.00 $988.00 $1.795.00 $75.00 No Bid $433.00 $1,044.00 $2,575.00 No Bid No Bid Mo 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
83 TELEHANDLER 55004 16-20FT LIFT ROPS $375.00 5375.00 $785.00 $1,550.00 $75.00 No Bid $350.00 $950.00 $1,850.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84 TELEHANDLER S500¥ 16-20FT LIFT ROPS $375.00 $375.00 $785.00 $1,550-00 $75.00 No Bid $350.00 $950.00 $1.850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
25 TELEHANDLER 6000 42-44FT LIFT ROPS $390.00 $390.00 $9B5.00 $1,875.00 57500 HNo Bid $425.00 $1,050.00 $2,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid
86 TELEHANOLER 6000# 34-36FF LIFT ROPS $390.00 $350.00 $985.00 $1,875.00 $75.00 Mo Bid 5495.00 51,195.00 $2,195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid
87 TELEHANDLER 3000# 42-44FT LIFT ROPS. $450.00 5459.00 $1,135.00 $2,100.00 $75.00 No Bid §252.00 $1,395.00 $2,595.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid HNo Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid
28 TELEHANDLER 100004 50-S6FT LFT ROPS. $650.00 $650.00 $1,625.00 $3,075.00 $75.00 No Bid $695.00 51,695.00 $3,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid HNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
89 TELEHANDLER 120004 55-56FF LIFT ROPS $750.00 §750.00 $1,875.00 $3,650.00 $75.00 No Bid 579500 $1,995.00 $4,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid
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90 TELEHANDLER 12000# 55-56FT LIFT CAB $750.00 $750.00 51,875.00 | $3.650.00 $75.00 No Bid $795.00 $1,995.00 $4,295 00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid NoBid | Nosid No Bid
9 WAREHOUISE FORKLIFT 500018 PNEU DF 5230.00 $230.00 $575.00 51,100.00 $75.00 No Bid $235.00 $667.00 $1,416.00 Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N Bid No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid

GENERATORS GEBERATORS
92 KW PORTABLE GENERATOR 540.00 $40.00 $160.00 $395.00 NjC No Bid $62.00 $193.00 549700 No Bid NoBid | NoBid | Nogid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid

93 SKW PORTABLE GENERATOR $60.00 540.00 $195.00 $495.00 N/C Ho Bid $105.00 $345.00 $718.00 No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No gid NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
94 EKW PORTABLE GENERATOR $60.00 $60.00 $195.00 $495.00 N No Bid $108.00 $349.00 5730.00 No Bid NoBid ( woBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | MNoBid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid
95 20KW GENERATOR DSL $142.00 514200 $382.00 $850.00 N/C No B 5275.00 $549.00 $1,636.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid NoBid Ho Bid

96 SSKW GEMERATOR DSL $170.00 $170.00 5556.00 $1,725.00 N/C No Bid $374.00 $1,062.00 $2,457.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No @id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid

a7 FOKW GENERATOR DL Mo Bid No 8id Mo Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid $418.00 $1,152.00 $2,658.00 No Bid No gid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

o8 :;im';?gwfrmu GENERATOR 3-PHASE AT 120/208 VOLTS ON $415.00 $415.00 $,15400 | $3,550.00 512500 No Bid $800.00 $1.600.00 $9,500.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

93 250KW GENERATOR DSL $492.00 $492.00 $1,595.00 $4,886.00 $125.00 No Bid $1,002.00 $2,185.00 $6,543.00 No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

100 I20KW GENERATOR DL $616.00 5616.00 $1,714.00 ﬁf $125.00 No Bid $1,168.00 $2,337.00 $7,011.00 No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid
101 1000KW GENERATOR DSL $1,445.00 51,445.00 54,333.00  [$13.000.00 | 5400.00 Nao Bid $4,093.00 $6,847.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
LIGHTING EQUIPMENT LIGHTING EQUIPMENT
102 LIGHT TOWER HORIZ MAST MAN NARROW BODY $83.00 $83.00 $195.00 $382.00 W/ No Bid 5125.00 $305.00 $668.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
LIGHT TOWER VERT MAST MAN MARROW BODY $83.00 $83.00 5195.00 $389.00 N/C No Bid $325.00 $305.00 $665.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$83.00 583.00 $195.00 $389.00 N/C No Bid 512500 $305.00 $668.00 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid
PUMPS & ACCESSORIES PUMPS & ACCESSORIES
105 PUMP TRASH 2IN GAS $35.00 $35.00 $162.00 $367.00 HfC Na Bid 551.00 $123.00 5371.00 No Bid NoGid | NoBid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid
106 PUMP SUBMERSIBLE ZHP 3PH 460V 2IN ELEC $37.00 537.00 5128.00 $345.00 N/C No Bid $63.00 $155.00 $390.00 No Bid Mo Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
107 PUMP TRASH 3IN GAS 540.00 $40.00 $165.00 5370.00 NfC No Bid $60.00 $181.00 $541.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid
ROAD GRADERS ROAD GRADERS
108 ROAD GRADER 130-139HP DSL $1,010.00 | $1,010.00 | $2,535.00 | 56,365.00 | NfC No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No gid No Bid No Bid l No Bid No Bid | Mo Bid ’ Ho 8id Ne Bid No Bid
SAWS & ACCESSORIES SAWS & ACCESSORIES
109 [CONCRETE CUTOFF SAW 121N HAND HELD GAS No Bid NoBid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid No bid Mo Bid No Bid
110 CONCRETE PUSH W/B SAW 0-9 HP GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid
111 CONCRETE CUTOFF SAW K4IN HAND HELD ELEC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid N Bid No Bid
1n2 CONCRETE PUSH W/B SAW 10-19 HP GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid s132.00 $355.00 $847.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid HoBid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 CONCRETE BRICK SAW 14IN GAS No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid HoBid No Bid
14 [CONCRETE CUTOFF SAW 14IN HAND HELD GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $103.00 $260.00 $640.00 No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid N Bid No Bid
115 CONCRETE CUTORF 5AW 161N HAND HELD GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5103.00 $260.00 5640.00 No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Neo Bid Mo Bid No Bid
116 CONCRETE SELFPROP W/B SAW 1019 HP GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid 597.00 $284.00 $780.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid Na Bid No Bid
nz ICONCRETE SELFPROP W/B SAW 20-29 HP GAS Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id Ho Bid $170.00 5467.00 $1,057.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No 8id No Bid Nogid No Bid
118 CONCRETE SELFPROP W/B SAW 30-39 HP GAS Mo Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid $184.00 $547.00 5$1,295.00 No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid
1% [CONCRETE SELFPROP W/B SAW 40 - 49 HP DSL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $231.00 $809.00 $2,002.0¢ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
120 CONCRETE SELFPROP W/B SAW 40 - 49 HP DSL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $322.00 $972.00 $2,071.00 No Bid No 8id No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid Mo Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid
SMALL TOOLS - AIR MOVING EQUIPMENT SMALL TOOLS - AIR MOVING EQUIPMENT
121 ROUND FLOOR FAN 42 535.00 $35.00 $97.00 $226.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
122 AIR HOSE W/FTNGS 400 PSI 2X50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid
123 AIRMOVER 6 DIAMETER AIR $45.00 $45.00 $115.00 5295.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No@id [ NoBid | MoBid | Noek No Bid NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NuBid No Bid
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124 AIRMOVER B DHAMETER AIR 545,00 $45.00 $115.00 $296.00 580.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid
125 ARMOVER 10 DMAMETER AIR $50.00 550.00 5145.00 $362.00 58000 Ho Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid Mo Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
126 |AIR SCRUBBER HEPA 500 CFM $55.00 $55.00 $175.00 $455.00 N No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid NoBid | Nomid | NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBkd | MNoBid | Nosid No 8id
127 AIR SCRUBBER HEPA 2000 CFM $75.00 $75.00 $226.00 $795.00 N/C No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
128 BOARD ARROW FOLDING TRAILER 25-LIGHT 512100 $121.00 $270.00 $598.00 5$200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
119 FLOOR STRIPPER W/B 12008 ELEC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid N Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid
130 BOARD MESSAGE VERTICAL FULL-SIZE 3-LINE $200.00 $200.00 §515.00 $995.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
131 FLOOR STRIPPER W/B 42518 ELEC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No 8id Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
132 FLOOR STRIPPER RIDE-ON BATTERY 2300LB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid MoBid | MoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
133 SWEEPER CONTRUCTION RIDE ON 3 WHEEL $255.00 $255.00 $720.00 $1,395.00 $75.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Nogid No Bid No Bid Ho gid
134 SWEEPER CONTRUCTION RIDE ON 4 WHEEL CAB $275.00 5275.00 $775.00 51,745.00 $75.00 Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No 8id
135 FUEL TANX 800 GALLON $125.00 5125.00 535500 $1,150.00 $300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
136 FUEL TANK 300 GALLON No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
137 FUEL TANK 500 GALLON $55.00 $55.00 $195.00 $590.00 $300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
138 FUEL TANK 2450 GALLON No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
139 WASHER 2000-2999 PSI GAS Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid Ho Bid Mo Bid Ho 8id No Bid No Bid
140 WASHER 3000-3399 PSI HOT WATER GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
141 WASHER 2000-2999 PSI HOT WATER GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
142 WASHER TRAILER MNT 3000-4000PS| HOT GAS NoBid No Bid o Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
TREMCHING EQUIPMENT TRENCHING EQUIPMENT
143 TRENCHER W/B TRACK 241N GAS. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid Mo Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid
144 TRENCHER W/B TRACK 36IN GAS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id
145 TRENCHER W/B WHEEL 30IN GAS No Bid Na Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid
TRAILERS 8 ACCESSORIES TRAILERS & ACCESSORIES
146 TRAILER UTILITY 3000 LB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid Ha Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
147 TRAILER STUMP GRINDER No Bid o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
148 TRANER TILT 7000 L8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
149 TRAILER UTILITY 7,000 LB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o Bid No Bid HoBid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid
150 TRAILER TILT 10,000 LB No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151 TRAILER FLATBED 10,000 LB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Rid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid
152 TRAILER DROP DECK 10000 LE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No B No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid Mo Bid No Bid
153 TRAILER FLATBED 14-15,000 LB No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No it No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
t54 TRAILER TILT 6000 LB No Bid No Bid No Bid HoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne 8id No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
WELDING EQUIPMENT WELDING EQUIPMENT
155 WELDER STATHONARY 250 - 299 AMPS ELEC No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid No Bid No Bid
156 WELDER STATIONARY 400 - 449 AMPS ELEC No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Na Bid No Bid No Bid HNo Bid
157 WELDER STATIONARY 300 - 349 AMPS ELEC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ho 8Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid
158 WELDER TOWABLE 400 - 449 AMPS DSL $125.00 $125.00 $255.00 $515.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid | MoBid | NoBid No Bid No8id | NoBid | MoBi | NoBid No Bid
159 'WELDER TOWABLE 300 - 349 AMPS DSL 5$95.00 $95.00 $225.00 $495.00 $20.00 Ho Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8id No Bid No 8id No Bid No Bid No @id No Bid N Bid No Bid No Bid
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CRANES CRANES
160 lca"Y Deck Crane - Dual Fuel - 30,000 LBS 50 FT l No Bid I Na Bid l No Bid I Mo Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid ‘ No Bid ] No Bid I No Bid No Bid I Ne Bid I No Bid ’ No Bid I No Bid l HNo Bid I No Bid ] Ne Bid | No Bid | No Bid
DUMF TRUGK DUMP TRUCKS
161 llz' 14 yd Dump Truck l No Bid I No Bid I No Bid ' No Bid I No Bid I No Bid | Mo Bid I No Bid ' No Bid | Mo Bid No Bid l No Bid l No Bid I No Bid l No Bid | No Bid l Mo Bid I No Bid l Ne Bid | Mo Bid
NOTE:  This bid tabul is an Indication of prices only and not a determination of the ponsive, responsible bldders,
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