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GROUP 1 - LABOR POSITIONS

1 Equiprnont Operator I 4U5 526 55 $12,4U5.SS $45 45 $21,792.00 $4ff.99 $23,995 25 $37 47 $17.9e5 65 $33 US $10,224 55 $25.51 $12,244.Uc $25 Sc $13,920.00 $35 55 $16,000.00 $32 16 $15,436.50 No Bid

2 Maint enanco Worker I 405 $23.40 $1 1 .232.55 $44 15 $21 .192 55 $49.99 $23,955 25 $23 6U $1 1 .366 45 $27 35 $13,104 55 $21 US $10,464 00 $23.00 $1 1 .545 55 $35.00 516US$ SO $27 66 $13,276 US $34 91 $16,756.US

3 Sohd Waste Operator I 480 $23 45 51 t 232.55 NO BtD NO BID $40 65 $15,512 55 NO BtD $49 99 $23,995 25 $26 23 $12,595 45 $29 51 $14,164 US NO 510 $27 39 $13,147 25 $23.00 $1 1 .545 55 $35.00 516US$ 55 $36.6U $17,606 45 No Bid

4 SoidWastoWorker 480 $1950 $9,365.00 $36U5 $1766455 $49.99 $23,995.20 $2366 $11,356U5 $2607 $1209765 $24.32 $1167365 $2355 $1154555 $3500 516,05555 $26.00 $1240555 Noftid

TOTAL BID AMOUNT FOR GROUP 1 $44,3x4.UU $8U,16U.UU $s5,9eU.eU $53,259.2U $56,390.40 $47,529.6U $47,040.00 $67,250.00 $58,800.00 $16,756.eU

GROUP 2 - PROFESSIONAL I CLERICAL POSITIONS

t Accountantt 480 $2995 $14,352.50 $4333 025,75045 $3055 $1024555 $5015 $2457255 $40.99 $19,675.25 $397U $1959445 $3919 $tU,Utt.25 $30.52 $10,601 65 $3343 516,54645 $3000 $1445555 $3505 $1605555 $3354 $15,555.20

2 Administrative Assistant 165 $2S.SS 53.32US$ $25.99 $4,150 45 $26 30 $4,225 US $30 SB $6,552.00 $45 99 $7,35U 45 $20.32 $4,531 25 $36.40 $5,024 55 $27.61 $4,417 65 $23.10 $3,696.55 $26 55 54,160 55 $30 55 $6,cUc 55 $23.50 $3,652 US

3 Payrott Clark 165 $26.00 $4,160.00 $2U UU $4,625.US $27.42 $4,3U7 20 $45.t2 $6,419.20 NO BID $40 99 $6.SSU 40 $37.5B $6.012.BS $32 55 $5,205.55 $25.02 $4,503 25 $23.6U $3,7UB.80 $2B 55 $4,4U5 55 $3U.Sc $6.SUS.SS $27.3B $4,3B5.U0 NO BtD

4 Receptionist 160 $19.50 $3,120.00 $24 53 $3,524 U0 $23 46 $3,753 65 $34 56 $5,449 65 $37.99 $6,070 45 $23 65 $3,776 OS $24.70 $3,952.50 $23.63 $3,7Uc US $20.99 $3,359 40 $26 50 $4,165 55 $3U.SS $6.SUS SO $17.20 $2,752 SO

TOTAL BID AMOUNT FOR GROUP 2 $24,960.00 $33,502.45 $30,601.65 $42,033.60 $39,670.40 $33,414.40 $33,7e7.2U $3U,ee3.2U $26,889.60 $27,2$e.UU $35,540.00 $26,684.ex

Tatantaga LLC’s Total Bid Arncunt or Group t iicrrectnd to 05U,855 55 Uiddor’s respcnsesh005 ho acrcunt ot557,925.O9
Tatanraga LLC’s Told Bid Arncunt or Group 2 irorroited to 520,604 US Uiddor’s respcnseshcos thcarncuvt ots2c,500.aS

TarnpaSeriiiceCcrnpacy. inc , DUA Pairesettar Parscrnai Soecroas is rcnrespcnsiuo tcrfoturetc bid en di ilarns in Group t, per iFU Section t, paragraph r 4,
Morhod ctAoard.

3 Logacy Prctescicnd Sduricrrs, LLC is ncnrespcrsseto taiturorcrneerrhereqairad rninirnurn ctihreel3lycars in businass, por IFU Sccricrr 3lAllrt

Award Distribution

W5$tW’Narnf Ihn)ure

Date


