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State of Florida
Department of State

I certify from the records of this office that CORELAND CONSTRUCTION
CORP. is a corporation organized under the laws of the State of Florida, filed on
September 23, 1988.

The document number of this corporation is K33820.

I further certify that said corporation has paid all fees due this office through
December 31, 2026, that its most recent annual report/uniform business report
was filed on April 7, 2026, and that its status is active.

I further certify that said corporation has not filed Articles of Dissolution.

Given under my hand and the
Great Seal of the State of Florida
at Tallahassee, the Capital, this
the Seventh day of April, 2026

Tracking Number: 8954934646CC

To authenticate this certificate,visit the following site,enter this number, and then
follow the instructions displayed.

https://services.sunbiz.org/Filings/CertificateOfStatus/CertificateAuthentication
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LBT

Local Business Tax Receipt
Miami−Dade County Office of The TaxCollector

−THIS IS NOT A BILL − DO NOT PAY

BUSINESS NAME/LOCATION

RECEIPT NO.

EXPIRES

Must be displayed at place of business
Pursuant to County Code

PAYMENT RECEIVED
BY TAX COLLECTOR

Chapter 8A − Art. 9 & 10

OWNER SEC. TYPE OF BUSINESS

This Local Business Tax Receipt only confirms payment of the Local Business Tax. The Receipt is not a 
license, permit, or a certification of the holder’s qualifications, to do business. Holder must comply with 
any governmental or nongovernmental regulatory laws and requirements which apply to the business.

The RECEIPT NO. above must be displayed on all commercial vehicles − Miami−Dade Code Sec 8a−276.
For more information, visit mdctaxcollector.gov

3674026

CORELAND CONSTRUCTION CORP
C/O MONICA HERNANDEZ
QUALIFIER

196

CGC058444

SEPTEMBER 30, 2026CORELAND CONSTRUCTION
CORP
7335 SW 142ND TER
PALMETTO BAY, FL
33158-1612

Worker(s)

3838381

GENERAL BUILDING
CONTRACTOR

PTBTC-25-144686

RENEWAL

45.00
1

08/24/2025
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City of Coral Gables Contracts 

 
As of the submission of this bid proposal, below is the list of contract(s) Coreland Construction Corp. has 

performed for the City of Coral Gables: 

 

Concrete Slab Replacement – Fire Station No.2 Fueling Station – IFB 2024-035 

1. City Dept.:  Public Works Dept. 

2. Scope of Work:  Demolition/disposal of existing concrete slab at the Fueling Station and installation 

of new concrete slab, restoration of adjacent asphalt paving, re-paint metal curbs & bollards. 

3. Awarded | Current Contract Value: $ 64,652.87 | $ 91,764.27 

4. Effective Date | Term of Contract:  12/20/2024 | 45 days 

5. City Project Manager Info.:  Henry Rodriguez, PM / Off. 305-460-5059 | Cell 305-315-6657 

6. Proposer Contractor Type:  Prime Contractor 

7. Project Results:  As of this bid submission, project is 95% complete.  The only pending items are 

crack repairs and repainting of metal curbs & bollards. 
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INSTALLATION 

IFB# 2026-005 
 

 
 

City of Coral Gables Reference Form – Detailed Project 

Description 

 

2. Ojus Urban Area District New Pump Station D4-A (N. Miami Beach, FL) 

 

Project Description: The project consisted of furnishing all materials, labor, and equipment necessary to 

Construct Sewage Pump Station No. D4-A (NE 185th ST between Dixie HWY &  Biscayne BLVD).  

The scope of work consisted of: 

  Removal & disposal of construction & demolition material including asphalt pavement &  curb  

  Dewatering & disposal of product water, as necessary   

 Furnishing & installing 16” gravity sewer pipe (influent) & connection to the proposed 8” force mains 

  Furnishing & installing new concrete wet well and valve vault with concrete protective coating and top slab 

with water-tight H-20 loading steel galvanized access hatch for the wet well &valve vault  

  Furnishing & installing new dual 15 hp. submersible pumps &  related equipment, all piping, fittings and 

appurtenances for new pump station discharge and emergency connection  

  Furnishing & installing new control panel, electrical service &  main disconnect, motor connection box 

&  S.C.A.D.A. antenna  

  Installing concrete platform for electrical equipment &motor control box slab.  

  Installing RTU enclosure & coordinating with Miami-Dade Water & Sewer Dept.staff for the installation, 

start-up and testing of RTU  

 Site restoration including new asphalt concrete pavement, curb & gutter, valley gutter & sodding 

 Start-up &  testing 

 Other appurtenant &  miscellaneous items &  work as shown in plans necessary for a complete, satisfactory 

& fully functional installation. 
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Response For Supplier: Coreland Construction Corp.
Event # : 160-1

Name: Sanitary Sewer Submersible Control Panel Installation

Reference: IFB 2026-005

Description: The City of Coral Gables is seeking bids from experienced and qualified contractors to work at four (4)
separate sites, each involving the replacement of electrical and SCADA equipment along with other
related improvements as necessary to support overall system improvements.

Date created: March 31, 2026 9:55:38 AM EDT

Preview date: Q & A open date: February 27,
2026 8:00:00 AM EST

Open date: February 27, 2026
8:00:00 AM EST

Q & A close date: March 16,
2026 4:00:00 PM EDT

Close Date: 03/31/2026 02:00:00 PM EST Dispute close date:

Responded To: 86 Out of 86 Lines

Total Bid Amount: 829,898.94    Response Currency: USD

Line Responses

Line 1: Mobilization and demobilization - Riviera Pump Station
Description: Mobilization and demobilization - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: MOBILIZATION AND DEMOBILIZATION      Mobilization and demobilization

Long Item
Description:

Mobilization and demobilization - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 24,375.00 Extended Amount: 24,375.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

March 31, 2026 12:23:27 PM EDT Page 1
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Line 2: Storm water Pollution Prevention
Description: Storm water Pollution Prevention - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: STORMWATER POLLUTION PREVENTION      Storm water Pollution Prevention

Long Item
Description:

Storm water Pollution Prevention - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 4.00 Unit of Measure: WK

Bid Quantity: 4.00 Unit Price: 1,481.25 Extended Amount: 5,925.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 3: Startup and
Description: Startup and Testing - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: STARTUP AND TESTING      Startup and Testing - Riviera Pump Station

Long Item
Description:

Startup and Testing - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 16,270.63 Extended Amount: 16,270.63

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 4: As-Built Preparation & Certs
Description: As-Builts Preparation &Certs - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: AS-BUILTS PREPARATION & CERTS      Riviera Control Panel Replacement for Sewer Pump Station

Long Item
Description:

As-Builts Preparation & Certs - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 10,250.00 Extended Amount: 10,250.00

Event # 160-1: Sanitary Sewer Submersible Control Panel Installation

March 31, 2026 12:23:27 PM EDT Page 2
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No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 5: Clearing and Grubbing
Description: Clearing and Grubbing - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: CLEARING AND GRUBBING      Riviera Control Panel Replacement for Sewer Pump Station

Long Item
Description:

Clearing and Grubbing - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 5,000.00 Extended Amount: 5,000.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 6: Demolition of concrete
Description: Demolition of Concrete - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: DEMOLITION OF CONCRETE      Demolition of concrte

Long Item
Description:

Demolition of Concrete - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 1,875.00 Extended Amount: 1,875.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 7: Demolition of Electrical Equipment
Description: Demolition of electrical equipment - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: DEMOLITION OF ELECTRICAL EQUIP.      Demolition of Electrical Equipment

Long Item
Description:

Demolition of electrical equipment - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Event # 160-1: Sanitary Sewer Submersible Control Panel Installation

March 31, 2026 12:23:27 PM EDT Page 3
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Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 2,583.13 Extended Amount: 2,583.13

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 8: Limerock Base
Description: Limerock base - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: LIMEROCK BASE      Limerock Base

Long Item
Description:

Limerock base - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 55.00 Unit of Measure: SQY

Bid Quantity: 55.00 Unit Price: 90.00 Extended Amount: 4,950.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 9: Construction of Slab-on-Ground
Description: Construction of Slab-on-Ground - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: CONSTRUCTION OF SLAB-ON-GROUND      Construction of Slab-on-Ground

Long Item
Description:

Construction of Slab-on-Ground - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 4.00 Unit of Measure: CBY

Bid Quantity: 4.00 Unit Price: 1,437.50 Extended Amount: 5,750.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 10: Support Frame for Electrical Panels
Description: Support Frame for electrical panels - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: SUPPORT FRAME FOR ELECTRICAL PAN      Support Frame for Electrical Panels

Long Item
Description:

Support Frame for electrical panels - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Event # 160-1: Sanitary Sewer Submersible Control Panel Installation

March 31, 2026 12:23:27 PM EDT Page 4
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Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 6,583.13 Extended Amount: 6,583.13

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 11: Milling
Description: Milling - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: MILLING      Milling

Long Item
Description:

Milling - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 195.00 Unit of Measure: SQY

Bid Quantity: 195.00 Unit Price: 32.05 Extended Amount: 6,249.75

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 12: Pavement Restoration Type A
Description: Pavement Restoration Type A - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: PAVEMENT RESTORATION TYPE A      Pavement Restoration Type A

Long Item
Description:

Pavement Restoration Type A - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 55.00 Unit of Measure: SQY

Bid Quantity: 55.00 Unit Price: 104.55 Extended Amount: 5,750.25

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 13: Pavement Restoration Type B
Description: Pavement Restoration Type B - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: PAVEMENT RESTORATION TYPE B      Pavement Restoration Type B

Long Item
Description:

Pavement Restoration Type B - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Event # 160-1: Sanitary Sewer Submersible Control Panel Installation

March 31, 2026 12:23:27 PM EDT Page 5
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Quantity: 7.00 Unit of Measure: SQY

Bid Quantity: 7.00 Unit Price: 107.15 Extended Amount: 750.05

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 14: Site Restoration & Final Grading
Description: Site Restoration &Final Grading - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: SITE RESTORATION & FINAL GRADING      Site Restoration & Final Grading

Long Item
Description:

Site Restoration & Final Grading - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 2,500.00 Extended Amount: 2,500.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 15: Sod / Grass / Hedge
Description: Sod / Grass / Hedge - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: SOD / GRASS / HEDGE      Sod / Grass / Hedge

Long Item
Description:

Sod / Grass / Hedge - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 3,750.00 Extended Amount: 3,750.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 16: Attend panel manufacturer installation training
Description: Attend panel manufacturer installation training - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: ATTEND PANEL MANUFACTURER      Attend panel manufacturer installation training

Long Item
Description:

Attend panel manufacturer installation training - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Event # 160-1: Sanitary Sewer Submersible Control Panel Installation

March 31, 2026 12:23:27 PM EDT Page 6
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Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 1,708.13 Extended Amount: 1,708.13

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 17: Installation of OFE Submersible Control Panel
Description: Installation of OFE Submersible Control Panel, Antenna and Antenna Cable - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel

Replacement

Item: INSTALLATION OF OFE SUBMERSIBLE      Installation of OFE Submersible Control Panel

Long Item
Description:

Installation of OFE Submersible Control Panel, Antenna and Antenna Cable - Riviera Pump Station Control
Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 5,583.13 Extended Amount: 5,583.13

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 18: FPL Meter
Description: FPL Metter - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: FPL METER      FPL Meter

Long Item
Description:

FPL Metter - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: EA

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 2,458.13 Extended Amount: 2,458.13

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 19: Main Disconnect
Description: Main Disconnect - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: MAIN DISCONNECT      Main Disconnect

Event # 160-1: Sanitary Sewer Submersible Control Panel Installation

March 31, 2026 12:23:27 PM EDT Page 7
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Long Item
Description:

Main Disconnect - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: EA

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 4,208.13 Extended Amount: 4,208.13

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 20: Motor Connection Box & Junction Box
Description: Motor Connection Box &Junction Box - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: MOTOR CONNECTION BOX & JUNCTION      Motor Connection Box & Junction Box

Long Item
Description:

Motor Connection Box & Junction Box - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 2.00 Unit of Measure: EA

Bid Quantity: 2.00 Unit Price: 3,822.81 Extended Amount: 7,645.62

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 21: Electrical equipment appurtenances
Description: Electrical equipment appurtenances - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT APPURTENANC      Electrical equipment appurtenances

Long Item
Description:

Electrical equipment appurtenances - Riviera Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 30,212.85 Extended Amount: 30,212.85

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 22: Mobilization and Demobilization - Arvida Pump Station
Description: Mobilization and Demobilization - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Event # 160-1: Sanitary Sewer Submersible Control Panel Installation

March 31, 2026 12:23:27 PM EDT Page 8
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Item: MOBILIZATION AND DEMOBILIZATION      Mobilization and Demobilization

Long Item
Description:

Mobilization and Demobilization - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 30,587.50 Extended Amount: 30,587.50

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 23: Bypass Pumping Implementation
Description: Bypass Pumping Implementation - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: BYPASS PUMPING (IMPLEMENTATION)      Bypass Pumping

Long Item
Description:

Bypass Pumping Implementation - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 13,352.69 Extended Amount: 13,352.69

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 24: Bypass Pumping and Maintenance
Description: Bypass Pumping Maintenance and Monitoring - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: BYPASS PUMPING MAINTENANCE      Bypass Pumping and Maintenance

Long Item
Description:

Bypass Pumping Maintenance and Monitoring - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 4.00 Unit of Measure: WK

Bid Quantity: 4.00 Unit Price: 4,927.88 Extended Amount: 19,711.52

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 25: Stormwater Pollution Prevention Plan
Description: Stormwater Pollution Prevention Plan - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement
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Item: STORMWATER POLLUTION PREVENTION      Stormwater Pollution Prevention Plan

Long Item
Description:

Stormwater Pollution Prevention Plan - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 4.00 Unit of Measure: WK

Bid Quantity: 4.00 Unit Price: 1,481.25 Extended Amount: 5,925.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 26: Startup and Testing
Description: Startup and Testing - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: STARTUP AND TESTING      Startup and Testing

Long Item
Description:

Startup and Testing - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 16,270.63 Extended Amount: 16,270.63

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 27: As-Built Preparation & Cert
Description: As-Built Preparation &Cert - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: AS-BUILTS PREPARATION & CERT      As-Built Preparation & Cert

Long Item
Description:

As-Built Preparation & Cert - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 13,875.00 Extended Amount: 13,875.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 28: Clearing and Grubbing
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Description: Clearing and Grubbing - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: CLEARING AND GRUBBING      Clearing and Grubbing

Long Item
Description:

Clearing and Grubbing - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 5,000.00 Extended Amount: 5,000.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 29: Demolition of Concrete
Description: Demolition of Concrete - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: DEMOLITION OF CONCRETE      Demolition of Concrete

Long Item
Description:

Demolition of Concrete - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 1,250.00 Extended Amount: 1,250.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 30: Demolition of Electrical Equipment
Description: Demolition of Electrical Equipment - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: DEMOLITION OF ELECTRICAL EQUIP      Demolition of Electrical Equipment

Long Item
Description:

Demolition of Electrical Equipment - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 2,833.13 Extended Amount: 2,833.13

No Charge: No No Bid: No
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Line 31: Trenching
Description: Trenching - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: TRENCHING      Trenching

Long Item
Description:

Trenching - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 5,509.38 Extended Amount: 5,509.38

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 32: Limerock Base
Description: Limerock Base - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: LIMEROCK BASE      Limerock Base

Long Item
Description:

Limerock Base - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 15.00 Unit of Measure: SQY

Bid Quantity: 15.00 Unit Price: 90.00 Extended Amount: 1,350.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 33: Construction of Slab-on-ground
Description: Construction of Slab-on-ground - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: CONSTRUCTION OF SLAB-ON-GROUND      Construction of Slab-on-ground

Long Item
Description:

Construction of Slab-on-ground - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 8.00 Unit of Measure: CBY

Bid Quantity: 8.00 Unit Price: 1,359.38 Extended Amount: 10,875.04

No Charge: No No Bid: No
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Line 34: Support Frame for Electrical Panel
Description: Support Frame for Electrical Panel - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: SUPPORT FRAME FOR ELECTRICAL PAN      Support Frame for Electrical Panel

Long Item
Description:

Support Frame for Electrical Panel - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 4,551.88 Extended Amount: 4,551.88

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 35: Milling
Description: Milling - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: MILLING      Milling

Long Item
Description:

Milling - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 15.00 Unit of Measure: SQY

Bid Quantity: 15.00 Unit Price: 183.33 Extended Amount: 2,749.95

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 36: Pavement Restoration Type I
Description: Pavement Restoration Type I - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: PAVEMENT RESTORATION TYPE I      Pavement Restoration Type I

Long Item
Description:

Pavement Restoration Type I - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 15.00 Unit of Measure: SQY

Bid Quantity: 15.00 Unit Price: 66.68 Extended Amount: 1,000.20
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No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 37: Pavement Restoration Type V
Description: Pavement Restoration Type V - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: PAVEMENT RESTORATION TYPE V      Pavement Restoration Type V

Long Item
Description:

Pavement Restoration Type V - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 15.00 Unit of Measure: SQY

Bid Quantity: 15.00 Unit Price: 83.33 Extended Amount: 1,249.95

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 38: Site Restoration & Final Grading
Description: Site Restoration &Final Grading - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: SITE RESTORATION & FINAL GRADING      Site Restoration & Final Grading

Long Item
Description:

Site Restoration & Final Grading - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 2,500.00 Extended Amount: 2,500.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 39: Sod / Grass / Hedges
Description: Sod / Grass / Hedges - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: SOD / GRASS / HEDGES      Sod / Grass / Hedges

Long Item
Description:

Sod / Grass / Hedges - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS
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Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 2,250.00 Extended Amount: 2,250.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 41: Installation of OFE Submersible Control Panel
Description: Installation of OFE Submersible Control Panel - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: INSTALLATION OF OFE SUBMERSIBLE      Installation of OFE Submersible Control Panel

Long Item
Description:

Installation of OFE Submersible Control Panel - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 7,020.63 Extended Amount: 7,020.63

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 42: FPL Meter
Description: FPL Meter - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: FPL METER      FPL Meter

Long Item
Description:

FPL Meter - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: EA

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 2,145.63 Extended Amount: 2,145.63

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 43: Main Disconnect
Description: Main Disconnect - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: MAIN DISCONNECT      Main Disconnect

Long Item
Description:

Main Disconnect - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: EA
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Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 5,395.63 Extended Amount: 5,395.63

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 44: Motor Connection Box & Junction Box
Description: Motor Connection Box &Junction Box - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: MOTOR CONNECTION BOX & JUNCTION      Motor Connection Box & Junction Box

Long Item
Description:

Motor Connection Box & Junction Box - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 2.00 Unit of Measure: EA

Bid Quantity: 2.00 Unit Price: 8,229.06 Extended Amount: 16,458.12

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 45: Electrical Equipment Appurtenances
Description: Electrical Equipment Appurtenances - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Item: ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT APPURTENANC      Electrical Equipment Appurtenances

Long Item
Description:

Electrical Equipment Appurtenances - Arvida Pump Station Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 41,282.83 Extended Amount: 41,282.83

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 46: Mobilization and Demobilization - Pump Station 1
Description: Mobilization and Demobilization - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement

Item: MOBILIZATION AND DEMOBILIZATION      Mobilization and Demobilization

Long Item
Description:

Mobilization and Demobilization - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS
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Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 54,125.00 Extended Amount: 54,125.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 47: Bypass Pumping Implementation
Description: Bypass Pumping Implementation - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement

Item: BYPASS PUMPING (IMPLEMENTATION)      Bypass Pumping Implementation

Long Item
Description:

Bypass Pumping Implementation - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 13,352.69 Extended Amount: 13,352.69

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 48: Bypass Pumping Maintenance and Monitoring
Description: Bypass Pumping Maintenance and Monitoring - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement

Item: BYPASS PUMPING MAINTENANCE      Bypass Pumping Maintenance and Monitoring

Long Item
Description:

Bypass Pumping Maintenance and Monitoring - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 4.00 Unit of Measure: WK

Bid Quantity: 4.00 Unit Price: 4,927.88 Extended Amount: 19,711.52

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 49: Stormwater Pollution Prevention
Description: Stormwater Pollution Prevention - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement

Item: STORMWATER POLLUTION PREVENTION      Stormwater Pollution Prevention

Long Item
Description:

Stormwater Pollution Prevention - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement
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Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 4.00 Unit of Measure: WK

Bid Quantity: 4.00 Unit Price: 1,481.25 Extended Amount: 5,925.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 50: Startup and Testing
Description: Startup and Testing - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement

Item: STARTUP AND TESTING      Startup and Testing

Long Item
Description:

Startup and Testing - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 16,270.63 Extended Amount: 16,270.63

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 51: As-Builts Preparation and Certs
Description: As-Builts Preparation and Certs - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement

Item: AS-BUILTS PREPARATION & CERT      As-Builts Preparation and Certs

Long Item
Description:

As-Builts Preparation and Certs - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 15,625.00 Extended Amount: 15,625.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 52: Clearing and Grubbing
Description: Clearing and Grubbing - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement

Item: CLEARING AND GRUBBING      Clearing and Grubbing

Long Item Clearing and Grubbing - Pump Station 1 Control Panel replacement
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Description:

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 5,000.00 Extended Amount: 5,000.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 53: Demolition of Concrete
Description: Demolition of Concrete - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: DEMOLITION OF CONCRETE      Demolition of Concrete

Long Item
Description:

Demolition of Concrete - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 1,875.00 Extended Amount: 1,875.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 54: Demolition of Electrical Equipment
Description: Demolition of Electrical Equipment - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: DEMOLITION OF ELECTRICAL EQUIP      Demolition of Electrical Equipment

Long Item
Description:

Demolition of Electrical Equipment - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 3,208.13 Extended Amount: 3,208.13

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 55: Trenching
Description: Trenching - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: TRENCHING      Trenching
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Long Item
Description:

Trenching - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 7,883.13 Extended Amount: 7,883.13

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 56: Limerock Base
Description: Limerock Base - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: LIMEROCK BASE      Limerock Base

Long Item
Description:

Limerock Base - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 15.00 Unit of Measure: SQY

Bid Quantity: 15.00 Unit Price: 90.00 Extended Amount: 1,350.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 57: Construction of slab-on-ground
Description: Construction of slab-on-ground - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: CONSTRUCTION OF SLAB-ON-GROUND      Construction of slab-on-ground

Long Item
Description:

Construction of slab-on-ground - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 3.00 Unit of Measure: CBY

Bid Quantity: 3.00 Unit Price: 1,916.68 Extended Amount: 5,750.04

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 58: Support Frame for Electrical Panel
Description: Support Frame for Electrical Panel - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement
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Item: SUPPORT FRAME FOR ELECTRICAL PAN      Support Frame for Electrical Panel

Long Item
Description:

Support Frame for Electrical Panel - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 6,426.88 Extended Amount: 6,426.88

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 59: Milling
Description: Milling - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: MILLING      Milling

Long Item
Description:

Milling - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 15.00 Unit of Measure: SQY

Bid Quantity: 15.00 Unit Price: 183.33 Extended Amount: 2,749.95

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 60: Pavement Restoration Type I
Description: Pavement Restoration Type I - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: PAVEMENT RESTORATION TYPE I      Pavement Restoration Type I

Long Item
Description:

Pavement Restoration Type I - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 15.00 Unit of Measure: SQY

Bid Quantity: 15.00 Unit Price: 66.68 Extended Amount: 1,000.20

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 61: Pavement Restoration Type V
Description: Pavement Restoration Type V - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement
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Item: PAVEMENT RESTORATION TYPE V      Pavement Restoration Type V

Long Item
Description:

Pavement Restoration Type V - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 15.00 Unit of Measure: SQY

Bid Quantity: 15.00 Unit Price: 66.68 Extended Amount: 1,000.20

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 62: Type F Curb and Gutter
Description: Type F Curb and Gutter - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: TYPE F CURB AND GUTTER      Type F Curb and Gutter

Long Item
Description:

Type F Curb and Gutter - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 20.00 Unit of Measure: LINF

Bid Quantity: 20.00 Unit Price: 62.50 Extended Amount: 1,250.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 63: Site Restoration & Final Grading
Description: Site Restoration &Final Grading - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: SITE RESTORATION & FINAL GRADING      Site Restoration & Final Grading

Long Item
Description:

Site Restoration & Final Grading - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 2,500.00 Extended Amount: 2,500.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 64: Sod / Grass / Hedges
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Description: Sod / Grass / Hedges - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: SOD / GRASS / HEDGE      Sod / Grass / Hedges

Long Item
Description:

Sod / Grass / Hedges - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 1,125.00 Extended Amount: 1,125.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 66: Installation of  Control Panel, antenna and A
Description: Installation of Control Panel, antenna and Antenna Cable - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: INSTALLATION OF CONTROL PANEL      Installation of Control Panel, antenna and A

Long Item
Description:

Installation of Control Panel, antenna and Antenna Cable - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 9,189.38 Extended Amount: 9,189.38

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 67: FPL Meter
Description: FPL Meter - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: FPL METER      FPL Meter

Long Item
Description:

FPL Meter - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: EA

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 2,145.63 Extended Amount: 2,145.63

No Charge: No No Bid: No
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Line 68: Main Disconnect
Description: Main Disconnect - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: MAIN DISCONNECT      Main Disconnect

Long Item
Description:

Main Disconnect - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: EA

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 5,395.63 Extended Amount: 5,395.63

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 69: Motor Connection Box and Junction Box
Description: Motor Connection Box and Junction Box - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: MOTOR CONNECTION BOX & JUNCTION      Motor Connection Box and Junction Box

Long Item
Description:

Motor Connection Box and Junction Box - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 2.00 Unit of Measure: EA

Bid Quantity: 2.00 Unit Price: 8,385.31 Extended Amount: 16,770.62

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 70: Electrical Equipment Appurtenances
Description: Electrical Equipment Appurtenances - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Item: ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT APPURTENANC      Electrical Equipment Appurtenances

Long Item
Description:

Electrical Equipment Appurtenances - Pump Station 1 Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 41,324.43 Extended Amount: 41,324.43

No Charge: No No Bid: No
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Line 71: Mobilization and Demobilization - Pump Station G
Description: Mobilization and Demobilization - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: MOBILIZATION AND DEMOBILIZATION      Mobilization and Demobilization

Long Item
Description:

Mobilization and Demobilization - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 31,500.00 Extended Amount: 31,500.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 72: Bypass Pumping Implementation
Description: Bypass Pumping Implementation - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: BYPASS PUMPING (IMPLEMENTATION)      Bypass Pumping Implementation

Long Item
Description:

Bypass Pumping Implementation - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 13,352.69 Extended Amount: 13,352.69

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 73: Bypass Pumping Maintenance and Monitoring
Description: Bypass Pumping Maintenance and Monitoring - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: BYPASS PUMPING MAINTENANCE      Bypass Pumping Maintenance and Monitoring

Long Item
Description:

Bypass Pumping Maintenance and Monitoring - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 4.00 Unit of Measure: WK

Bid Quantity: 4.00 Unit Price: 4,927.88 Extended Amount: 19,711.52
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No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 74: Stormwater Pollution Prevention
Description: Stormwater Pollution Prevention - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: STORMWATER POLLUTION PREVENTION      Stormwater Pollution Prevention

Long Item
Description:

Stormwater Pollution Prevention - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 4.00 Unit of Measure: WK

Bid Quantity: 4.00 Unit Price: 1,481.25 Extended Amount: 5,925.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 75: Startup and Testing
Description: Startup and Testing - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: STARTUP AND TESTING      Startup and Testing

Long Item
Description:

Startup and Testing - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 16,145.63 Extended Amount: 16,145.63

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 76: As-Built Preparation and Certs
Description: As-Built Preparation and Certs - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: AS-BUILTS PREPARATION & CERT      As-Built Preparation and Certs

Long Item
Description:

As-Built Preparation and Certs - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS
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Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 14,375.00 Extended Amount: 14,375.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 77: Clearing and Grubbing
Description: Clearing and Grubbing - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: CLEARING AND GRUBBING      Clearing and Grubbing

Long Item
Description:

Clearing and Grubbing - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 5,000.00 Extended Amount: 5,000.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 78: Demolition of Concrete
Description: Demolition of Concrete - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: DEMOLITION OF CONCRETE      Demolition of Concrete

Long Item
Description:

Demolition of Concrete - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 3,000.00 Extended Amount: 3,000.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 79: Demolition of Electrical Equipment
Description: Demolition of Electrical Equipment - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: DEMOLITION OF ELECTRICAL EQUIP      Demolition of Electrical Equipment

Long Item
Description:

Demolition of Electrical Equipment - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS
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Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 4,708.13 Extended Amount: 4,708.13

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 80: Construction of Slab-on-ground
Description: Construction of Slab-on-ground - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: CONSTRUCTION OF SLAB-ON-GROUND      Construction of Slab-on-ground

Long Item
Description:

Construction of Slab-on-ground - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 4.00 Unit of Measure: CBY

Bid Quantity: 4.00 Unit Price: 1,437.50 Extended Amount: 5,750.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 81: Support Frame for Electrical Panel
Description: Support Frame for Electrical Panel - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: SUPPORT FRAME FOR ELECTRICAL PAN      Support Frame for Electrical Panel

Long Item
Description:

Support Frame for Electrical Panel - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 5,551.88 Extended Amount: 5,551.88

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 82: Site Restoration & Final Grading
Description: Site Restoration &Final Grading - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: SITE RESTORATION & FINAL GRADING      Site Restoration & Final Grading

Long Item
Description:

Site Restoration & Final Grading - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS
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Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 2,500.00 Extended Amount: 2,500.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 83: Sod / Grass / Hedges
Description: Sod / Grass / Hedges - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: SOD / GRASS / HEDGE      Sod / Grass / Hedges

Long Item
Description:

Sod / Grass / Hedges - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 3,750.00 Extended Amount: 3,750.00

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 85: Installation of OFE Submersible Control Panel
Description: Installation of OFE Submersible Control Panel - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: INSTALLATION OF OFE SUBMERSIBLE      Installation of OFE Submersible Control Panel

Long Item
Description:

Installation of OFE Submersible Control Panel - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 10,239.38 Extended Amount: 10,239.38

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 86: FPL Meter - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement
Description: FPL Meter - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: FPL METER      FPL Meter - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Long Item
Description:

FPL Meter - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement
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Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: EA

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 2,145.63 Extended Amount: 2,145.63

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 87: Main Disconnect
Description: Main Disconnect - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: MAIN DISCONNECT      Main Disconnect

Long Item
Description:

Main Disconnect - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: EA

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 7,895.63 Extended Amount: 7,895.63

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 88: Motor Connection Box & Junction Box
Description: Motor Connection Box &Junction Box - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: MOTOR CONNECTION BOX & JUNCTION      Motor Connection Box & Junction Box

Long Item
Description:

Motor Connection Box & Junction Box - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 2.00 Unit of Measure: EA

Bid Quantity: 2.00 Unit Price: 8,541.56 Extended Amount: 17,083.12

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Line 89: Electrical Equipment and Appurtenances
Description: Electrical Equipment and Appurtenances - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement

Item: ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT APPURTENANC      Electrical Equipment and Appurtenances

Long Item Electrical Equipment and Appurtenances - Pump Station G Control Panel Replacement
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Description:

Commodity Code: 578-37      FLOOD CONTROL DEV EQ/ACC/PTS

Quantity: 1.00 Unit of Measure: LS

Bid Quantity: 1.00 Unit Price: 52,788.63 Extended Amount: 52,788.63

No Charge: No No Bid: No
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