City of Coral Gables, Florida
Bid Tabulation

ITB No.: 2023-017
Bid Title: Fire House No. 4 Construction Project
Bid Opening Date: September 27, 2023 @ 2:00PM

Prepared by: Nelvy Garcia

VENDOR NAME

Carivon Construction Company

John Beil Construction, Inc.

Vercetti Enterprises, LLC

MM

J

Wast Construction, Inc. Florids Lemark ¢ H.A. € Corp. HE Bullders Lanzo Construction Company
Vendor FEIN 65-0235237 81-1551021 81-4022045 59-2373403 $9 1809068 $9-2784516 $9-2283147 $6-2429411 56-2429411
12171 SW 131 Ave. 4000 SW 60 Court 7296 SW 48 5t 6201 SW 705t 1st Floor 820 Nonth 4 St 8750 NW 36 5t Suite 200 9500 NW 12 $t Bay 1 4478 Rainbow Ave 1255W S Count
[Corporation Address/ Locations [County & Statek Miami, FL 33186 Miami, FL 3315 Miami, fL 33155 Miaml, FL 33143 Lantana, FL 33462 Doral, Fi 33178 Dora), F1 33172 ‘Weston, FL 33332 Deerfield Beach, FL 33441
Miami -Dade County Miamk-Dade County Miami-Dade County Miami-Dade County Palm Beach Caunty Miami-Dade County Miami-Dade County Broward County Broward County
Local Preference? Coral Gables/ Miami-Dade County ND NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO
NM__ wﬂh..uﬂﬂﬂrwvhw M”.wz N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NfA N/A NfA N/A
[Vendor Contact (for this bid) Ivonne Munne Oscar Morejon Danlal Vercetti Pedro M. Muniila Matthew F West Heidi N. Coletto Carl Leneis Marisabel Castaneda James Tilli
[Vendor Contact Phone Number 305-232-9024 305-458-5666 305-517-3172 305-541-000 561:588-2027 305-593.1442 305-5919212 954 319-4058 954-319-4058
Vendor Contact Emall com 95car O com o com net som carloh <om el®he-builders com Blangoorg
ITEM No. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY hﬁ.ﬂm LUMP SUM LUMP SUM LUMP SUM LUMP SUM LUMP SUM LUMP SUM LUMP SUM LUMP SUM LUMP SUM
1 (GENERAL REQUIREMENTS:DSVISION 01 (SECTIONS 01005 THRU 01920] 1 LS $444 957 .25) $908933.94 $715,000.00 $757,320.54 NO BID
2 SITE WORK:DIVISION 02 WATER SYSTEM (SECTION 02660] 1 is 563,552 38| $58,195.64 $105,600.00 $70,544 50 NOBID
3 SITE WORK: DIVISION 02 SANITARY SEWER SYSTEM (SECTION 02731 1 s $104,285.81, $182663.71 $137,50000 $140,519 12 NOBID
d SITE WORK: DIVISION 02 STORM DRAINAGE SYSTEM [SECTION 02720] 1 Is 436.88] s197.72 $385,000.00 $100,488 52 NOBID
s SITE WORK:DIVISION 02 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT SECT.02511 1 1s $8,794.69) $165,201 65 $220,000.00 $159,563.04 No@iD
s SITE WORK: DIVISION 02 LANDSCAPING (SECTION 02900 1 1s s2871281 524,160.29 $17,60000 $154,786.52 NoBID
U SITE WORK: DIVISION 02 IRRIGATION SYSTEM (SECTION 02810 i Is $10,788.75] $14459.26 $2,200.00 53728937 NOBID
G SITE WORK: DIVISION 02 STEEL FENCES & GATES {SECTION 02832 1 Is $46,518.75| $113813.19 $82,500.00 $86,305.41 NOBID
2 ISITE WORK: DIV 02 CRIE CURB, GUTER, SW/ WH S10P ST 02529 1 LS $11,379.94 $0.00 $27,500.00 $43,106.63 RO BID
10 SITE WORK:-DIVISION 02 LUMP SUM REMAINING SECTIONS IN DIV 02 1 LS $153,528.49 $55,000.00 $12954 55 NOBID
1 [CONCRETE: DIVISION 03 {SECTIONS 03100 THRU 03410] 1 Ls m—nONO 453.85 $1,650,000.00 $1, 592,463.15 NO BID
12 [MASONRY: DIVISION 04 SECTION 04220 1 Ls $46,695.24 330,000.00 $113,13752 NOBID
13 [METALS: DVISION 05 (SECTIONS 05400 THRU 05590 1 13 $44,987.35 93 500.00 $26,155.85 NOBID
14 WOOD & PLASTICS: DIV 06 ARCHITECTURAL WOODWORK {SECT 06400 1 i $000 $165,000.00 $69,314.12 NOBID
15 (WOOD & PLASTICS:DIV 06 LUMP SUM REMAINING SECTIONS DIV 06 1 1S $0.00 $1,000.00 $6,168 .83 NO 8D
16 [THERMAL & MOISTURE PROTECTION:DIV 07 {SECT 07120 THRU 07900)] 1 LS $202,689.67 $38,500.00 521186131 NO BID
Y [DOORS 8 WINDOWS:DIV 08 WOOD & STEEL DRS & FRAMS 08210808110 i s $132942 50 $110,00000 $53,559.03 NOBID
1 [DOORS & WINDOWS: DIV 08 FOUR-FOLD EXTERIOR DOORS SECT 08350 A 1s $283,895.14 $302,50000 $351,593.87 NOBID
19 [DOORS & WINDOWS:DIVISION 08 ALUMINUM WINDOWS {SECTION 08520] 1 s $164,340.17 $165,000.00 $89,541.84 NO BID
L DOORS & WINDOWS:DIV 08 ALUM ENTRANCES & STOREFRONTS {08400 1 s $0.00 $55000.00 $34,32092 NOBID
zn IDOORS & WINDOWS:DIV 08 DOOR FINISHED HARDWARE (SECT 08710) 1 is 5000 $55,000:00 $91.43750 NOBID
2 IDOORS & WINDOWS: DIVISION 08 LUMP SUM REMAINING SECT DIV 08 i 1s $0.00 $1,000.00 $27,704.04 NOBID
23 FINISHES: DIVISION 09 PLASTER & STUCCO { SECT 09200) 1 is $208,292.63 $247,50000 $4841066 NO BID
28 i 1s $269,711.40 $264,000.00 $313,593.54 NOBID
25 i Ls $308,581.67 $275,000.00 $124684.69 NOBID
26 1 s $25,163.99 $49,500.00 $49,729.31 NOBID
2 1 is $44,658 38 $27,500.00 $5,866 77 NOBID
28 1 15 $19953111 $137,500.00 $86,804 10 NOBID
» SPECIALTIES: DIVISION 10 WALL LOUVERS (SECT 10200] 1 is $0.00 $16,500.00 $11,062.69 NO BID
Ed SPECIALTIES: DIVISION 10 SIGNAGE (SECT 10400] 1 is $22,144.24] $24,826.78 $11,000.00 $5,635 23 NO BID
3 SPECIALTIES: DIVISION 10 TOILET ROOM ACCESSORIES (SECT 10800 1 s _$9.546.75 $7,699.11 $6,600.00 $154,442 64 NOBID
32 SPECIALTIES: DIV 10 SHELVING & MISC EQUIPMENT {SECT 10675) 1 Is $16,796.28 $55,000.00 $43,865 76 NOBID
il KITCHEN EQUIPMENT: DIVISION 11 SECTION 11452 1 15 $68,254.16 $71,500.00 $127,565.80 NOBID
£l WINDOW TREATMENT: DIVISION 12 SECTION 12510 1 Is $4221.96 $22,000.00 $20,628.58 Noain
35 FURNITURE FIXTURES, EQUIPMENT {SUM ITEMS- SHEETS £Q01 8£Q02 1 15 $263,388.87 $1,000.00 $143,634.01 NOBID
3 [ELECTRIC TRACTION ELEVATORS DIVISION 14 SUBSECTION 14210 1 i 5158,919.56 $203,500.00 $344,961 14 NOBID
3 MECHANICAL: DIVISION 15 PLUMBING (RELATED SECTIONS DIV 15] 1 Is 5468,382.90 $550,000.00 $360,15251 HOBID
38, IMECHANICAL: DIV 15 FIRE PROTECTION (RELATED SECTIONS DIV 15| i s 568,328.80 $55,000.00 $11693278 NOBID
39 IMECHANICAL: DIV 15 HVAC [RELATED SECTIONS IN DV 15] 1 s $430,526.54 $550,00000 $567,31952 NOBID
40 MECHANICAL: DIVISION 15 (LUMP SUM OF REMAINING SECTIONS] 1 LS $0.00 $1,000.00 $12,337.67 NOBID
a ELECTRICAL: DIV 16 FIRE ALARM DETECTION SYSTM {SECT 16721} 1 T3 : $0.00 $1,000.00 $185,064 99 NOBID
42 ELECTRICAL: DIV 16 STANDBY EMERGENCY GENERATOR {SECT 16620 1 [t} $110, E $0.00 $110,000.00 $181.02791 HOEBID




ELECTRICAL:DIV 16 ABOVE GROUND FUEL STRGE TANKS {SECT 16800} 1 s $54,121.00) m_lau_ mq.SE* $14,500.00) $0.00 $55,000.00 $14,988.40 NOBID
[ELECTRICAL: DIV 16 LUMP SUM OF ALL REMAINING SECTIONS 1 s $999.332. $695,327 7 $633,303 44 $897,227.4 $732,798.86 $850,000.00 $501,029.79 NOBID
[EARTHWORK - DIVISION 31 SECTIONS 312000 AND 315000 1 s $24,984.00 .E_ $71, E $35,207.00) $154,589.60 $55,000.00 514987713 NOBID
TOTAL BASE 81D AMOUNT $8,363,997.00 $7,688,664.20 $6,264,045.58 $9812,628.27 $7,495,773.00 $7,649604.41 $8,329,500.00 $7.7%3,751.80 NO BID

[ART ACQUISION FUND (1.5% OF TOTAL BID AMOUNT) 1 is $125,460.00 $115,278.87} $93.960.70) 5147, _S.m 112,436 11474407 $125,000.00 $116.996.28 NO BID
$ 57. $7,803,343.07] $6,353,006.28] $9,959,817. $7,608,209. $7,764,348.48 $3,454,500.00 $7,916,743.08 NO BID




