

**CITY OF CORAL GABLES
FINANCE DEPARTMENT / PROCUREMENT DIVISION
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT (ADDENDUM – BID/PERFORMANCE BOND)**

Bid Number & Title:

Invitation for Bid # 2009.01.20

Old Cutler Force Main Replacement Phase III

Pre-Bid Conference

February 5, 2009, 10:00 am

(Non Mandatory)

Bid Opening Date

March 12, 2009, 2:00 pm

Procurement Division

User Department:

Public Works

Contact Person:

Julia Abraham

Contact Information

Phone: 305-460-5059

Bidder's Name	Bid Amount	Acknowledgment of Addendum/Addenda Issued (If Applicable)	Submitted Bid Bond / Performance Bond / Security Deposit (If Applicable)
Acosta Tractors, Inc.	\$813,330.92	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
R&G Engineering	\$751,490.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
JVA Engineering	\$824,755.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
Persant Construction	\$891,993.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
Master Excavators	\$745,777.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
Rock Power Paving	\$643,588.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
Solo Construction	\$648,620.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
Downrite Engineering	\$731,130.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No

Bidder's Name	Apparent Low Bid Amount
GMI Contracting	\$609,319.00

Apparent Low Bidder

Opened/Received by: M. Gomez/J. Rodriguez

Date/Time: March 12, 2009 @ 2:00 p.m.

**CITY OF CORAL GABLES
FINANCE DEPARTMENT / PROCUREMENT DIVISION
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT (ADDENDUM – BID/PERFORMANCE BOND)**

Bid Number & Title:

Invitation for Bid # 2009.01.20

Old Cutler Force Main Replacement Phase III

Pre-Bid Conference

February 5, 2009, 10:00 am

(Non Mandatory)

Bid Opening Date

March 12, 2009, 2:00 pm

Procurement Division

User Department:

Public Works

Contact Person:

Julia Abraham

Contact Information

Phone: 305-460-5059

Bidder's Name	Bid Amount	Acknowledgment of Addendum/Addenda Issued (If Applicable)	Submitted Bid Bond / Performance Bond / Security Deposit (If Applicable)
GMI Contracting	\$609,319.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
Metro Equipment	\$946,598.78	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
Tran Construction	\$782,150.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
Cisca Group	\$774,651.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
Conquest Engineering	\$645,206.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
Ram-Tech Construction	\$841,985.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
VPI	\$829,637.91	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
Solution Construction	\$806,250.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No
UniTech Builders	\$1,285,418.00	☒ Yes ☐ No	☒ Yes ☐ No

Bidder's Name	Apparent Low Bid Amount
Apparent Low Bidder	\$.

Opened/Received by: _____

Date/Time: _____

**CITY OF CORAL GABLES
FINANCE DEPARTMENT / PROCUREMENT DIVISION
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT (ADDENDUM – BID/PERFORMANCE BOND)**

Bid Number & Title:

Invitation for Bid # 2009.01.20

Old Cutler Force Main Replacement Phase III

User Department:

Public Works

Pre-Bid Conference

February 5, 2009, 10:00 am

(Non Mandatory)

Contact Person:

Julia Abraham

Bid Opening Date

March 12, 2009, 2:00 pm

Procurement Division

Contact Information

Phone: 305-460-5059

Bidder's Name	Bid Amount	Acknowledgment of Addendum/Addenda Issued (If Applicable)	Submitted Bid Bond / Performance Bond / Security Deposit (If Applicable)
Alpine Construction	No Bid (Bond)	☐ Yes ☐ No	☐ Yes ☐ No
Largo Development, Inc.	No Bid (verbal)	☐ Yes ☐ No	☐ Yes ☐ No
Miguel Lopez, Jr. Inc.	No Bid (Not Competitive)	☐ Yes ☐ No	☐ Yes ☐ No
Budget Construction Co., Inc.	No Bid (verbal)	☐ Yes ☐ No	☐ Yes ☐ No
Development & Communication Gp	No Bid (Bond)	☐ Yes ☐ No	☐ Yes ☐ No
Danella Utility Construction, Inc.	No Bid (verbal)	☐ Yes ☐ No	☐ Yes ☐ No
Wrangler Construction	No Bid (Bond)	☐ Yes ☐ No	☐ Yes ☐ No

Bidder's Name	Apparent Low Bid Amount
Apparent Low Bidder	\$.

Opened/Received by: _____ Date/Time: _____