City of Coral Gables, Florida

Bid Tabulation

ITB No.: IFB 2026-008

Bid Title:

Granada Golf Course Rain Shelter C

Bid Opening Date:

|April 21, 2026, at 2:00 PM

Prepared by: | Michael Angrand

VENDOR NAME

Vendor FEIN
Corporation Address/ Locations (County & State):

Local Preference Applicable?

Benchmark Construction Group, Inc.

Carivon Construction Company

Withdrawn Bid
Lowest Responsive and Responsible Bidder

Florida Palm Construction, Inc.

Gavarrete, Inc.

HG Construction Development & Investment,
Inc.

LEE Construction Group, Inc.

Lunacon Construction Group Corp.

Most Responsive and Responsible Bidder

PF Management & Construction

Symmetry Construction Group Corp.

331173438

650235237

472259113

591972778

33-2004655

141584840

371535403

822782164

354513333

4633 SW 11 5T
Coral Gables, FL 33134

12171 SW 131 AVE
Miami, FL 33186

3931 SW 47 AVE, Suite 101
Davie, FL 33314

4872 SW 72 AVE
Miami, FL 33155

4806 SW 74 CT
Miami, FL 33155

7715 Dixie Hwy
Miami, FL 33156

16890 South Dixie Highway.
Miami, FL 33157

7300 N Kendall Drive 2nd Floor, Suite 202
Miami, FL 33156

8028 NW 66 5T
Miami, FL 33166

Coval Gables/ Mism Dade County N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
[Vendor Contact (for this bid) Tuan Pablo Wonne Munne Watthew Ariza Tose Gavarrete Roberto M. Hernandez Lus Enriquez Emilio Criado Carfos Diez-Arguelies Tazaro Martinez
Vendor Contact Phone Number 305-208-0269 305-232-9024 754-706-7816 3054439408 7868458999 3052167558 7862930035 786 8852050 3059865811
Vendor Contact Email t s Emili m
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION QuANTITY UNIT OF MEASURE|  UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE ToTAL UNIT PRICE ToTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE ToTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE
SL1- DEMOLITION 1 Ls No Bid No Bid 2,995. $2,995.0( 2,667.0 $2,667.00 1,912, $1,912.0( $2,198.4¢ $3,500. 3,500.0( $2,822.10 $2,822.10 ,258.47 $2,258.4: $1,329.4¢ ,329.4€
SL1- FOUNDATION AND SLAB 1 Ls No Bid No Bid 7,766.00 $7,766.0¢ 4,500.0¢ $4,500.00 7,995.00 $7,995.0¢ 59,612.0¢ $5,600.00 5,600.0 $6,497.22 $6,497.22 ,534.75 $5,534.7: 52,460.0 .00
SL1-WOOD STRUCTURE 1 LS No Bid No Bid 27,170. $27,170.00 12,508.4 $12,508.45 21,114, $21,114.00 $25,556.4 14,000. $14,000.00 $77,366.64 $77,366.64 7,907.1: $27,907.13 542,84 0
SU1-ROOFING 1 is No Bid No Bid 342 342, 3,400. 53,400, ,467. $3,467. $7,200.0¢ ,300. ,300. 4,013.66 $4,013.6¢ ,027. 1,530.0
SL1- WOOD SEATING 1 Ls No Bid No Bid ,400. ,400. 2,000. $2,000. 2781 $278.0 $10,675. ,500.1 ,500. 8,596.29 $8,596.2 1,700 2,772.4:
SL1- LIGHTNING PROTECTION 1 is No Bid No Bid ,234. ,234. 4,508, 54,508. ,467. ,467. ,282. ,120, ,120. 3,136.99 $3,136.9¢ 4,734.5¢
7 SL1- SITE WORK & RESTORATION 1 is No Bid No Bid 192, 2,149, $2,149. ,907. 306, 180 1 11,288.41 $11,288.41 2,590.01
8 SL2 - DEMOLITION 1 is No Bid No Bid ,995 2,667. 52,667. 912, ,195. 500, ,500. 2,822.10 52,8221 1,329.4
9 SL2- FOUNDATION AND SLAB 1 is No Bid No Bid 766 4,500. $4,500. ,995. 612, 600 600, 6,497.72 $6,497.7. 2,460.0¢
SL2 - WOOD STRUCTURE 1 Ls No Bid No Bid 7,170.00 $: 0 512,508 512,508 00 $21,114.00 $25,556.41 $12,600.00 $12,600.00 $77,366.64 4 542,840.00 .00
SL2 - ROOFING 1 Ls No Bid No Bid ,342.( ,400. ,400. . $3,467.00 $7,200. $6,300.00 $6,300.00 $4,013.66 ,530.0(
SL2 - WOOD SEATING 1 is No Bid No Bid ,400. ,000. ,000. 00 $278.0¢ $10,675. $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $8,596.29 .29 ,772.4
SL2 - LIGHTNING PROTECTION 1 Ls No Bid No Bid ,234. 508, ,508. ,467. 6,282, $8,120.00 $8,120.00 $3,136.99 X 734,
SL2 - SITE WORK & RESTORATION 1 is No Bid No Bid 192 149, 149, ,907. 4,898 4¢ $11,200.00 $11,200.00 5$11,088.41 .41 ,004,
SL3 - DEMOLITION 1 LS No Bid No Bid ,995. ,667. $2,667. ,912.4 2,442.0 $2,100. 2,100.0( $2,822.10 $2,822.10 1,329.
SL3 - FOUNDATION AND SLAB 1 Ls No Bid No Bid ,766. ,500. $4,500. ,995.4 9,612.0 $5,600.00 5,600.0¢ $6,497.72 $6,497.72 2,46
7 SL3 - WOOD STRUCTURE 1 Ls No Bid No Bid 27,170. $: 0 12,5084/ $12,508.45 2. $21,114.00 $25,556.4 14,000. $14,000.00 $77,366.64 $77,366.64 3 542,84 0
SL3-ROOFING 1 is No Bid No Bid 342 3,400. $3,400. $3,467. $7,200.0¢ ,300. ,300. 4,013.66 $4,013.6¢ 1,530.0
SL3- WOOD SEATING 1 is No Bid No Bid 4004 2,000. $2,000. $278.0 510,675.21 ,500. ,500. 8,506.29 $8,596.2 2,772.4;
SL3 - LIGHTNING PROTECTION 1 is No Bid No Bid ,234. 4, 54,508, ,467. 56,2820 ,120. ,120. 3,136.99 $3,136.9¢ 4,734.5¢
SL3 - SITE WORK & RESTORATION 1 is No Bid No Bid 192 , $2,149. ,907. 53,6756 4004 ,400. 11,288.41 $11,288.4 3,038.01
SL4 - DEMOLITION 1 is No Bid No Bid 2,995 X 52,667. 912, 54,692.0 ,500. 3,690.44 $3,690.44 1,329.4
SL4 - FOUNDATION AND SLAB 1 Ls No Bid No Bid 1,066. $: .00 ), $6,709. ,995. $13,729. 10,500 $: 8,497.02 $8,497.0: 2,460.0(
SL4-WOOD STRUCTURE 1 s No Bid No Bid $46,195.00 4 0 $25,200.30 $25,200.30 00 $21,114.00 $51,106. $23,100.00 $23,100.00 $101,171.76 $101,171.76 542,840.00 .00
SL4- ROOFING 1 is No Bid No Bid 130, 068, 6,068, Iz $3,467.00 513,800 $6,300.00 $6,300.00 5520863 ,530.0
SL4- WOOD SEATING 1 is No Bid No Bid ,600. ,000. ,000. 00 $278.0¢ 516,464, $3,500.00 $3,500.00 51,4131 ,772.4
7 SL4- LIGHTNING PROTECTION 1 is No Bid No Bid 234 508, 508, ,467. ,282. $8,120.00 $8,120.00 54,10222 734,
SL4- SITE WORK & RESTORATION 1 Ls No Bid No Bid 2 ,149. ,149. ,907.. ,889. $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,761.77 ,600.
SL5 - DEMOLITION 1 is No Bid No Bid ,995. ,667. ,667. 912, ,254. $3,640. 3,640.01 52,8210 329
LS - FOUNDATION AND SLAB 1 Ls No Bid No Bid ,766. 500, ,500. ,995.4 612, $5,600.00 5,600.0¢ $6,497.72 46
SL5 - WOOD STRUCTURE 1 is No Bid No Bid 27,170. B 0 12,508.4 $12,508 2 $21,114.00 525,556.41 14,000. $14,000.00 $77,366.64 13 542,841 0
SLS -ROOFING 1 Ls No Bid No Bid ,342. 3,400. 3,400. $3,467. $7,200.0¢ ,300. ,300, 4,013.66 $1,530.0¢
SL5 - WOOD SEATING 1 Ls No Bid No Bid ,400. 2,000. $2,000. $278.0 $10,675. ,500.1 ,500. 8,596.29 $2,772.4
SL5 - LIGHTNING PROTECTION 1 is No Bid No Bid ,234. 4,508, 54,508, ,467. 6,282 ,120, 58,120, 3,136.99 54,7345
SL5 - SITE WORK & RESTORATION 1 is No Bid No Bid ,192. 2,149, $2,149. ,907. 121.2 800 X 11,288.41 50.00
SL6 - DEMOLITION 1 is No Bid No Bid ,995 2,667. 52,667. 912, $2,797.20 ,200. 54,200. 2,822.10 5$1,329.40 0
7 SL6 - FOUNDATION AND SLAB 1 is No Bid No Bid 7661 $ 4,500, $4,500. ,995. $9,612.00 600 ,600. 6,497.72 $2,460.00 0
SL6 - WOOD STRUCTURE 1 Ls No Bid No Bid 7,170.00 $: 0 512,508.4! $12,508 00 $21,114.00 $25,556.40 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $77,366.64 5$42,840.00 00
SL6 - ROOFING 1 Ls No Bid No Bid ,342.( ,400. ,400. . $3,467.00 $7,200. ,300. ,300. $4,013.66 $1,530.00 0
SL6 - WOOD SEATING 1 is No Bid No Bid ,400. ,000. ,000. 00 $278.0¢ $10,675. 500, ,500. $8,596.29 52,772.42 .42
SL6 - LIGHTNING PROTECTION 1 is No Bid No Bid 234 508, 508, ,467. 6,282 ,120. ,120. $3,136.99 54,734.50 .50
SL6 - SITE WORK & RESTORATION 1 is No Bid No Bid 192 149, 149, ,907. 1,683 ,200. 54,200. 511,088.41 5700.0
SL7 - DEMOLITION 1 is No Bid No Bid ,995. 667, ,667. 912, 4,363. ,920. ,920. 52,822.10 51,329
4 SL7 - FOUNDATION AND SLAB 1 LS No Bid No Bid ,766. ,500. ,500. ,995. 9,612. ,600. ,600. $6,497.72 52,46
SL7 - WOOD STRUCTURE 1 Ls No Bid No Bid 27,170. 0 12,508.4 $12,508.45 2. $21,114.00 $25,556.4 14,000. $14,000.00 $77,366.64 .13 $42,84 0
SL7-ROOFING 1 is No Bid No Bid 342 3,400. ,400. $3,467. $7,200.0¢ ,300. ,300. 4,013.66 1,530.0
7 SL7- WOOD SEATING 1 is No Bid No Bid ,400. 2,000. ,000. $278.0¢ $10,675.21 ,500. ,500. 8,506.29 2,772.4;
SL7 - LIGHTNING PROTECTION 1 is No Bid No Bid ,234. 4,508, 508, ,467. ,282.0 ,120. ,120, 3,136.99 4,734.5¢
SL7 - SITE WORK & RESTORATION 1 is No Bid No Bid 192, 2,149, 149, ,907. ,950.4 300, 3 11,288.41 $11,288.41 2,380.01
SL8 - DEMOLITION 1 is No Bid No Bid ,995 2,667. ,667. 912, ,630.4 ,500. ,500. 2,822.10 2,822.1 3,151.4¢
SL8 - FOUNDATION AND SLAB 1 is No Bid No Bid 7661 $ 4,500, ,500. ,995. 612.0 600 ,600. 6,497.72 $6,497.7; 6,400.0 $6,00.00
SL8 - WOOD STRUCTURE 1 Ls No Bid No Bid 7,170.00 $27,170.00 512,508.4! $12,508 00 $21,114.00 $25,556.41 $13,300.00 $13,300.00 $77,366.64 $77,366.64 $101,556.00 00
SL8- ROOFING 1 is No Bid No Bid 302, ,400. 400, Iz $3,467.00 §7,200.00 ,300. ,300. 54,013.66 54,013 3,627.01
SL8 - WOOD SEATING 1 is No Bid No Bid ,400. ,000. ,000. 00 $278.0¢ $10,675.21 500, ,500. $8,596.29 $8,596.29 7,212.8
SL8 - LIGHTNING PROTECTION 1 is No Bid No Bid 234, 508, 508, ,467. 56,2820 ,120. ,120, $3,136.99 $3,136. 11,223 .55
SL8 - SITE WORK & RESTORATION 1 is No Bid No Bid 192 149, 149, ,907. 52,5728 880, ,880. 5$11,088.41 $11,288.41 1,484.0
7 SL9 - DEMOLITION 1 is No Bid No Bid 995 ,995. ,667. ,667. 912 52,3796 ,100. ,100. $3,690.44 $3,690.44 3,151.4¢ X
SL9 - FOUNDATION AND SLAB 1 Ls No Bid No Bid $11,066.00 $11,066.00 ,709. ,709. ,995.4 $13,729. $11,200.00 $11,200.00 $8,497.02 $8,497.0: 6,400.0¢ 6,400.0C
SL9 - WOOD STRUCTURE 1 Ls No Bid No Bid $46,195. $46,195.00 $25,200. $25,200.30 2. $21,114.00 $51,106. $23,800. $23,800.00 $101,171.76 $101,171.76 7,907.13 $101,556.00 .00
SL9 - ROOFING 1 Ls No Bid No Bid ,130. ,130. 6,068 ,068. $3,467. 513,800 ,300. ,300. 524863 5,248.6: ,027. $3,627.0¢ $3,627.0C
SL9- WOOD SEATING 1 is No Bid No Bid 600 ,600. 4,028, ,028. $278.0 516,454, 5004 500, 11,241.31 $11,241.31 ,700. $7,212
SL9 - LIGHTNING PROTECTION 1 is No Bid No Bid ,234. ,234. 4,508, 508, S 00 $6,467.00 56,2820 ,120. ,120, 4,102.22 4,102.2: 54,678. 511,023 .55
SL9 - SITE WORK & RESTORATION 1 is No Bid No Bid ,192. $5,192. 2,149, 149 $5,907.33 $5,907.33 $3,687.6( ,0004 ,000, 14,761.77 $14,761.77 ,137. 51,540,
GENERAL CONDITIONS 1 Ls No Bid No Bid $151,487.00 $151,487.00 $88,994.34 $88,094.34 $233,517.00 $233,517.00 $71,315.6 $71,315.63 6,000. $196,000.00 $190,548.00 $190,548.00 $107,643.68 $52,427.19 .19
TOTAL BID AMOUNT: No Bid $740,004.00 $413,754.02 $657,779.97 $748,087.63 $655,900.00 $1,284,026.47 $541,841.21 $729,769.05

Assigned Procurement Personnel: Michael Angrand

Michael Angrand

Digitally signed by Michael Angrand
Date: 2026.06.24 11:45:32 -04'00"

Procurement Personnel Signature

Eduardo Hernandez

Digitally signed by Eduardo Hernandez
Date: 2026.06.24 12:21:25 -04'00"

Witness: Eduardo Hernandez



		2026-06-24T11:45:32-0400
	Michael Angrand


		2026-06-24T12:21:25-0400
	Eduardo Hernandez




