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CITY OF CORAL GABLES
FINANCE DEPARTMENT / PROCUREMENT DIVISION
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT (ADDENDUM - BID/PERFORMANCE BOND)

Bid Number & Title: : Pre-Bid Conference Bid Opening Date
Invitation for Bid # 2008.12.19 - January 15,2008, 10:00 am . February 5, 2009, 2:00 pm
Security Guard Services : : (Not Mandatory) Procurement Division
User Department: - Contact Person: Contact Information
Public Works _ Ron Van Eyk Phone: 305-460-5038
. Submitted Bid Bond /
Bidder’s Name Bid Amount | gyt enda Tisuea | Performance Bond
Hourly / Holiday (If Applicable) Security mum@ozﬂ
(If Applicable)
IS&P No Bid (Years Exp.) [ 1 Yes ] No L] Yes L] No
| KPS No Bid (Bonds) []  Yes [ ] No L]  Yes [ No
Bryant Security No Bid (Bonds) [] Yes []No [] Yes [INo
PM Security $  11.80/11.80 X Yes L] Neo X Yes [ ] No
US Security $  12.19/18.29 [] Yes X No DA Yes [ ] No
Sereca Security $  12.50/12.50 X Yes [ ] No X Yes [ 1 No
Bayus Security $  10.85/10.85 X Yes []No [] Yes - [X]No
World International $  11.00/11.00 [] Yes No X Yes [ ] No
Diamond $  13.75/20.63 X Yes No Xl Yes []No
Bidder’s Name , . Apparent Low Bid Amount
Apparent Low Bidder PM Security, Inc. $11.80/11.80

Opened/Received by: D. Benedit / J. Rodriguez Date/Time:
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FINANCE DEPARTMENT / PROCUREMENT DIVISION
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT (ADDENDUM - BID/PERFORMANCE BOND)

Bid Number & Title: Pre-Bid Conference Bid Opening Date
Invitation for Bid # 2008.12.19 mw::wq 15,2008, 10:00 am February 5§, 2009, .N"oc pm
Security Guard Services (Not Mandatory) . Procurement Division
User Department: Contact Person: Contact Information
Public Works Ron Van Eyk Phone: 305-460-5038
- Submitted Bid Bond /
Bidder’s Name Bid Amount >&mew=<\<w>¢%mwmwmm__& Performance Bond /
Hourly / Holiday (If Applicable) Security ﬁ%om:
(If Applicable)
Allied $13.02/19.53 X Yes []No X Yes [ ]No
Andy Frain . $11.49/19.04 X  Yes [ ] No X Yes [ ] No
ISNG Security $11.85/17.78 XI Yes []No X Yes [ ]No
CSS Security $12.33/12.33 X Yes [No X Yes [ ]No
SMI Security No Bid [] Yes [ No [J Yes [ No
| American Guard Services $13.42/18.79 D{  Yes _H_ No g Yes [ ] No
Buffalo Security Company - $13.68 / 20.52 ¥ Yes [] No [1 Yes X No
Dothan Security $14.99 /21.39 X Yes [ ] No I Yes [ ] No
Kent Security $13.50 / 20.25 X Yes [ ] No X Yes [ ] No
Bidder’s Name . Apparent Low Bid Amount
Apparent Low Bidder g

Opened/Received by: D. Benedit / J. Rodriguez Date/Time:




