DISASTER DEBRIS MANAGEMENT SERVICES PRICE SHEET (TIME & MATERIALS)

ATL
CROWDER (No Bid Bond) D&J ENT. SRS DRC CERES BERGERON JB COXWELL PHILLIPS & JORDAN ASHBRITT
Heavy Equipment [ Size or Type [ um Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included

Skid Steer Loader Bobcat Hour | $ 80.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 7150 | $ 90.00 | $ 83.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 88.00 | $ 69.50
Backhoe Cat 416 Hour | $ 75.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 122.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 7200 | $ 108.00 | $ 72.50
Wheel Loaders Cat 950 Hour | $ 130.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 132.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 120.00
Wheel Loaders Cat 966 Hour | $ 135.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 134.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 140.00
Wheel Loaders Cat 980 Hour | $ 150.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 156.00 | $ 145.00 | $ 145.00 | $ 145.00 | $ 160.00
Tracked Loader Cat 955 Hour | $ 135.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 132.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 144.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 135.00
Towed Loader w/ Tractor Prentice 210 Hour | $ 130.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 8250 | $ 130.00 | $ 161.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 140.00
Self Loading Knuckle boom Truck 25-35 CY Body Hour | $ 150.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 13750 | $ 159.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 142.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 135.00
Self Loading Knuckle boom Truck 35-45 CY Body Hour | $ 160.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 170.50 | $ 175.00 | $ 161.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 148.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 155.00
Dozer Cat D4 Hour | $ 90.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 99.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 121.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 95.00
Dozer Cat D5 Hour | $ 120.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 11550 | $ 140.00 | $ 134.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 115.00 | $ 105.00
Dozer Cat D6 Hour | $ 150.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 11550 | $ 160.00 | $ 159.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 103.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 120.00
Dozer Cat D7 Hour | $ 175.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 126.50 | $ 195.00 | $ 195.00 | $ 155.00 | $ 118.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 145.00
Dozer Cat D8 Hour | $ 200.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 185.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 226.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 170.00
Excavators Cat 320 Hour | $ 130.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 112.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 115.00
Excavators Cat 325 Hour | $ 150.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 195.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 137.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 138.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 130.00
Excavators Cat 330 Hour | $ 180.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 159.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 148.00 | $ 145.00 | $ 150.00
Tractor w/ Box Blade 80 Hp Hour | $ 60.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 98.00 | $ 77.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 50.00
Motor Grader Cat 120G Hour | $ 120.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 132.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 149.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 120.00
Crane 30 Ton Hour | $ 185.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 154.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 201.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 195.00
Bucket Truck Up to 50' reach Hour | $ 150.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 13750 | $ 175.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 162.00 | $ 135.00
Bucket Truck 50' to 75' reach Hour | $ 185.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 154.00 | $ 240.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 145.00 | $ 182.00 | $ 150.00
Trash Transfer Trailer w/ Tractor 110 Yard Hour | $ 130.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 159.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 82.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 125.00
Mechanized Broom Street Sweeper Hour | $ 90.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 295.00 [ $ 77.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 92.00 | $ 75.00
Water Truck 2000 Gallon Hour | $ 80.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 83.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 88.00 | $ 85.00
Stump Grinder Vermeer 252 Hour | $ 95.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 79.00 | $ 295.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 85.00
Chipper w/ 2 man crew Morbark Storm Hour | $ 110.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 195.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 134.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 115.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 125.00
12-Foot Tub Grinder Morbark 1200 Hour | $ 475.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 575.00 | $ 340.00 | $ 510.00 | $ 506.00 | $ 475.00 | $ 640.00 | $ 590.00 | $ 350.00
13-Foot Tub Grinder Morbark 1300 Hour | $ 550.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 340.00 | $ 575.00 | $ 592.00 | $ 525.00 | $ 660.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 405.00
14-Foot Tub Grinder Diamond Z 1463 Hour | $ 625.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 435.00 | $ 725.00 | $ 720.00 [ $ 600.00 | $ 690.00 | $ 760.00 | $ 460.00

Heavy Equipment Size or Type U/M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Equipment Transport w/ Tractor 50 Ton Hour | $ 110.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 128.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 120.00
Truck Mounted Winch Tow Truck Hour | $ 75.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 134.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 90.00

Haul Vehicles Size or Type U/M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included Operators Included

Dump Truck 10to 15 CY Hour | $ 65.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 73.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 50.00
Dump Truck 16t0 20 CY Hour | $ 75.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 88.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 65.00
Trailer Dump w/ Tractor 30t0 40 CY Hour | $ 100.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 145.00 | $ 104.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 72.00 | $ 89.00 | $ 80.00
Trailer Dump w/ Tractor 41t050 CY Hour | $ 110.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 122.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 76.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 85.00
Trailer Dump w/ Tractor 51to 60 CY Hour | $ 120.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 134.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 95.00
Trailer Dump w/ Tractor 61t0 70 CY Hour | $ 130.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 145.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 155.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 105.00
Walking Floor Trailer w/ Tractor 100 CY Hour | $ 140.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 195.00 | $ 144.00 - $ 88.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 125.00

Transportation Vehicles Size or Type U/M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Operators Not Included | Operators Not Included | Operators Not Included | Operators Not Included | Operators Not Included | Operators Not Included | Operators Not Included | Operators Not Included | Operators Not Included | Operators Not Included
Pickup Truck 1/2 Ton Day |$ 35.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 60.00
Pickup Truck 3/4 Ton Day |$ 40.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 195.00 | $ 220.00 [ $ 80.00 | $ 128.00 | $ 200.00 [ $ 70.00
Pickup Truck 1Ton Day |$ 45.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 244.00 | $ 112.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 85.00
Box Truck 3/4 Ton Day |$ 65.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 325.00 | $ 129.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 384.00 | $ 195.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 95.00
Utility Van 3/4 Ton Day |$ 65.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 325.00 | $ 129.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 220.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 70.00
Passenger Van 9 Passenger Day |$ 40.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 325.00 [ $ 48.00 | $ 195.00 | $ 212.00 | $ 155.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 300.00 [ $ 65.00
Passenger Car Full size Day |$ 35.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 250.00 [ $ 48.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 132.00 - $ 40.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 47.50

Personnel Size or Type U/M Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Superintendent w/ Pickup Truck Individual Hour | $ 65.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 70.00
Supervisor w/ Pickup Truck Individual Hour | $ 55.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 65.00
Safety or QC Manager w/ Pickup Truck Individual Hour | $ 65.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 79.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 65.00
Mechanic w/ Truck and Tools Individual Hour | $ 75.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 73.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 75.00
Climber w/ Gear Individual Hour | $ 105.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 102.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 68.00 | $ 85.00
Operator w/ Chainsaw Individual Hour | $ 50.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 35.00
Laborer w/ Tools Individual Hour | $ 36.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 37.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 32.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 30.00
Traffic Control Personnel Individual Hour | $ 36.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 37.00 | $ 37.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 28.50
Ticket Writers Individual Hour | $ 40.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 37.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 30.00
Clerical Individual Hour | $ 40.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 34.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 34.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 35.00
Administrative Assistant Individual Hour | $ 55.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 34.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 30.00
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DISASTER DEBRIS MANAGEMENT SERVICES PRICE SHEET

ATL PHILLIPS &
VENDOR NAME... CROWDER (No bid Bond) D&J ENT. SRS DRC CERES BERGERON JB COXWELL JORDAN ASHBRITT
DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES: ALL SERVICES ARE AS
DIRECTED BY THE CITY AS TO THE LOCATION OF WORK
AREA, DISASTER ASSISTANCE FUNDINGAND AS OTHERWISE
SPECIFIEDIN THE RFP DOCUMENT UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
COMPONENT SERVICES
Mobilization and demobilizatior [(lump sum) Included No Charge $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 No Charge No Cost No Charge No Charge
Collect Vegetative Debris from public or private property and transport toDMS or final disposal
location. Screening for Animal Carcasses, HW and HHW, Infectious Waste and CBRN Waste shall be
performed during the collection process. *
(0-15 miles) Cubic Yard $ 9.16| $ 9.00] $ 725 $ 12.95| $ 782 $ 11.99| $ 12.75| $ 12.40| $ 10.50] $ 10.25
(15 — 30 miles) Cubic Yard $ 9.76 | $ 11.50| $ 7.75] $ 14.95| $ 8.86]| $ 11.99| $ 15.75| $ 14.25| $ 11.00| $ 11.00
(>30 miles) Per Mile over 30 Miles, per cubic| $ 0.04| $ 0.50| $ 8.50| $ 0.07| $ 0.36| $ 0.08| $ 2275 $ 0.08 $0.14 $ 0.20
Collect Construction and Demolition Debris (C&D) (including white go\&ajrsdnot requiring Freon removal) oermile
from public or private property and transport to DMS or final disposal location. Screening for Animal
Carcasses, HW and HHW, Infectious Waste and CBRN Waste shall be performed during the collection
process. *
0-15 miles Cubic Yard $ 10.16| $ 10.00] $ 725 $ 14.95| $ 8.24| $ 11.99| $ 2250 $ 14.00| $ 11.50| $ 10.25
15-30 miles Cubic Yard $ 10.76]| $ 12.50| $ 7.75] $ 16.95| $ 9.24| $ 11.99| $ 2250| $ 14.25| $ 12.00| $ 11.00
>30 miles Per Mile over 30 Miles, per cubic| $ 0.04| $ 075 $ 850| $ 014 $ 038 $ 0.08| $ 3250| $ 0.07 $0.14 $ 0.20
§ ] ] _lvard per mile
Management of DMS and Processing (Reduction) of Vegetative Debris|cubic Yard
(including stumps). $ 227| % 5.00] $ 325| % 295| $ 345 $ 499 $ 10.00| $ 270| $ 4.00]| $ 4.00
Management of DMS and Processing (reduction, separation, recycling|cypic Yard
etc.) of Construction and Demolition Debris (C&D) (including white|
goods not requiring Freon removal). $ 227| $ 550| $ 3.75| $ 495]| $ 3.86| $ 499]| $ 2150| $ 410| $ 5.00]| $ 4.00
Haul-Out of Reduced or Unreduced Debris from DMS to Final Disposal Site. *
(0-15 miles) Cubic Yard $ 0.76 | $ 5.00] $ 6.00] $ 7.95| $ 3.68| $ 3.99| $ 10.75| $ 6.25| $ 4.00] $ 4.25
(15 - 30 miles) Cubic Yard $ 0.94| $ 6.00] $ 7.00] $ 9.95| $ 4.86]| $ 499 $ 13.75| $ 6.50]| $ 5.00] $ 5.75
Per Mile over 30 Miles, per cubic] $0.03
(>30 miles) yard $ 0.04]| $ 0.25| $ 9.00] $ 0.14]| $ 0.34]| $ 0.08] $ 20.75| $ 0.05| percy/per mile | $ 0.12
Disposal at Contractor’s Final Disposal Site *
Vegetative Debris (reduced Cubic Yard $ 1897 $ 4.00] $ 6.00] $ 12.95| $ 0.55] $ 15.99| $ 1275] $ 6.00| Contractor will payall | ¢ 10.00
Vegetative Debris (un-reduced Cubic Yard $ 10.00] $ 12.00] $ 8.00| $ 14.95] § 2.00| $ 21.99] $ 22.75] $ 7.70| tipping/disposal fees at " 12.00
Processed construction and Demolition (C&D) (including white goods not final disposal site. City
requiring or already processed for Freon removal Cubic Yard $ 17.00| $ 13.00| $ 8.00| $ 7.95| $ 4.68| $ 27.99| $ 28.00| $ 8.10 Vgl'é?{"%g;g;gg:i‘;:ﬁr $ 18.75
Unprocessed Construction and Demolition (C&D) (including white goods| provide ‘documentation of
not requiring or already processed for Freon removal Cubic Yard 17.00 14.00 8.50 18.95 4.92 16.99 21.00 8.50 | all tipping/disposal fees 18.75
Animal Carcasses Carcass 9.85 50.00 300.00 25.00 75.00 47.99 1,200.00 109.00|  for reimbursement. 115.00
White Goods Freon processing Piece 38.00 50.00 100.00 45.00 75.00 59.99 65.00 45.00| $ 40.00 65.00
Hazardous Stump Extraction and Transportation to a DMS. Screening for Animal Carcasses, HW and *
AS PET VEJETAlVE AS PET VEJETAvVEe AS PET VEJETAlVE AS PET VEJETAlVE AS PET VEJETAlVE AS PET VEJETAlVE AS PET VEJETAlVE AS PET VEJETAlVE AS PET VEJETAlVE AS PET VEJETAlVE |
Debris cubic yard rate| Debris cubic yard rate| Debris cubic yard rate| Debris cubic yard rate| Debris cubic yard rate| Debris cubic yard rate| Debris cubic yard rate| Debris cubic yard rate| Debris cubic yard rate| Debris cubic yard rate
< 24” (Treated as Normal Vegetative Debris, no per tree removal cos —no extra charge for | — no extra charge for | — no extra charge for | — no extra charge for | — no extra charge for | — no extra charge for | — no extra charge for | — no extra charge for | — no extra charge for | — no extra charge for
is applicable Not applicable this item. this item. this item. this item. this item. this item. this item. this item. this item. this item.
24"- 36" Per Stump 198.00 550.00 200.00 150.00 175.00 199.99 500.00 260.00 375.00 125.00
36" —48” Per Stump 210.00 650.00 400.00 250.00 325.00 304.99 600.00 400.00 495.00 175.00
48" —72” Per Stump 336.00 749.00 600.00 450.00 450.00 641.99 700.00 560.00 695.00 305.00
72" + Per Stump 485.00 1,000.00 1,100.00 1,000.00 625.00 932.99 900.00 810.00 900.00 425.00
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DISASTER DEBRIS MANAGEMENT SERVICES PRICE SHEET

VENDOR NAME... CROWDER ATL D&J ENT. SRS DRC CERES BERGERON JB COXWELL FAILLIPS &2 ASHBRITT
(No bid Bond) JORDAN

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES: ALL SERVICES ARE AS

DIRECTED BY THE CITY AS TO THE LOCATION OF WORK

AREA, DISASTER ASSISTANCE FUNDINGAND AS OTHERWISE

SPECIFIEDIN THE RFP DOCUMENT UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

Hazardous Stump Extraction and Transportation to a final disposal location in Miami-Dade County,

Florida, which shall be specified by the City. Tipping fee shall be a dir

ect pass through expense to the

City. Screening for Animal Carcasses, HW and HHW, Infectious Waste and CBRN Waste shall be

performed durina the collection process.

*

< 24” (Treated as Normal Vegetative Debris, no per tree removal cos

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate —
no extra charge for this

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate —
no extra charge for this

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate —
no extra charge for this

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate —
no extra charge for this

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate —
no extra charge for this

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate —
no extra charge for this

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate —
no extra charge for this

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate —
no extra charge for this

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate —
no extra charge for this

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate —
no extra charge for this

is applicable Not applicable item. item item. item. item. item. item. item. item. item.
24”- 36" Per Stump 198.00 687.00 200.00 150.00 175.00 182.99 600.00 230.00 375.00 125.00
36" — 48" Per Stump 210.00 812.00 400.00 250.00 325.00 280.99 700.00 360.00 495.00 175.00
48" -72” Per Stump 336.00 936.00 600.00 450.00 450.00 585.99 800.00 530.00 695.00 305.00
72" + Per Stump 485.00 1,250.00 1,100.00 1,000.00 625.00 853.99 800.00 780.00 900.00 425.00
Stump hole filling (process and material.) Cubic Yard of Fill 3.00 18.00 14.50 15.99 18.00 14.00
Hanging Tree Limb Removal (2” or greater in diameter Per Tree 44.00| $ 128.00 75.00] $ 97.00 72.00 70.99 175.00] $ 45.00| $ 100.00 145.00

Remove Hazardous Trees with attached stumps if root balls are exposed more than 50%. All debris is to

then be considered as normal debris. Screening for Animal Carcasses
and CBRN Waste shall be performed during the removal process.

, HW and HHW, Infectious Waste

*

0” - 12” diameter (no per tree removal cost is applicable. Treat the Debris|
as normal Vegetative Debris

Not applicable

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

13” to 24” diametet Per Tree 45.00 450.00 125.00 75.00 100.00 158.99 650.00 130.00 550.00 95.00
25” to 48” diameter Per Tree 210.00 650.00 300.00 150.00 250.00 243.99 800.00 280.00 750.00 185.00
49” to 72” diametetr Per Tree 385.00 850.00 800.00 300.00 350.00 507.99 1,000.00 410.00 875.00 325.00
> 72" diameter Per Tree 610.00 1,050.00 1,500.00 600.00 450.00 744.99 1,400.00 690.00 1,175.00 450.00

Flush cut Hazardous Trees with root balls exposed less than 50%. All

debris is to then be considered as

*

0” - 12” diameter (no per tree removal cost is applicable. Treat the Debris|
as normal Vegetative Debris

Not applicable

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

As Per Vegetative
Debris cubic yard rate

13" to 24” diameter Per Tree 45.00 400.00 75.00 75.00 100.00 141.99 150.00 90.00 475.00 85.00
25” to 48” diameter Per Tree 199.00 600.00 100.00 150.00 250.00 250.99 250.00 200.00 650.00 165.00
49” to 72” diameter Per Tree 326.00 800.00 175.00 300.00 350.00 438.99 350.00 305.00 775.00 295.00
> 72" diameter Per Tree 453.00 1,000.00 225.00 600.00 450.00 677.99 500.00 460.00 1,075.00 400.00
Demolition of Structures. Screening for Animal Carcasses, HW and
HHW, Infectious Waste and CBRN Waste shall be performed during
the collection process. Square Foot of structure $ 133| $ 3.00 $ 8.00| $ 225 $ 324\ $ 399 $ 8.00| $ 3.10 $ 2.75
$2.00
Animal Carcass Removal and Disposal Carcass $ 9.85| $ 250.00| $ 300.00| $ 50.00| $ 75.00| $ 47.99| $ 1,200.00| $ 17.00 per Ib $ 110.00
Hazardous Waste and Household Hazardous Waste Collection, Clean $64.00
up and Disposal Per 5 gallon $ 19.56| $ 600.00| $ 35.00| $ 25.00| $ 88.00| $ 78.99 See Schedule $ 95.00 Note 1 $ 695.00
$2,250.00
Per Cubic Yard $ 109.00| $ 15.00| $ 50.00| $ 78.00| $ 250.00| $ 119.99 See Schedule $ 27.00 Note 1 $ 185.00
$100.00
Infectious Waste Clean-up and Disposal Per 5 gallon $ 86.40| $ 520.00| $ 55.00| $ 25.00| $ 175.00| $ 81.99 See Schedule $ 230.00 Note 1 $ 795.00
$3,800.00
Per Cubic Yard $ 219.10| $ 13.00( $ 70.00| $ 78.00| $ 455.00| $ 238.99 See Schedule $ 1,400.00 Note 1 $ 185.00
No Bid
CBRN Waste Clean-up and Disposal Per 5 gallon $ 439.00| $ 640.00| $ 55.00| $ 25.00| $ 3,500.00| $ 81.99 See Schedule to be noegotiated Note 1 $ 995.00
No Bid
Per Cubic Yard $ 1,153.00| $ 16.00] $ 70.00] $ 78.00| $ 10,000.00| $ 238.99 See Schedule to be noegotiated Note 1 $ 195.00
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DISASTER DEBRIS MANAGEMENT SERVICES PRICE SHEET

VENDOR NAME...

CROWDER

ATL

(No bid Bond) D&J ENT. SRS

DRC

CERES

BERGERON

JB COXWELL

PHILLIPS &
JORDAN

ASHBRITT

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES.] ALL SERVICES ARE AS
DIRECTED BY THE CITY AS TO THE LOCATION OF WORK
AREA, DISASTER ASSISTANCE FUNDINGAND AS OTHERWISE

SPECIFIEDIN THE RFP DOCUMENT

UNIT OF MEASURE

UNIT COST

UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

CONSOLIDATED ALL INCLUSIVE SERVICES

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICE

UNIT OF MEASURE

UNIT COST

UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

Consolidated Service # 1 - As directed by the City as to location of work area, disaster assistance funding

and as otherwise specified in the RFP document:

*

TTIE CUIMdCtour Srialr CONMETT arma 1riaar VEHE\QI.IV( UCUTTS  arma ATTITTdar
Carcasses to DMS, reduce or otherwise process debris, haul debris to final
disposal and dispose of debris in the Contractors final disposal location.
Screening for HW and HHW, Infectious Waste and CBRN Waste shall be|

performed during the collection process
The Contractor snhall extract and provide any Necessary extraordinary

transport for all hazardous uprooted stumps inclusive of stump hole filling.

(Inclusive of debris removal as described herein.)
The Contractor shall remove all hanging tree Mbs (2~ or greater n

diameter) from trees. Inclusive of debris removal as described herein.
(Inclusive of debris removal as described herein..

The Contractor shall remove all Nazardous trees. Stumps With root balls
exposed more than 50% as associated with these hazardous trees shall also
be removed. (Inclusive of debris removal as described herein
TrororoToT T T T T O ST T Toe SR pOTToTS

TTCTOOTITY oo

not limited to, contract administration, technical assistance to the City,
personnel training and certification, (DMS) management, services for
security, safety and traffic management, and associated actions necessary|
for implementation of debris management operations by the Contractor as

Per Cubic Yard of debris generated
from all delineated activities and

delivered to the DMS.

$ 24.25| $

24.00| $ 18.50| $ 2750 $

17.88

39.99

205.00

43.40

$22.00
Note 1 & 2

25.00

defined in the a%reement.
N COTTETT]

and haul all C&D debris and all white goods (including Freon processing),
to DMS, process debris, haul debris to final disposal and dispose of debris
in the Contractors final disposal location.

Per Cubic Yard of debris generated
from all delineated activities and
delivered to the DMS.

$ 30.25| $

27.00| $ 20.50| $ 2750 $

18.88

50.99

86.00

39.10

$24.50
Note 1 & 2

25.00

ASd CUMMPUTTETTT UT  CUNRSUMUAIEU SETVICE # L, U1 CUTTIaCtuT SITalT disu
provide debris processing, (DMS) management, debris reduction, and
debris haul out and disposal for vegetative debris, C&D debris, all white|
goods (including Freon processing) and Animal Carcasses delivered to the

DMS by the City or other City authorized sources.

Per Cubic Yard of debris generated
from all delineated activities and
delivered to the DMS.

$ 48.00| $

24.00] $ 20.50| $ 3750 $

8.24

43.99

95.00

14.00

$27.50
Note 1 & 2

9.50

Prepared on June 13, 2008
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DISASTER DEBRIS MANAGEMENT SERVICES PRICE SHEET

VENDOR NAME...

CROWDER

ATL

(No bid Bond)

D&J ENT.

SRS

DRC

CERES

BERGERON

JB COXWELL

PHILLIPS &
JORDAN

ASHBRITT

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES.] ALL SERVICES ARE AS
DIRECTED BY THE CITY AS TO THE LOCATION OF WORK
AREA, DISASTER ASSISTANCE FUNDINGAND AS OTHERWISE
SPECIFIEDIN THE RFP DOCUMENT

UNIT OF MEASURE

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

Consolidated service # 2 - As directed by the City as to location of wor
and as otherwise specified in the RFP. document:

area, disaster assistance funding

*

The Contractor shall collect and haul vegetative debris, C&D debris, animg
carcasses and all white goods (including Freon processing), and Animal
Carcasses directly to a final disposal location in Miami-Dade County,
Florida, which shall be specified by the City. Tipping fee shall be a direct|
pass through expense to the City. Screening for HW and HHW, Infectious|
Waste and CBRN Waste shall be performed during the collection ;%rocess.
The Contractor shall extract and provide extraordinary transport for al
hazardous uprooted stumps inclusive of stump hole filling. Inclusive of
debris removal as described herein.

The Contractor shall remove all hanging tree Timbs (27 or greater in
diameter) from trees. Inclusive of debris removal as described hereil

The Contractor shall Temove all Nazardous trees. Stumps With root balls
exposed more than 50% as associated with these hazardous trees shall also
be removed. Inclusive of debris removal as described hereil

TTTE CUTMIatTUT S SETVITE STTAlIT MTCTUUT aIT TETAEU TAPETISES MUTUUTY, Ut
not limited to, contract administration, technical assistance to the City,
personnel training and certification, safety and traffic management, and
associated actions necessary for implementation of debris management
operations by the Contractor as defined in the agreement.

Per Cubic Yard of debris generated
from all delineated activities and
delivered to the final disposal site.

$ 15.25

18.00

18.50

27.50

14.88

16.99

155.00

24.40

$ 17.50

16.00

Consolidated service # 3a - As directed by the City as to location of work area, disaster assistance funding

and as otherwise specified in the RFP document:

The Contractor shall collect and haul all C&D debris, animal carcasses and
all white goods (including Freon processing) to DMS, process debris, haul
debris to final disposal and dispose of debris in the Contractors final

disposal location.

Per Cubic Yard of debris generated
from all delineated activities and
delivered to the DMS.

$ 31.25

27.50

22.50

37.50

18.88

50.99

205.00

24.00

$10.50
Contractor will pay all
tipping/disposal fees
at final disposal sites.
City will reimbuse
contractor at cost.
Contractor will
provide
documentation of all
tipping/disposal fees

20.50

Prepared on June 13, 2008
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DISASTER DEBRIS MANAGEMENT SERVICES PRICE SHEET

VENDOR NAME...

CROWDER

ATL

(No bid Bond)

D&J ENT.

SRS

DRC

CERES

BERGERON

JB COXWELL

PHILLIPS &
JORDAN

ASHBRITT

DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES.] ALL SERVICES ARE AS
DIRECTED BY THE CITY AS TO THE LOCATION OF WORK
AREA, DISASTER ASSISTANCE FUNDINGAND AS OTHERWISE
SPECIFIEDIN THE RFP DOCUMENT

UNIT OF MEASURE

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

UNIT COST

Consolidated service # 3b - As directed by the City as to location of work area, disaster assistance

funding and as otherwise specified in the RFP document:

*

The Contractor shall collect and haul all C&D debris, animal carcasses and
all white goods (including Freon processing) to a final disposal location in
Miami-Dade County, Florida, which shall be specified by the City.
Tipping fee shall be a direct pass through expense to the City. Screening|
for HW and HHW, Infectious Waste and CBRN Waste shall be performed|
during the collection process.

Per Cubic Yard of debris generated
from all delineated activities and
delivered to the final disposal site.

16.25

21.00

21.50

37.50

14.88

15.99

75.00

24.00

$16.50
Contractor will pay all
tipping/disposal fees
at final disposal sites.
City will reimbuse
contractor at cost.
Contractor will
provide
documentation of all
tipping/disposal fees

13.00

Consolidated service # 4 - As directed by the City as to location of work area, disaster assistance funding

and as otherwise specified in the RFP document:

The Contractor shall collect and haul vegetativedebris (including stumps),
and Animal Carcasses to DMS, reduce or otherwise process debris, haul
debris to final disposal and dispose of debris in the Contractors final
disposal location.  Screening for HW and HHW, Infectious Waste and
CBRN waste shall be performed during the collection process

TTCTOOTITY oo

not limited to, contract administration, technical assistance to the City,
personnel training and certification, (DMS) management, services for
security, safety and traffic management, and associated actions necessary|
for implementation of debris management operations by the Contractor as
defined in the agreement.

Per Cubic Yard of debris generated
from all delineated activities and
delivered to the DMS.

15.25

23.00

$

20.50

NO BID

15.88

39.99

205.00

36.10

$16.50
Seenote 1 &2

20.50

ADDITIONAL SERVICES

ASHI) Abandoned Venicle Removal and disposal (from land)
(including towing and processing). Screening for Animal Carcasses
HW and HHW, Infectious Waste and CBRN Waste shall be
performed during the collection process.

Vehicle

110.00

200.00

750.00

NO BID

495.00

487.00

475.00

220.00

$ 800.00

$

275.00

AS#Z) Abandoned Venicle Removal and aisposal (Ifom Water)
(including towing and processing). Screening for Animal Carcasses
HW and HHW, Infectious Waste and CBRN Waste shall be
performed during the collection process.

Vehicle

350.00

1

,500.00

1,500.00

NO BID

1,450.00

523.00

675.00

370.00

$ 1,400.00

375.00

AS#3) Debris removal from canals. Screening for Animal Carcasses
HW and HHW, Infectious Waste and CBRN Waste shall be
nerformed durina the collection nracess

Cost per cubic yard

@ |

85.00

50.00

25.00

NO BID

@ |

58.88

43.00

@ |

45.00

@ |

14.00

$ 285.00

38.50

AS#4) Boat removal, processing and disposal from Tand. Screening
for Animal Carcasses HW and HHW, Infectious Waste and CBRN
Waste shall be performed during the collection process.

Cost per lineal foot

34.20

200.00

150.00

NO BID

125.00

17.00

75.00

31.00

$ 260.00

See schedule 2b

AS#S) Boat removal, processing and disposal from water. Screening
for Animal Carcasses HW and HHW, Infectious Waste and CBRN

Waste shall be performed during the collection process.

Cost per lineal foot

85.00

210.00

$

300.00

NO BID

250.00

23.00

175.00

39.33

$ 300.00

See schedule 2b

Prepared on June 13, 2008
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DISASTER DEBRIS MANAGEMENT SERVICES PRICE SHEET

Prepared on June 13, 2008

VENDOR NAME... CROWDER ATL D&J ENT. SRS DRC CERES BERGERON JB COXWELL FAILLIPS &2 ASHBRITT
(No bid Bond) JORDAN
DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES: ALL SERVICES ARE AS
DIRECTED BY THE CITY AS TO THE LOCATION OF WORK
AREA, DISASTER ASSISTANCE FUNDINGAND AS OTHERWISE
SPECIFIEDIN THE RFP DOCUMENT UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
The following additional services shall be made part of a contract separate from the stand alone debris *
|related services contract:
ASH#6) Fire Suppression Support. Per Vehicle $60.00 $ 1,500.00| $ 500.00 NO BID $ 4,500.00( $ 156.00| $ 95.00| $ 17.00 $3,800.00 850.00
per dav per veh/week
AS#7) Emergency potable water Cost per gallon $ 1.00] $ 2.00| $ 4.00 NO BID $ 148| $ 4.00| $ 0771 $ 136| $ 2.25 See schedule A
AS#8) Emergency delivery of ice. Per Pound $ 0.25| $ 0.60| $ 2.50 NO BID $ 024 $ 1.00] $ 0.55| $ 0.38] $ 0.92| See Schedule A
AS#9) Temporary bathrooms, showers, kitchens and feeding locations.|50 person unit for one day $ 6,700.00( $ 5,000.00( $ 1,500.00 NO BID $9,500.00 $ 15,900.00| $ 2,500.00( $ 2,490.00 See Schedule B
see note # 1
100 person unit for one day $ 10,000.00| $ 300.00 NO BID $19,500.00 $ 17,900.00| $ 5,000.00( $ 4,290.00 See Schedule B
see note # 1
AS#10) Temporary satellite communications. Per Phone/day $ 8.00| $ 500.00( $ 500.00 NO BID $68.00 $ 39.00| $ 275.00 see price sheet | $ 185.00| See Schedule E
see note #2 attached
AS#11a) Provide labor and machinery for pumping and water Per pump/hour $ 60.00| $ 100.00| $ 500.00 NO BID $ 195.00| $ 137.00| $ 150.00| $ 86.10| $ 225.00( See Schedule G
relocation/removal for flood control. Pump capacity of 110 gallons
ner minute with a 4" discharae
AS#11b) Hose for pump operation. Per 100 foot of hose. $8.00 $ 25.00( $ 200.00 NO BID $10.00 $305.00 $ 50.00| $ 18.00 $39.00 See Schedule G
per dav per hour per dav per dav
AS#12) Sewer, culvert and catch basin cleaning. Per structure $ 500.00| $ 250.00| $ 1,000.00 NO BID $ 375.00| $ 340.00| $ 175.00| $ 130.00| $ 650.00| Incident Specific
AS#13) Decontamination of buildings and facilities. Per square foot of affected facility | $ 311 % 1.00] $ 25.00 NO BID $ 4.46| $ 29.00| $ 5.00| $ 3.10| $ 2.00 See Schdule H
AS#14) Mold remediation. Per square foot of affected facility | $ 4.28] $ 1.001 $ 25.00 NO BID $ 2.68| $ 29.00( $ 5.00] $ 5.80| $ 38.00[ See Schedule H
Note 1: Assumes 30 * Tipping Fee will be Note 1: Debris will
days minimum on al;))passgthrough. be place on ROW for
temporary bathroom, Handling fee, use Haul Off.Loader See attachgd
kitchens and feeding hourly rate. Labor col!ectlon O.f . shedule pricing
locations Rates, see schedule. vegetetl\i/t(;zebns bid
Npte 2 $l.§6 per Note 2: Owner to
minute air time for .
satellite phones provide DMS.
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DISASTER DEBRIS MANAGEMENT SERVICES PRICE SHEET

. ATL PHILLIPS &
AS#15) Emergency power generation. CROWDER (No bid Bond) D&J ENT. SRS DRC CERES BERGERON JB COXWELL JORDAN ASHBRITT
Amps at different available 3 ph, 4 UNIT OF
wire voltages MEASURE UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
KW KVA Fuel |ountime |120/240v |120/208v  |277/480v | Per Generator $ 1,475.00
Capacity
100 125 196 gal |26 hrs  |301 Amps(347 Amps (150 Amps| Per Generator | $ 736.00 | $ 1,680.00 | $ 5,000.00 NO BID $ 160.00 | $ 1,890.00 | $ 2,182.00 | $ 610.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 1,680.00
175 219 350 gal |28 hrs 527Amps |608 Amps |264 Amps| Per Generator | $ 966.00 | $ 2,305.80 | $ 6,000.00 NO BID $ 225.00 [ $ 2,654.00 | $ 3,108.00 | $ 1,290.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 2,305.80
240 300 379 gal |23 hrs 723 Amps|834 Amps |361 Amps| Per Generator | $ 1,080.00 | $ 2,857.19 | $ 8,000.00 NO BID $ 450.00 | $ 3,293.00 | $ 4,875.00 | $ 1,710.00 | $ 4,800.00 | $ 2,857.19
320 400 479 gal |23hrs  [963 Amps|1112 Amps [482 Amps| Per Generator | $ 1,440.00 [ $ 3,190.95 | $ 10,000.00 NO BID $ 675.00 | $ 3,659.00 | $ 5,290.00 | $ 2,310.00 | $ 6,400.00 | $ 3,190.95
all prices above all prices above all prices above all prices above all prices above all prices above all prices above all prices above
per day per day rental per hour per day per week per day per week per 24 hours
Prepared on June 13, 2008 Page 7 of 7



